L A
(illlll“l!lllllllmllIIIIIIIIHIHIII

BUDGET RESOLUTIONS 1983

| -
g
2
| -
™~
X1
(e |
™~
il
t.i.)

- PO




BUDGE i-SECRET

COPY NO [3

/
/J/
T)§1-4” BUDGET RESOLUTIONS
/ .
/ ,

/!
L/ X

..o I attach the second print of the Budget Resolutions.

2. Any comments should reach Parliamentary Counsel (Mr Graham
273-5029) direct please, by 11.00 am on Thursday 10 March.

7L The third print will be available on Friday 11 March. °

K F MURPHY
FP1
9 March 1983

i

RUD Mo SECRET






N? 13

BUDGET—SECRET

DRAFT
RESOLUTIONS TO BE MOVED BY
THE CHANCELLOR OF THE
EXCHEQUER

15th MARCH 1983

BUDGET—SECRET



TERORE--TIDGUE

TIASA
Y4 (EVOM 34 OT 2V0ITUI02AS
AHT M0 SOLIEDVIAHD HHT
AAUOTHIYA

£801 HOMAM MiE]



BUDGET—SECRET
(3)

Mr. Chancellor of the Exchequer
ProvISIONAL COLLECTION OF TAXEs: That pursuant to section 5 of the Provisional

Collection of Taxes Act 1968 provisional statutory effect shall be given to the following
Motions : —

{a) Spirits (Motion No. 2)

(b) Beer (Motion No. 3)

(c¢) Wine (Motion No. 4)

(d) Made-wine (Motion No. 5)

(e) Cider (Motion No, 6)

(f) Tobacco products (Motion No, 7)

(g) Hydrocarbon oil (Motion No. 9)

(h) Vehicles excise duty (Motion No. 10)

BUDGET-—SECRET



tan ey ant s

Wetd lig e

"




o
[

[ e e e e =
R N il

N
SRRARBBES

NN
©

—
SOV NALA LD

BUDGET—SECRET
(5)
ARRANGEMENT OF WAYS AND MEANS RESOLUTIONS

Amendment of the law.

Spirits.

Beer.

Wine.

Made-wine.

Cider.

Tobacco products.

Bingo duty.

Hydrocarbon oil.

Vehicles excise duty.

Income tax (charge and rates for 1983-84).

Income tax (personal reliefs).

Income tax (widows’ bereavement allowance).

Relief for interest (limit for 1983-84).

Corporation tax (charge and rate for financial year 1982).
Advance corporation tax (rate for financial year 1983).
Corporation tax (small companies).

Assigned life policies and annuity contracts.

Benefits in kind.

Pay as you earn (non-deducted sums).

Profit-sharing schemes (increase of maximum share appropriation).
Profit-sharing schemes and share option schemes (approval).
Group relief.

Capital allowances for dwelling-houses let on assured tenancies.
Capital gains.

Capital transfer tax (burden of tax and payment by instalments).

Oil taxation (receipts derived from, and expenditure in connection with, certain
assets).

Qil taxation (abortive exploration expenditure).
Relief from tax (incidental and consequential charges).

BUDGET—SECRET



IOITU RS Sbee 200 O3

Fuiuiengl e BrEn Gl

Leins:

4801 oy {eacnir

Levongys) zemodsn

wrqie

aiapi

P Lok T o taTeii il

¢ 2 ¥

=)

b R O TR £ 53 2 312 0N S

vl oy Yo Mvsbusm .

sl

2
LRTW
-yl

i

by codl

SRRVl vl smrar L dopelod it saiendd

dusnzwalls srassy

m._w &
¥ ey
{E8E] =% Eﬁa...a: Y

Mt laitt ) aal mannel
Iﬁm .n_.,.n.-.. ..?“5..“ THY ositer vm.m
o ..TJ 3_ Yerling Y g

fobk oy ,..\‘F.,u x5 e

u!\

W) Red BIRSOGD sz

fepkasqmcn femse) Ts1 = :Ec B N

sEinng .cws:x# AR

. (e Lrababatiody ines u-..... By vsT
Jmessbgrsige siads Sirizam 36 stsonai} spmedi gaitii o

$a v S emana

ixgui ooz pofle
lezguads |

aiipamees b

vﬁMEd.lh-mu_l. I

hilg At Yo oo
i gofibatana a1 swiHgugna Bos el bevien o

eedine Ut Lns cvmtattie Bt s e

m.:“._u.. Lf RIS 513

St AL I _.a ton

Jng iaNe A

s m.....nll_

ek fesi 7 i)
AZ|SaRD

RGIIRAE

Tiladl

I
i e

Fe) p pienes

3 whrhe 3
NS VIR a )

Isirmbiani) st pacnl

Wl ggeddd



BUDGET—SECRET
(7))

1. Amendment of the law

That it is expedient to amend the law with respect to the National Debt and the
public revenue and to make further provision in connection with finance; but this
Resolution does not extend to the making of—

(@) any amendment with respect to value added tax so as to provide—
(i) for zero-rating or exempting any supply;
(i) for refunding any amount of tax otherwise than by a provision relating

to supplies to and importation by a government department, within the
meaning of section 19 of the Finance Act 1972;

(iii) for varying the rate of that tax otherwise than in relation to all supplies
and importations; or

(iv) for any relief other than relief applying to goods of whatever description
or services of whatever description; or
(b) any amendment relating to the surcharge imposed by the National Insurance
Surcharge Act 1976 and applying to some only of the persons by or in respect
of whom the surcharge is payable other than—

(i) an amendment providing for a different rate of surcharge to be paid by
the bodies specified in section 143(4) of the Finance Act 1982; and

(i) an amendment relating to the Commission to be established under the
Act resulting from the National Heritage Bill [Lords].

BUDGET—SECRET



b 132 famaits® ol

%8s ek ceomEed v gk

.

i iy

. )‘I

-

.

SLIGRLLY 2
oy

Tt 2y




BUDGET—SECRET

 9)
2. Spirits

That, as from 16th March 1983, the rate of duty specified in section 5 of the Alcoholic
Liguor Duties Act 1979 shall be increased from £14-47 per litre of alcohol in the spirits
to £15-19 per litre of alcohol in the spirits.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.

BUDGET—SECRET



{ @)
wiEP  ©

sdeafoulds i) 16 T walows o Telliege ol e g gifs 0901 donedd 431 59) 1 AMdY
l?"l‘ﬂf“f—"‘l’ ol foddals Yoo anidl v=e ©F BA3S quet I'r_m_c.ni = mm}_m zetenll mpl_l
wwatbepe s o Ioticsis 3 sk o 610513 of

eodtulens A ) eds st SHileng =i0e ol Sielbos s 4 i it 2805 piad 2 4 b
wesl ¥ qubi=alied) fapelenensl st o stschipoen o oY 1medy Gotutats é-r.aga{t:m it
SE

TIEO—-T R



BUDGET—SECRET
( 1)
3. Beer

That, as from 16th March, 1983, the rates of duty specified in section 36 of the
Alcoholic Liquor Duties Act 1979 shall be increased—

(@) from £20-40 for each hectolitre to £21-60 for each hectolitre; and
(b) from £0-68 for each additional degree of original gravity exceeding 1030 degrees
to £0-72 for each such additional degree.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.

BUDGET—SECRET



TEWOTs-rFoduH

S

et 3o EQ: tratomy. Dl I:z“;;'jm b W e sl ) 3'35'4'— ﬂ}“ Lnd wy Aedi

| gl =8 Gudy {570 0, entteQ roops) ol danls
_  Bue ;outPorser deups wrft (0 10 en gubiensad doas se5 0 0% iy 149)
suagh JEG! aihuses 2357 h’}ﬁ leeiiins By saipeds Mnbinilintis Seas -y m} i:l,,, §1/ 6.7 Mj
snaals inaclJElE dolsE Hoss il $TNGE of
mi‘;rin;;‘: giits psql) 23 *ﬁ’rﬁ SHSae wir N 1o ""l' sl mi n ity Bdednesy wlbnail 2 71 b
wapal 10 uolinalied fansliipert Sl b mwsipery ol rens sodlle Sretmal Gad i
01 i

TIHIRL-IIDOGE



BUDGET—SECRET
( 13)
4. Wine

That, as from 16th March 1983, the rates of duty under section 54 of the Alcoholic
Liquor Duties Act 1979 shall be as follows—

Description of wine Rates of duty
per hectolitre
£
Wine of a strength—
not exceeding 15 per cent 113.00
exceeding 15 but not exceeding 18 per cent ... 145.90
exceeding 18 but not exceeding 22 per cent ... 171.70
exceeding 22 per cent 171.70 plus

£15.19 for every 1 per cent or
part of 1 per cent in excess of
22 per cent;

each of the above rates of duty
being, in the case of sparkling
wine, increased by £24.80 per
hectolitre.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes

Act 1968.

BUDGET—SECRET



TEFORR-CENCNE

Lo A
el | / r
slegioelic 2de T b noireex sulsw =1uly = o i LAY Soebd W e =t
- o =8 ws iy alged A H 5-_» -I:
apply L]
setlesoad
'
- ﬁa'l.:. ke ki k'S
':(3'1( v 1”“‘4 -l\{ lrl;i‘"_'."'."‘!
32.Chi : ST L GELITIE GO uH‘l puitagng
og, 1T - . s T SL sntoazing o tud Bl Hidbssyds
iy 8 1Y) ! : . e CEE e OF efiDosaRs

%0 5-35\7 ::5:: :?. ’flf.’v_h (“ '!.\.ui':"r
%o seeoxe mliimeg s | 1 e

g ,..{S.
'é:d!.r 10 z3t3 wesdn 42 o 4
@:‘...*“.BPS 0 onm bl i ; *_A o
o O30 Baaiiv

- e —.

jnmml‘ﬂzs# olds w‘; fosvaind Galdens ;.*E.'r fi mﬂ-wm g 5 Aa8Y Beglunh vdmad 5 15 '%u;&

eomaT ¥ goioolioD fsnolaivos® =t 35 wssisrveses sir veﬁn'sr foa¥in yeoRitale s bivots
BRI oA

. Lamale e
4 3 Y — Lo |
1--1 -y T

L=

S unalTe



BUDGET—SECRET
( 15)

5. Made-wine

That, as from 16th March 1983, the rates of duty under section 55 of the Alcoholic

Liquor Duties Act 1979 shall be as follows—

Description of made-wine

Rates of duty
per hectolitre

Made-wine of a strength—
not exceeding 10 per cent
exceeding 10 but not exceeding 15 per cent
exceeding 15 but not exceeding 18 per cent
exceeding 18 per cent .

£

79.30
109.80
135.20
135.20 plus
£15.19 for every 1 per cent or
part of 1 per cent in excess of
18 per cent;
each of the above rates of duty
being, in the case of sparkling
made-wine, increased by
£11.35 per hectolitre.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes

Act 1968,

BUDGET—SECRET



=
wwshetf 2

alfofesfd 982 3u LE Duitay voluen gub 3o om0 EBRL dmehd gl monl e ef€
—:;M‘Cifﬂi o o Jinit WS rﬁk wajuli \wgm.l

= .

vwinh la =t srbnssbaie To obnfieetd]
T3t e

e S N N Y B N
| - . ~ TEn e T anTE-2km
l'" = ¢ e 10 B w =S -“|.»'<
€11 “'l M nnemi EL;ule E% Jry e Ll "fﬁ‘.:.,.‘._',.]_a
= s fissr sag 2 galie=ron o ood 31 prilontns
sk D6 '_i N . ) - 12 B B leimeanian
e = '1&', | T o P ELA
Yo ez ) g vy ¢ an |
i ey
L'} T11 Gl O 51 PE Q= [Ny g[S
itidTge W S ot m gl
= e SriT-linm
amil & 11

- | e e e —— —

.G:-}i&lk—._-'iﬂ_'-f-‘" Bt e ANy sl heslbeases o 1l bl Perninoal cpeaad i o g
Syl 1 mopibmidin ¥ luveguess by 1o umsinoroe) sl ssihen 1==(ize ETIEE e P
TS




BUDGET—SECRET

(17 )
6. Cider

That, as from 16th March 1983, the rate of duty specified in section 62(1) of the
Alcoholic Liquor Duties Act 1979 shall be increased from £8-16 per hectolitre to £9-69
per hectolitre.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.

BUDGET—SECRET



ERTONETINat
{ ©F 5
AN N
ads 3o 010G paitn nt beliives b In i R S
To- 05 o fintodaaid sie ab Rl g _._ i mi o § R mvmac_rw.,uﬁe wi T = ...tum.{....ﬁw_
wzan ¥
wunilogA il A0 femini stldpg cdt w _:1._ =008 5 1 duis bevalial ﬁw.ih 5L +. bak
sl in aawu@m ) TaEdave S 3 nclalvang sl $a5at Iosfe wangsiene sezd hbvoge

ﬁ.ﬂt# aa.}...

TERe—rExase



BUDGET—SECRET
( 19)
7. Tobacco products

That, as from 18th March 1983, for the Table in Schedule 1 to the Tobacco Products
Duty Act 1979 there shall be substituted the following Table—

“ TABLE

1. Cigarettes ... An amount equal to 21 per cent. of
the retail price plus £21:67 per
thousand cigarettes.

2. Cigars £40-85 per kilogram.
3. Hand-rolling tobacco £35-40 per kilogram.
4. Other smoking tobacco and

chewing tobacco ... £24-95 per kilogram.”

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
‘silould have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
ct 1968.

BUDGET—SECRET



L

toen )
ey ccseds’l T
othoE% omadl T sdl G 1 shobudest ni sl ¥ s sl F59) L difE send
A BT 0 I K e st

R P

So S veq I8 o e woens ek o L . admeed |

wy a0l el _'-=r-,LInu- -.-nl

meelid e WL L L augs o

I mn-wllﬂl ey ity »a ~ _ﬂ-ﬂ.dﬂ_l.!ﬂ‘@‘;“bﬂl_& £
Tiiegolld e 2 8L - e wantho ooy
il R vt todh torewid ey sdn o vedeigar =0 tadh feraiesh oot @ o bk
lﬁ-'llll %o Pralilecy e B JE R TR e e T e -l;n-ﬁll'n‘ll Hig:h}m'::

TAN IS =TI



BUDGET—SECRET
(21 )
8. Bingo duty.

That new provision may be made with respect to bingo duty.

BUDGET—SECRET



el et 2

sptub peakd oz wogrsy by shaze w8 wars sokivas we sai T

TERAS-TRASGER



BUDGET—SECRET
( 23 )
9. Hydrocarbon oil.

That, as from six o’clock in the evening of 15th March 1983, the rates of duty specified
in section 6(1) of the Hydrocarbon Oil Duties Act 1979 shall be increased—

(@) in the case of light oil, from £0-1554 a litre to £0-1630 a litre; and
(b) in the case of heavy oil, from £0-1325 a litre to £0-1382 a litre.
And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution

ls}:ould have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
ct 1968.

BUDGET—SECRET



Ce
e A
bbﬂlw '[‘I'i‘ll P— WM -fr Tl alangtsl dis ny =ali l.l.l ia.l':.g
Al gy

<cBsoosschli b ady ¥TR1 e, tresSemonritg 5&% WI Mkflw "
htrn oot BEAT (0] ot el 5 hirdr m-u_a'.lﬂliailkem%ﬁr. &)

paull o XBEE O o il 4 TEEY O et nwhﬂkw w2t #i (6

mﬂt_ip.'leﬂ by ) J“ﬁl:eﬁ-n“ = o H =l ol &t 5
nnilnalkﬂ SR LU ek %Wm
I e

TR -TIRUN



BUDGET—SECRET
( 25)
10. Vehicles excise duty.

That the Vehicles (Excise) Act 1971 and the Vehicles (Excise) Act (Northern Ireland)
1972 shall have effect with the amendments set out below.

But this Resolution shall not authorise the making of amendments which would result
in different provisions being in force in different parts of Great Britain.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.

(1) In the said Acts of 1971 and 1972, for the provisions of Part II of Schedules 1 to §
(annual rates of duty) there shall be substituted the provisions set out below

PROVISIONS SUBSTITUTED FOR PART IT OF SCHEDULE 1 TO ACT OF 1971 AND ACT OF 1972

Description of vehicle ‘ Rate of duty
' £

1. Bicycles and tricycles of which the cylinder capac1ty of the engme

does not exceed 150 cubic centimetres 8.50

2. Bicycles of which the cylinder capacity of the engine exceeds 150 cubic |
centimetres but does not exceed 250 cubic centimetres; tricycles (other

than those in the foregoing paragraph) and vehicles (other than mowing |

machines) with more than three wheels, being tricycles and vehicles neither

constructed nor adapted for use nor used for the carriage of a driver or

passenger v | 17.00

3. Bicycles and tricycles not in the foregoing paragraphs... e | 34.00

PROVISIONS SUBSTITUTED FOR PART IT OF SCHEDULE 2 TO ACT OF 1971 AND AcCT OF 1972

Description of vehicle [ Rate of duty
|

£
Hackney carriages ... 42.00
with an additional 85p for each
person above 20 (excluding
the driver) for which the
‘ vehicle has seating capacity.

BUDGET—SECRET



i & §
Sl aniata sndbllsY  OE
(Fradel ermivee®l) soh riioni) 2alublol o) Bns |TU S, Joetie S SRAERY sdrlady

il L g ftammibursim Y diiwe toolts nond Hads STOT

i Wlaoe iiidie sieetficne kegertesy o8 aaecatiug 1o Nely xculzes i sidr wil
ST '-I-s sty toeslib: b 2t nl o Feaiadoe Sxeaidh a4

goitrufi widfy wrr e dtlug ol G ssieges o % Ol bywionb pdord 2 $2 hes
2T Yo sallalliely laansideay. r Yo kadhelvisiy wil reiodt Yool wluidish uﬁ Slusnin
=19

tutzin&aé:_h_l'!;!ik:mm_ﬁgﬂ =t ST s Hullna.m:ma};g;m
wii=d o 1o .TI'I.J_"IIII aull) fovintitscue =nl 1ieds rodt lg‘-ﬂh o :-;-)3‘; yrut

R el mdx 1TV 900 A o | eommerel 5oy 1 visd] sy corrirriesde sswgivoed]

——— -

LTIy Bl TR T} af Il_l'{!'l i LT, TS i T
3 b= -
) ST g ] l\l Ju.Mlu :'uml = anil lfn-l_l'ul o |||:,€ sull oh l:,u:-‘-dlﬁ .I
.0 i NI D5 Baeas lok s

st 02 abencs Hrigna st T rtmget sl s donfw tedsig g 3

i) oyl aetisgmiieq alyn R Logees ten paol sard semsiies

|l‘llm|||ﬂ nigli ﬂlflﬂj antpafiny noe |||_||||un|ul!| |_|,||‘||u;-|n l,‘_k ;& szl sath

Yo ininliay s el grdien lslier Sendt ur’-m £ i {eeliboiny

) VYOI g L0 BT W) WO S ey By deswp=bie poy Llwam.s?o
LR g A v . = iRy

0 e . :l‘f‘q::al.‘t, q';m.rrzo-il':_r ';_s".l il Fony tx': ! Trn gfggu;ﬂ f,.

BT Za.vhA asu i\ 20 v S Sncmth? ol eRa T i |lj,_ |m|11m gmﬁping

sl sk shider 1 el
ﬂﬁ . wagrberes yaminets
feods 1T AR Irml‘:f‘bn e dm S

m‘t—-ﬂ-

w.w.m] =t
el inite m' [mva‘b lf

Afsass Fikitde ol Slsider




BUDGET—SECRET

( 27 )
PROVISIONS SUBSTITUTED FOR PART II oF ScHEDULE 3 TOo AcTt OF 1971
Weight unladen of vehicle Rate of duty
1. 2. 3. 4. 5.
Additional
for each
ton or
Description of vehicle Exceeding | Not Initial | partofa
exceeding ton in
| excess of the
weight in
column 2
£ £
1. Agricultural machines; digging — — 14.00 —
machines; mobile cranes; works {
trucks; mowing machines; fisher-
men’s tractors
2. Haulage vehicles, being show- — 7% tons 137.00 _
men’s vehicles 7% tons 8 tons 164.00 e
8 tons 10 tons 193.00 =
10 tons —_ 193.00 30.00
3. Haulage vehicles not being — 2 tons 163.00 —
showmen’s vehicles 2 tons 4 tons 293.00 —
4 tons 6 tons 424 .00 —
6 tons 7% tons 553.00 —
74 tons 8 tons 676.00 —
8 tons 10 tons 676.00 | 115.00
10 tons — 906.00 130.00

BUDGET—SECRET



-, "

{ I8

l‘@l 50 "‘.'JA {nf 3' S.IU(JIH 1 W TH rant alsy c(_trgm_,fﬁ‘l’ﬁ ERRIMRGRY

gl b als sstdey 1o avbaiss ;L'g;-'.-._"éf
- I Ve % .
!Bﬂ%s’i.d)?.ﬁ
fiodls 1% .

pLRCES

gt ot Tisean
i 14 2y

aivigh (o goirebogescd

3 -
. &1 wnigmb cesidonn, Wil L
e pdmgned ehdtay ) ity
i sl a SRl sndasid
Blh'c_q'll-_?‘\ .m.
. 0, 1L wor 5 - -duf‘& im.-f ELNS f'l: el 1{
- LR s 4 paid | mboEbne s M
-— L ED sl 0! (TS )
fﬂ.ﬁ{ B iel o i
Ok, ST Az T el ren allifer et A
S 750 --.5 3:.:!_]‘ i WA D Y -"—'-""3."‘-')'-'-f'll‘lnl';'_‘-‘i'f.'\'tfg
) 8.8 s T S
17 R LT
L AR 'nﬂe'l s kL
90 &1 i a; G?’l 1P "i'-' ==y ,‘*,
m(k] e - i At ol




BUDGET—SECRET

(29 )

PROVISIONS SUBSTITUTED FOR PART II OF SCHEDULE 3 TO ACT OF 1972

Weight unladen of vehicle Rate of duty
I 2. 3 4, 3.
Additional
for each
ton or
Description of vehicle Exceeding Not Initial partof a
exceeding ton in
excess of the
weight in
column 2
£ £
1. Agricultural machines; diggin— — = 14-00 =
machines; mobile cranes; works
trucks; mowing machines; fisher-
men’s tractors
2. Haulage vehicles, being show- — 7% tons 137-00 —
men’s vehicles 7% tons 8 tons 164-00 —
8 tons 10 tons 193-00 —_
10 tons — 193-00 30-00
3. Haulage vehicles, not being —_ 2 tons 147-00 —
showmen’s vehicles 2 tons 4 tons 262-00 —
4 tons 6 tons 374-00 —
6 tons 71 tons 489-00 —
7% tons 8 tons 603-00 —
8 tons — 603:00 130-00

BUDGET—SECRET



RN ~TRNUUE
[
§?EI 10 V8 S 3 ZAUGRITR W I0TaAY i ATTo eIt oo R
bt s ool Yo wobislan 2 lylave |
I (]
o SRR o i
| J
it B o ] E ul
Pmm.libbs’s !
#\'Jﬁ-f) Tei .
I a5 i .
&'!unag el ] -yl shifar i pegiestl
IR L BRI
a5l e 20089
4l g 1
S r;cn,rlm |
T 1 3 [
— L i - -mg,:b seairidinin moslesad
i GHIOV IS :ﬂ-dom 't-\auhnhﬁ's
! =5t Mpsabicesr Subwem peduitg
‘;t_ul.ar-'.i -!._ e
-~ ] SNEl 2 5 wwade pnied galaiday rr,un-ﬂ &
- ¢ 5 Y atal & el 4 auloidye 2'nom
- Ocprga! era 1 ans X
L) RLerS WeaEl - ietes B
= o] (rice i R e £ Sa— .‘; —— -
e (g4 51 @ o = gshisd = aelEdar sgiloER £
— TN e = oy £ Faloittov 2 vamworls
— . AEME ika: B et B
= H ﬂ-‘.‘ogg?_ a:“{(.'_l -}‘ (.20 . |
— U2 508 anal # guoy &L
m'ﬁi DL"E% - g 8

TIRIEIR2CTE



BUDGET—SECRET

( 31)

PROVISIONS SUBSTITUTED FOR PART I OF SCHEDULE 4 T0 AcCT OF 1971 AND AcT OF 1972

RATES OF DuTy ON RIGID Goobs VEHICLES EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED GROSS WEIGHT

TABLE A

GENERAL RATES

Plated gross weight of vehicle

Rate of duty

1. 2. 3. 4. 5.
Exceeding Not Two axle Three axle Four or more
exceeding vehicle vehicle axle vehicle
tonnes tonnes £ £ £

12 13 410 320 320
13 14 500 320 320
14 15 610 320 320
15 16 670 320 320
16 17 780 320 320
17 18 = 380 320
18 19 — 440 320
19 20 500 320
20 21 — 580 320
21 22 — 660 390
22 23 — 740 470
23 24 — 920 560
24 25 — 1,150 660
25 26 — — 770
26 217 — — 880
27 28 — — 1,010
28 29 — — 1,140
29 30 — — 1,500
30 30.49 — — 1,990

BUDGET-—SECRET



SURT in oA ama ITE o mder & zaner s 1T reid moe (erTSITRRTE BUoh

A 52T

YRR N A g ey 18 T &1 sl o srinY o off @0 Tl
==y (B |
@hity T mindd Bl N Idgiee sjen
1 g A 4 i

i
STp v skl a4z 23467 A ool s SLTVIES
aloidiny S plunizy witifuy TRt at o

A—— e wiw e ————— T

-
W

¥

A (108
gL HE 1h3
ats, : Qi 2 |
aTE ) )

o5y el

7

LR L e H

WA (B e e e e &

i I (=L agh e 0
5 0gE i = ' '
Ry - Bes R el »
L { e - . 9% e
& is ug

bz s 35
I " = &

“' Gpr I o : Ea: i
J""':- [ L e ,L:- I
Do -1yl . a

1
B
RSAREMANER

' % ' =anss ' Eodtan

vt |

avaf}

TR DA A FIEE



BUDGET—SECRET
( 33)

TABLE A(l)

RATES oF DuTY ON RIGID GooDs VEHICLES EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED GrOSs WEIGHT
RATES FOR FARMERS’ GOODS VEHICLES

Plated gross weight of vehicle Rate of duty
1. 2. 3. 4. 5.
Exceeding Not Two axle | Three axle Four or more
exceeding vehicle [ vehicle axle vehicle
tonnes tonnes £ £ £

12 13 135 120 120
13 14 140 120 120
14 15 145 120 120
15 16 165 125 120
16 17 180 130 120
17 18 — 135 120
18 19 — 140 120
19 20 — 145 125
20 21 — 150 130
21 22 — 155 135
22 23 — 160 140
23 24 — 180 145
24 25 — 210 150
25 26 — — 160
26 27 — — 180
27 28 — ; — 200
28 29 — — 215
29 30 — — 275
30 30.49 — — 340

BUDGET—SECRET



W I i" g3 Q-lg-’ll
It q

LE " T

T g a0 0T 1 pwentonn o sy mea g ko p gL e mmve §
Zmpmy gl popmmenp] s mava i

—p——————

Ao ey fatow i Mgl s tssintd
£ » ' = )
fuEmTm T airs ==l m - i | nu_?-_:_ﬂ
s sy slresrs
3 & 2 =utfiE | e
| oLl L 3 54
@t (£ A i & ' Li
%l; 1 Lkl x| . &
att 22 a8} 8 e
£ ey iy il ol
e 2 29 = g s
o o " s
El ' Lal I 1 | o
A | s, - £ | nw
=EY | 24| - 3] l i
B LB * L
;ﬂl &ar — o~ I ﬁ
l ik -— B ‘ i
m B ot &l
mir - 111 [1d
e - ¥ €4 = :
1t = = i o
e — ' - R4 | W
' = - Tp. e A




BUDGET—SECRET

( 35 )
TABLE A(2)

RATES oF DUTY ON RIGID GooDs VEHICLES EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED GROSS WEIGHT
RATES FOR SHOWMEN’S GOODS VEHICLES !

Plated gross weight of vehicle Rate of duty
. 2. 3. 4, 5.
Exceeding Not Two axle Three axle Four or more
exceeding vehicle vehicle axle vehicle
tonnes tonnes £ £ 9
12 13 135 120 120
13 14 140 120 120
14 15 145 120 120
15 16 165 125 120
16 17 180 130 120
17 18 — 135 120
18 19 — 140 125
19 20 — 150 130
20 21 — 160 140
21 22 — 165 150
22 23 — 175 160
23 24 — 210 165
24 25 — 250 180
25 26 — — 200
26 27 — — 220
27 28 — = 245
28 29 — — 265
29 30 | — — 340
30 30.49 — — 430

BUDGET—SECRET



e .
T—

t‘ B o — - - S - - -l _—— B —
| ——— T R ] = e T e
3 i) W LS Y i
! ¢ By
EOA et

PRIIEVE 22040 axvaaT amea ) U1 e 0 eV g0t anori s 6 aeal
PARIMGEY AorRIER EwRESGITE ART S W

whih o piaH hantye T Jl“:&h moea Lem]el
A | b | L

- ! -

-}
TEVGE TG sl — TsmowT  C 0 WA T gl

LUSTIEEE 1T | plontay pladys aniyroes
1 z 3 Pty Tt
ne) ! 0 22| it T
ey 0zl L i |
ey gl:l ol k1 | M
%l 41 z-}{ 2 | ei
oy w1 (2 i , al
it 2l - x: . v
2= abl 2 By
Uy D24 - oL I y
i I wast 14 i 1)1
!5 ! o | o | I
13 I L — f, ! i e
- nie — = 1 ES
i Lot —- 21 | B
{ — — it y
o< f : 7 A
- = E T X
EAN3 | o - 14
k= - — (]
m - | . r"E - ) pg
o~ S e




BUDGET—SECRET
( 37 )

TABLE B

SUPPLEMENTARY RATES OF DUTY oN RIGID Goops VEHICLES OVER 12 TONNES USED FOR
DRAWING TRAILERS EXCEEDING 4 TONNES PLATED GROSS WEIGHT

GENERAL RATES

Gross weight of trailer

{ Duty supplement

Exceeding Not exceeding

tonnes tonnes {5
4 8 | 70

8 , 10 ! 90

10 12 115

12 14 160

14 — 300

TasLE B(1)

SUPPLEMENTARY RATES OF DUTY ON RiGID GooDs VEHICLES OVER 12 TONNES USED FOR
DRAWING TRAILERS EXCEEDING 4 TONNES PLATED GROSS WEIGHT

RATES FOR FARMERS® GoODS VEHICLES

Gross weight of trailer
Duty supplement
Excceding Not exceeding
tonnes tonnes £
4 8 70
8 10 90
10 12 115
12 14 160
14 — 300
I
TABLE B(2)

SUPPLEMENTARY RATES oF DUTY ON RIGID GooDs VEHICLES OVER 12 ToNNES USED FOR
DRAWING TRAILERS EXCEEDING 4 TONNES PLATED GROSS WEIGHT

RATES FOR SHOWMEN'S GOODS VEHICLES

Gross weight of trailer

Duty supplement
Exceeding Not exceeding

£
— 70

BUDGET—SECRET



¢ %y
_ - a' sy

MW el st w4 gt AstoagT el
R smneyld

. ] A
o sbemmiod | griemsd
. Eamtaia T e .
v ¥ o
e ooF ]
BF§ 11 it

L asas b

aon gty émmn‘j;.l- VY BN M) oS s ol v ASTAS SRR IHE T
TR 7t AT AT B0 L 1 R w T 2amaan'T (e

PALMIEY e "L g aon o

_ . vyl o 24 glem 2O
(LY T I I p— E
. — - - r .M‘“E— - ‘M— -
- | e, | wnew
g‘r 1 b
i Pl -
25t | a1
&5} bt £l
e : 4
(50} R WIITN .
0% cuwlF et $1 rend werraung' smonkl il i Il R tEkTEE NI

AU raanDy A r® el F iesGrrin § annnanT owae
FRADRY AiSo0E) el o 2RSS

raliet in lugees geea)
asstalegtoa sl . e —_—
anibaeniy bt ZRthweraty
J = 1
Ly — —




BUDGET—SECRET

( 39 )

TABLE C

RATES oF DuTY oN TracTOR UNITS EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED TRAIN WEIGHT
AND HAVING ONLY 2 AXLES

GENERAL RATES

Plated train weight of tractor unit Rate of duty
|
i 2. 1 3. 4, 5.
For a tractor For a tractor For a tractor

unit to be used | unit to be used | unit to be used

Exceeding Not exceeding | with semi-trailers | only with semi- | only with semi-

with any number | trailers with not | trailers with not

of axles less than two less than three
axles axles

tonnes tonnes £ £ £

12 13 420 420 420
13 14 470 420 420
14 15 510 420 420
15 16 560 420 420
16 17 610 420 420
17 18 660 420 420
18 19 710 420 420
19 20 770 420 420
20 21 830 470 420
21 22 890 520 420
22 23 950 590 420
23 24 1,020 660 420
24 25 1,090 740 420
25 26 1,090 830 500
26 27 1,090 940 590
27 28 1,090 1,040 630
28 29 1,150 1,150 780
29 30 1,390 1,390 890
30 31 1,600 1,600 1,000
31 32 1,820 1,820 1,110
32 32.52 2,290 2,290 1,600
32.52 33 2,290 2,290 1,840
33 34 2,290 2,290 2,140
34 35 2,450 2,450 2,450
35 36 2,610 2,610 2,610
36 37 2,730 2,730 2,730
37 38 2,940 2,940 2,940

BUDGET—SECRET



A

{ ok}
D BT

Twpey art ert] wmoea T DL oo e ] syl sera sl ue oo s aein s
BRAEA S RIALY spesaRl ooy

MIAS sl

Smee o Pibe | S ke i
A0 e ayuhas) | M e 4 gy

sttt ddla dlli‘fh;m M
pnlyntin R T

ot i D IRV pliFn 16
plim aley
~ a0 % e
LN N l:ll:.
(=8 €% ot h
J_IE.E- HEy (1113
I o {4 W
= L B ::'lﬂ
{5 g3 |
ois | Bt 1)
Ok v I
ik ot s
- —_ﬂ
(i | 03y LT
&rﬂ- :};’u ‘W“.'
LA -1 e
L= =Y %l
l;u": I LMO I&JIL
i b el |
e ' (el fHEL
:_al'u!'t !I I‘lj'a ! I bt [
il ﬂﬂt\f | et
oz ! s o LS
GRf [ mmt s
BLE | ok A
AR Bihe wat
osf L g BT
1y i fatrs 1 iy

el | ik yesoan o sighw: slow bl
2 ) / £ - - i
I
L LI A bW s=l ol g Wl
=t ot ||Iﬁ|u L st W [EESTIE TS T

R e

IRV

=
=%

ARMERD HRSARRSA RS R

ey

b

THAIRETHDICTE



BUDGET—SECRET

( 41 )

TaBLE C(1)

RATES oF DUTY ON TRACTOR UNITS EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED TRAIN WEIGHT
AND HAvING ONLY 2 AXLES

RATES FOR FARMERS’ GOODS VEHICLES

Plated train weight of tractor unit

! 3.
|  For a tractor

Rate of duty

4.

For a tractor

For a tractor

unit to be used | unit to be used | unit to be used

Exceeding Not exceeding | with semi-trailers | only with semi- | only with semi-

with any number | trailers with not | trailers with not

of axles less than two less than three
axles axles

tonnes tonnes £ £ £

12 13 135 135 135
13 14 140 135 135
14 15 145 135 135
15 16 150 135 135
16 17 155 135 135
17 18 160 135 135
18 19 160 135 135
19 20 165 135 135
20 21 170 135 135
21 22 175 140 135
22 23 180 145 135
23 24 190 150 135
24 25 200 155 140
25 26 200 160 145
26 27 200 170 150
27 28 200 180 165
28 29 200 195 175
29 30 235 235 195
30 31 265 265 210
31 32 300 300 230
32 32.52 370 370 305
32.52 33 610 610 610
33 34 710 710 710
34 35 810 810 810
35 36 860 860 860
36 37 900 900 900
37 38 970 970 970

BUDGET—SECRET



,-_\-.'I R
TR Laagsa
Ly
o0 5 e
v W eika T ey s M pmeey) O s |.l.|.l.EI| mrpad agpme T se ] o eandi
A, L iy paprall e
Balaw ¥ i el wort B3
1_ﬁl1‘l Tin Wi s e Yia Hﬁn'll fanri '-tlif_l
- = = = —_— RS = . B
ees et s e 3 87
Sewuwod oir Tuny  oaln wd OF D s 08
okl Moy tlro, Sl b i anlledbomse il ' gilllioxs i el
sou e mmiigsy  vaet o epeliver  eEou v e |
Mmﬂ"ﬂli v toel i s At |
ol ) xlsy l l
. : 2 ‘ e et | =t
2L w0t 2l Fa | £t
| 5 1 O] L% (3
£ 2y L 2r | 3]
2l | et o ol | er
=1} | o 2L Ny g
W1 i mE | § . ©
i 24t el 8l ¥
3£ A 4t | oL | 2
oy S Iy 15 ar
el | L 0 1 = IAs
2Ll oM | ] 174 &
LEt ndt oy S o,
(i B beyt, . kz
Tt (i 14 L gl o
g2 e 0E , 3t o
204 odl e s %
AN | evi By O K
el 4 234 Al | (e o5
o ' onl st TE UE
s it R £ I
18 J e ; e &2 ¢F K24
filg il I 0!‘.5 i £r 4 s t\"-
v 0L AT & l FA ”
g A Al ' bl & L e
(5 Uas ' oad 4t b L i
009 [ e L g ; f a ,




BUDGET—SECRET

( 43 )
TABLE C(2)

RATES oF DuTY ON TRACTOR UNITS EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED TRAIN WEIGHT
AND HAVING ONLY 2 AXLES

RATES FOR SHOWMEN’S GooDS VEHICLES

Plated train weight of tractor unit Rate of duty
1. 2. 3. 4. 5.
| Fora tractor For a tractor For a tractor

unit to be used | unit to be used | unit to be used

Exceeding Not exceeding | with semi-trailers | only with semi- | only with semi-

with any number | trailers with not | trailers with not

of axles less than two less than three
axles axles

tonnes tonnes £ £ £

12 13 135 135 135
13 14 140 135 135
14 15 145 135 135
15 16 150 135 135
16 17 155 135 135
17 18 160 135 135
18 19 160 135 135
19 20 170 145 145
20 21 180 150 150
21 22 195 155 155
22 23 210 160 160
23 24 220 170 165
24 25 235 180 165
25 26 235 195 175
26 27 235 215 185
27 28 235 230 205
28 29 245 245 220
29 30 295 295 240
30 31 335 335 260
31 32 | 375 375 285
32 32.52 465 465 385
32.52 33 750 750 750
33 34 880 880 880
34 35 1,000 1,000 1,000
35 36 1,070 1,070 1,070
36 37 1,120 1,120 1,120
37 38 1,200 1,200 1,200

BUDGET—SECRET



1L

(=1

122 shiarT

o el gesed) WastEeR ks B

Shasar st o Wigdshe s ieitelSf

=l e el
'L:_ S — - — o _I, 4 - = 3
| 'l[‘l_ﬂ.-gllllll-‘ RUTTIETINTIR B8 | MEipEy) § s
Boer W ood liem O 'hbeet sl ot e Jon ' OF dnm
, WO TURS PLRL i LA RN AVUSP R Bl e f. el
mm-._l-rm T dns mmhieit sgdpalin fu i |
gt el ! ot el mens Ny
| o B TRR - . |
| == et e e e : y :
i . x Am—c) L e
A si] 41]L n ar
Bl 1K1 ) I 3 4l
T! r Bkl 0y 12
i a2 ol i | o1
by L L Y “
ML i it Bt 1y
1:_.;. |'| I M1 = al
1 rie bl IZIj )|
43 -.;'_I et JE ] e
- 7 | ! ) UL = L 1%
Y i Nt n =
}i'l g EEH. e L5
Wity i £5 al £
ol By BX% i (43
. A} ALY (5! < ' ok
[y | oy il (L L
1 245 0 e : £
i ' b U8 L 1 e8.
wE ¢ o v i
) e i £ i
int l FFS cuk 2 3
iy : R &2 £2 3 LA
b 0 = L 3 i
Rl ke & 1 BT [ g
(NS e L LIRS a8 & R
&Ll o, ¢ ﬂﬂaL v : s
- el S

I et e




BUDGET—SECRET

( 45 )

TaBLE D

RATES oF DUTY ON TRACTOR UNITS EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED TRAIN WEIGHT
AND HAVING 3 orR MORE AXLES

GENERAL RATES

Plated train weight of tractor unit Rate of duty
1. 2. 3. 4. 5.
For a tractor For a tractor For a tractor

unit to be used | unit to be used | unit to be used

Exceeding Not exceeding | with semi-trailers | only with semi- | only with semi-

with any number | trailers with not | trailers with not

of axles less than two less than three
axles axles

tonnes tonnes Y £ £

12 20 420 420 420
20 21 470 420 420
21 22 520 420 420
22 23 590 420 420
23 24 660 420 420
24 25 740 420 420
25 26 830 420 420
26 27 940 420 420
27 28 1,040 420 420
28 29 1,150 490 420
29 30 1,390 550 420
30 31 1,600 610 420
31 32 1,820 630 420
32 32.52 2,290 920 420
32.52 33 2,290 1,080 420
33 34 2,290 1,350 520
34 35 2,290 1,630 670
35 36 2,290 1,930 790
36 37 2,290 2,240 980
37 38 2,590 2,590 1,180

BUDGET—SECRET



__.m :
E ||
|
_ m I mmmsaauumvum@ahfmaxw |
| : | b
_ R L
N 4 o © 3 1, _ :
‘ | m m € | .m mm.&:uﬂm@a mumr dspe |
3 LR S S |
i_ _ ) _-l"ﬂ _m __nn:.mwﬁ,mam N II_ ||_
i s 3 HE %"ﬁm.m “gpdegens R RERRIENIRY |
| Rt I
o | e 1 o R I
| ol (s _
| A Ei 33188 | ~easnseaseusaan ERaEH
. § | &, |7855E |
“ S BRI
| ; “ _mmmw e ]
| f.mmm
| _
" “ 7
[ i T | A P

SN .|
= .



BUDGET—SECRET

( 47 )

TABLE D(1)

RATES OF DuTY oN TrACTOR UNITS EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED TRAIN WEIGHT
AND HAVING 3 OR MORE AXLES

RATES FOR FARMERS’ GOODS VEHICLES

Plated train weight of tractor unit Rate of duty
1. 2. 3. 4, 5.
For a tractor For a tractor For a tractor

unit to be used | unit to be used | unit to be used

Exceeding Not exceeding | with semi-trailers | only with semi- | only with semi-

with any number | trailers with not | trailers with not

of axles less than two less than three
axles axles

tonnes tonnes £ £ £

12 20 135 135 135
20 21 135 135 135
21 22 140 135 135
22 23 145 135 135
23 24 150 135 135
24 25 155 135 135
25 26 160 140 135
26 27 170 150 135
27 28 180 160 145
28 29 195 170 155
29 30 235 190 165
30 31 265 205 185
31 32 300 225 205
32 32.52 370 300 220
32.52 33 370 355 220
33 34 445 445 270
34 35 535 535 350
35 36 635 635 410
36 37 740 740 510
37 38 855 855 615

BUDGET—SECRET



I et €

{ % ¥

TP ART i thowtlsl S| oonomiont 2omlt wyfnan] sy eaod somerast
A Jmoled we o myrasl

lu.l:illlT!l:mD FRLTRAT RO Jue &

el Moy Humt wriined M6 .hlwn @i rmt'!
.-‘!. . A I ik i =1
: _ﬂﬁiﬂ_:iﬁi;ll__-_ﬂ_llﬂ'__e_ Sy w——— e — -
hﬂﬂﬁ..ﬁﬂﬁlm’h——lim !
; ' = iy L !
m.'tﬁn‘lm- I toerdber rrmnim -mlr 1-“—'1 - s kel
mll AL ) | o e ) A |
'I.ﬂ'l_p | L il I| |
P R I —
2t | 0 e i I !é
ST i H
i ; A e (1 i I
N | Mk I e oy
L. e i1 ! o X%
[x 1) n ﬁ'r it E i
w1 i i | e | &
1 i ' ' =
all"' m ~ -‘l, :‘_._
R e
I.LIE ED! | £, . [
o o i Tz } -
s e use = | mas
mr ﬂ"" '’ —m I ﬁi E
ﬁ? ;’3‘3 | 4 % { o
7£ oL [ E 13 i.g
aay 28 ‘ o I g-o ll A8



BUDGET—SECRET

( 49 )

TABLE D(2)

RATES OF DUTY ON TRACTOR UNITS EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED TRAIN WEIGHT
AND HAVING 3 OR MORE AXLES

RATES FOR SHOWMEN’S GooDS VEHICLES

Plated train weight of tractor unit Rate of duty
1. 2. 3. 4, 5.
For a tractor For a tractor For a tractor

unit to be used | unit to be used | unit to be used

Exceeding Not exceeding | with semi-trailers | only with semi- | only with semi-

with any number | trailers with not | trailers with not

of axles less than two less than three
axles axles

tonnes tonnes £ £ £

12 18 135 135 135
18 19 135 135 135
19 20 140 140 135
20 21 145 145 135
21 22 155 150 135
22 23 160 155 135
23 24 170 160 135
24 25 180 160 145
25 26 195 170 155
26 27 210 180 160
27 28 230 200 170
28 29 245 215 190
29 30 295 235 205
30 31 335 255 230
31 32 375 280 250
32 32.52 465 375 275
32.52 33 465 440 275
33 34 550 550 335
34 35 665 665 435
35 36 790 790 515
36 37 915 915 635
37 38 1,060 1,060 765

BUDGET—SECRET



~RRGEINE e

B )

(EKL ZI8AE
THOIEW WINRY s 1 el £l seagsnnrS s mmna_..mw. o eeG o el
eR.IVA, oA 20 5 waval 6%
PEDMEY 000D TREWE 20T SAYAR

] .Mmg...n._ .,..emuha. T raiw misan bessisl

B Y 2R

i ! _. .
4 | = " £ ..L..n
4 -
08 ol .ﬂ Yol Ll .5-5,3_ & .
o wd o) tag 1 Baauad o siau _ baay ==X ol Jusg ) !
stz b Yo | e v ) .xﬁr....r..-r.‘ diily | gRleEe T
ol aboe s | Jon diive ssabimny | eadhe i vk e | _
At eaitseal | b pmill zend =% Yo
aulvg ! g 1
J ! EBSAT ._ zaleoy
fil i il m__. 1 d
B 2 o ! i
2t T 51 .ﬁm
&L il iL L
&kl (1 L it
2€ 21 i 5y
-.u._....u B ﬁf...m uJF;. m.n”
S ol 2 e
A e o4 28
1 a1 it ¥
i n r _M_H—u.u »-“.M i H
L 14 RE BL
0L i § 03 €y
L 2 ' E F e
o | Uac ] IE
o 3... ; .1 3]
[ (e fe 5,88
are t L | kL TS
£l ! T 2 &%
178 : oY AL 2%
Eia 1 el LE oy
par 1 GGt _ BE ®




BUDGET—SECRET

( 51 )
PROVISIONS SUBSTITUTED FOR PART II OF SCHEDULE S TO ACT OF 1971 AND AcT oF 1972
Description of vehicle Rate of duty
£
1. Vehicles not exceeding seven horse-power, if registered under the
Roads Act 1920 for the first time before 1st January 1947 60.00
2. Vehicles not included above 85.00

PROVISIONS SUBSTITUTED FOR PART II OF SCHEDULE 5 TO ACT OF 1971

Description of vehicle Rate of duty
£
1. Vehicles first registered under the Roads Act 1920 before Ist January
1947, or which, if its first registration for taxation purposes had been
effected in Northern Ireland would have been so first registered as afore-
said under the Act as in force in Northern Ireland:
(i) not exceeding 6 horse-power 5-00
(i) exceeding 6 horse-power but not exceeding 9 horse-power—for
each unit or part of a unit of norse-power e 8-50
2. Other vehicles 85-00

(2) In the said Acts of 1971 and 1972, in subsection (5) of section 16 (trade licences),
including that subsection as set out in paragraph 12 of Part I of Schedule 7, for “ £40”

and “ £8 ” there shall be substituted, respectively, “ £42 " and “ £8-50 ™.

(3) In Part I of Schedule 4 to the Acts of 1971 and 1972 (annual rates of duty on goods

vehicles)—

(a) in paragraph 1(1), for “ £170 ” there shall be substituted “ £150 ”;

(b) in paragraph 2, for “ £360 ” there shall be substituted “ £320 ”;
(¢) in paragraph 5—
(i) sub-paragraph (1)(b) shall cease to have effect; and

(i) in sub-paragraph (3)(b), for 32 tonnes ” and “ 32-52 tonnes > that shall
be substituted, respectively, “ 37 tonnes ” and “ 38 tonnes ”;

(d) in paragraph 6—

(i) in sub-paragraph (1), for “ £60 ” there shall be substituted “ £63 ”*;

(ii) in sub-paragraph (2)(a), for “ £100 ” there shall be substituted * £90 ”*;
(iii) in sub-paragraph (2)(b), for “ £130 ” there shall be substituted *“ £115”;
and
(iv) in sub-paragraph (4) for “ £100 ” there shall be substituted “ £90 .
(iv) in sub-paragraph 4, for “ £100 ” there shall be substituted “ £90 ".
(e) in paragraph 7, for “ £80 ” there shall be substituted “ £85 ”*; and
(f) after paragraph 14 there shall be inserted the paragraphs set out below.

BUDGET—SECRET



b

TEEANE TR
4 I 3

ETRL 7oA Oa ITR) seTA AP K_c'-ﬁt-ﬁ}" L ’rm" * 50T mumu.. memmxﬂ

Rl [0 B T T S B T T R E TR L) _'1 Bl Tow M ap nolsavedisg ey guil

? e a - .,
M;‘ﬂi-'h 1‘::5! slsiray W paislasat
E )
il wbhna haiategy N | e wiod oovas guibssues Jou sefanind A
LU L , VRSl Sritkad B cwalsd s ana A SEFAT BES L 2 tnnd,
- I ]
U 18 | o aewdn Sebuliug sen isiptdey £
(191 sy or 2 marogsad w0 11 ytad seon s Tiesan? svolel Jon%
ﬁ?’-iﬁ los z»‘f i Toies .54;:*-5‘.:(1
X
wansaal Ja 1 sasied 1T OF A Shea R s vl ‘fme.'ﬂua TG aelalde 3
el P e gL siiner w0l counsiaige well dsiler 32 SHET
el em De-by i 12758 T 1reed umri hifrovwe bttt nrm.'r mi boyegfla
. Prsis] o o swnod ol d s*f; iy Wi ise
-2 = . we' yavmggnand B wgh AR )
- HT—Tai ettt < ;‘..;h anah bt i TFog-snoR & geilommie 100
(Frg > - vnne) o 30 diun o 1o ssag ve nek £iea

duee . . b Tk 9

- e —— —

St ahagl) Bl s fo 2 m..m._:m i BN has IR0 Yy pink Blen wib &l .'Q
o

.

n i LN = Rl 1) 7 1 e wingerascr-er lun Errefei -,rl' i ol ?‘! - Qﬂﬁr

giraem wo g 2 asver Dagagmp SU07 daae V08 b elnd st oy 5 alohaded B T ARGl &=
~{zalaidev

SR Baipehon el a0 L3 302 (T3] dosngming €. 553
SO0 taetaliviles s Daita oo GOE B T RS by gtee=yy & (03
s |T| g ,isf(;g ;-1
8 1R Sk OF 22 (a2 (ST ‘aqa»“a-f".—fm il
'-iﬁii-'-'l!ﬂl-' ‘u"-'.‘.m"’. L8 P R T ) L | \_|"i = 3] ?i’q.aﬁll“i -l At n.g
" Emeg o haw " enod V2 © pledioste Darpaoied g
—eb g e
e 2R © baap e o Bada cendy O _‘,1‘1 7L L)) 1“{’*’3&-&'&-&"#&{ gy
\371 * Lafiiihedoie il f'm,id a0 "k 0,74 ﬂ‘:s*._nt?:._".‘.')_-r' 5 q,‘; f};',h
{2 Basetuadus o6 flad s " AZEE © sl (8KE Mgmsassan g & 1A
(N
ORE = ey o pade st A0 10350 .ﬁ\_..eacsagdm.nz (e}
SRS T Bedwrtbrn L o Bindy oranly G T oA e ,ﬁq.u';ga._Ls- AT )
-5\;;_'.- ™3 E " g i md s besly TR My N ¥ miﬁf‘-f‘%-ﬁf s!
eled e e eyt oot Sottheal ) 2xifs =xly et ﬂqmamgmﬁ’:s ﬁ)

mm_nma




B BUDGET—SECRET
( 53 )

PARAGRAPHS INSERTED AFTER PARAGRAPH 14 OF SCHEDULE 4 TO AcT OF 1971
AND AcT OF 1972

“ Tractor units having two axles used with semi-trailers having two axles when duty paid
by reference to use with semi-trailers having not less than three axles

14A.—(1) This paragraph applies in any case where—

(@) a vehicle licence has been taken out for a tractor unit having two axles which
is to be used only with semi-trailers with not less than three axles; and

(b) the rate of duty paid on taking out the licence is equal to or exceeds the rate
of duty applicable to a tractor unit having two axles—

(i) which has a plated train weight equal to the maximum laden weight
at which a tractor unit having two axles may lawfully be used in
Great Britain with a semi-trailer with two axles; and

(ii) which is to be used with semi-trailers with not less than two axles.

(2) If, in a case to which this paragraph applies, the tractor unit is used with a
semi-trailer with two axles and, when so used, the laden weight of the tractor unit
and the semi-trailer taken together does not exceed the maximum laden weight
mentioned in sub-paragraph (1)(b)(i) above, the tractor unit shall, when so used, be
taken to be licensed in accordance with the requirements of this Act.

BUDGET—SECRET



i
r

PRRE 3 T 5 B e 5 I I i SRR CEMARARAS
T g = 8 e ST

Dz ol s 2t o Sorktnl vebarslicn M lovs el et fired ariy magRE

snin®s v 1ty sl e wengt A btk BYpr Sl an srrectnfing il
sl e L 2 ERE ebpegimiiny #d1 b A

ity sales oot pwye ! L 5 2t £ wet hoc il frod el stnsoll doktss @
bz 1 e¥ine 20 DT TR S RRT L IT SRR || ST TRTA [T/ PTVRE S P
iy 33 et M= of Ialies o soretAl vl dven puibidns e biling APt Yo st sifh 390
—doman ey grilaad MG sYsad 8 A SidEns giet S
AW SR ST Of -t TRy min T SRy § e g
A pasg wl LT peas plkn ewb i owd file <ot o deada e
Pt nd e oy ol mplhsindaes 4 e pingie® 1k
opiR oy 2! sl dom MHivwe it ivler Do w7 ar d bl o8

£ Bre LSR8 Y it silt it dqunenen «oft didw vt aass & o 3 (@
Fiwe soeem il Yo srigiese astal &) Bawe e Rl Law aches ows dtte olinreines
Mgz yplinl mumiian odi Gwoxs Jon b ediapn pedar yslisdmss el has
oF et ox mebl Nk tani votoudd, it veode (LG dqimazig-in gl hanorignes
204, 80 10 ppsisietime o i st o7 benestlad or neS




BUDGET—SECRET
( 55)

Tractor units having three or more axles used with semi-trailers having only one axle
when duty paid by reference to use with semi-trailers having more than one axle

14B.—(1) This paragraph applies in any case where—

{(a) a vehicle licence has been taken out for a tractor unit baving three or more
axles which is to be used only with semi-trailers with not less than two
axles; and

(b) the rate of duty paid on taking out the licence is equal to or exceeds the
rate of duty applicable to a tractor unit having three or more axles—

(i) which has a plated train weight equal to the maximum laden weight
at which a tractor unit having three or more axles may lawfully be
used in Great Britain with a semi-trailer with a single axle; and

(i) which is to be used with semi-trailers with any number of axles.

(2) If, in a case to which this paragraph applies, the tractor unit is used with a
semi-trailer with a single axle and, when so used, the laden weight of the- tractor unit
and semi-trailer taken together does not exceed the maximum laden weight mentioned
in sub-paragraph (1)(b)(i) above, the tractor unit shall, when so used, be taken to be
licensed in accordance with the requirement of this Act.”

(4) In sections 2(1)(c) of the Act of 1971 and 2(1)(d) of the Act of 1972 (seven day
licences for certain vehicles), for sub-paragraphs (i) and (ii), there shall be substituted—

“() in respect of which duty is chargeable by reference to an annual rate
applicable to haulage vehicles in accordance with the second and third
categories in Part IT of Schedule 3 to this Act or applicable to goods
vehicles in accordance with Schedule 4 to this Act; and

(ii) the unladen weight of which exceeds 11,176-5 kilograms.”.

(5) The provisions set out in this resolution as substituted for provisions of Schedule 4
to the Act of 1972 shall have effect in that Act with the substitution, for any reference
to a plated gross weight or a plated train weight of a reference to, respectively, a relevant
maximum weight and a relevant maximum train weight.

(6) Paragraphs (1) to (4) above apply in relation to licences taken out after 15th March
1983.

BUDGET—SECRET



3
i@
'

ey

ﬁwmwm@mmmm\wm SL I RPOTE DR T TG (K mmﬂ
SRt sor et -t iy ..» '_'bt'n:':""ﬂh tu!i-iw dh!!-;ﬁﬁﬂ’ T

a—andia ey e pdigee dnmpetis MET (1) 851

00y So windl yerred i oSy 9 ) lee i st | e e

oV sl i ?Em il myadimi-l e 1i!ﬂw h{uuhh-_. ﬁ‘mll!_l ||||.L_’|.|,[. ;I:: lh‘
bt i

val sadxs 1o ol et W scheed adr toe e iy Ming (unlln . sy 41
seiparey s b sl aniad e walse! oot Sdeliem dith b v

JW:&HWIM esﬂmhm-m]nuﬂmt-nbim!umml
T s

.. R e St e
ﬁﬂ!ﬂhﬁﬂiﬁ!lmnmﬂ'ulﬁluulﬂlthIE—U‘a-ﬂl

Bl Fe i e g .r-m.-h«n-r e S sl o il il ()
B STnr DRen k5 WNY weRant AW L sprigeoey U dada moske 5 i) 5 (5

Iﬁtl]]ﬁJlnIﬁhIﬂuu-_Iﬁ_lﬂlIL L = T YO PPN fh-.“.f'n-ﬂ.hi—%a:a

ﬁw =il A —llrf‘- TR R="T dllll_ 1 el 12
R u-dllnﬂ'.lﬂl-Ln:-h'.ll-—‘llH_ -:-m-=1;4-rr-ll lﬂ!llilm—‘hn?l

TR L

ity =t SO0 Wi il wils e 1 bum 19T I I-B"— _B |'a= ‘mmmm utit¥
el e s i {1 Sl T il ||_l'll'l'{dm R ET uh[ 1 VRLALYRA ik &wﬂ

a1 s or O ey g0 afdeogteir o vigih dbidw gy R0 A
bt s Bosposs st ey sessiead of. silEise spdtiad uI m ffatn
shooi of sidmllpin o owd pile af £ oslubeah Go (1 eef 2 Ehogati

B M8, <Ul o B st vnbinssasnl saloiss=t

" maztigiil £ T wonoa ainide Yo 1iglss msbaliss =0 il
& glumndd By wmslaonary wol Snmedug S ik 491w fpe t oo 54T (2)
b E o Falt: nrteddami sl f i Ead Knahy ap Taaiin-ooemil-linsle STH] e s als

Yeamrs? 5 it 08 il g B o nliet Yoy o o it sy besteln « of
LNRE StUUMILEES LMRsl=s m fells )= p=2df miaryillecerg

oh€ %1 wedle sy ey sesrecill gn pefiale uivlaes seoss [N o 23 plowrhat® EQ). 3




BUDGET—SECRET
( 57 )
11. Income tax (charge and rates for 1983-84)

That—

(1) Income tax for the year 1983-84 shall be charged at the basic rate of 30 per
cent; and—
(@) in respect of so much of an individual’s total income as exceeds £14,600 at such
higher rates as are specified in the Table below; and

(b) in respect of so much of the investment income included in an individual’s total
income as exceeds £7,100 at the additional rate of 15 per cent.

TABLE

Part of excess

over £14,600 Higher rate
The first £2,600 40 per cent.
The next £4,600 45 per cent.
The next £7,100 50 per cent.
The next £7,100 55 per cent.
The remainder 60 per cent.

(2) Section 24(4) of the Finance Act 1980 (increase of basic rate limit, higher rate
bands and investment income threshold) shall not apply for the year 1983-84.

(3) This Resolution shall not require any change to be made in the amounts deductible
or repayable under section 204 of the Income and Corporation Taxes Act 1970 (pay as
you earn) before 11th May 1983.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.

BUDGET—SECRET



= ¢
1 Ui 28T 10) wirin deim vmﬂ:l.l ol mmwnd 00
_ sl
Bg M Y oew e o te b of lad B0 PO neey Wbl AW stesst (D)
_ = dime g
shse 3o WORSIT sbgecrs 4 omoons b Fleubindthe un T lomiss v B fesminet W4 19)
_ _ bm iwolod 42T 2t il Eaflbisgs s adey mﬁw_!
lacr oInntivilond rm al bobobwrt gl dranizyent oils §o S o8 Ee i (@)
.tl Al g i Shsi .[ﬁ-l'l:lxlﬂrh_l ol E_I'&i__!t!q_ I VTS N
| —
_' 1iaT ]
' st o '
awes wg Ok . L DORES bevih uilT
g g B i DMLDE taoa =d T
. mmwe® L L S BOLYE twn AT
e g 01 b - 000 Ta aun i T
R . " . 3 v ot w17
St dht thinll i chead o smei) DIPT gk censanl sl B (MM Gunas Sy
AB-EACGL 2o ol 5% gheepa deri Himtfil (M enimndt sl nssmisuwo: b vhmed
oflliaubel. Mesus wit at shent =4 o synids g @ Jous {lnaty, it ] sjAL 1)
' W5 XEQ) OTW] S peaaT swliweenell Tmd ihecal adi 1o 507 woliooa whing sidepegs: 1o
FROT b T teiad ol oy
¢ Hottidens® kdy ud i ollduy edd i isonps af 5 2efl S2diiet adandd 2LB DA |
! 23T T otelic m ottt mwdehein] wE sehme joels r(mﬁﬁs evas Misora
i Sl Jod
|
|




BUDGET—SECRET
( 59 )
12. Income tax (personal reliefs)

That—

(1) Section 24(5) of the Finance Act 1980 (increase of personal reliefs) shall not apply
for the year 1983-84.
(2) In section 8 of the Income and Corporation Taxes Act 1970 (personal reliefs)—
(a) in subsection (1)a) (married) for “ £2,445” there shall be substituted “ £2,795 ;
(b) in subsection (1) (b) (single) and (2) (wife’s earned income relief) for “ £1,565
there shall be substituted “ £1,785 ”;

(¢) in subsection (1A) (age allowance) for “ £3,295” and “ £2,070” there shall be
substituted “ £3,755” and ““ £2,360 > respectively;

(d) in subsection (1B) (income limit for age allowance) for “ £6,700 ” there shall be
substituted “ £7,600 .

(3) This Resolution shall not require any change to be made in the amounts deductible
or repayable under section 204 of the Income and Corporation Taxes Act 1970 (pay as
you earn) before 11th May 1983.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.

BUDGET—SECRET



(sl tonned xar omeont 31

wicge Jop Doge (laitsy jaanweg 1o dneyens) (AP 1ob somasl wi= Yo NS ol (1)
ST wenz ) )
- —{dsiley Intweryde) RS dos gaxed dnilengeed Se saroaal sl do 8 poines dl (9)
RERA1 Y hawhprdira o (leale vysedi ©2RE TS aed | Eabyaient] G T T eyiasarin 4l fud
[ MR el Cefivi simnaot Bomas COTY £5Y e 55) (&) (L3 aciestio o (8)
(i st _ &__fﬂeﬂF ol

== rlin e — — it 2t ieacy fla=tx-wpach o
o2 Vol s " OTAEE " baz TENSER T 10l (obdnwnia 6ne) (A)) noireadiiz 6l 15)
LU T IO UL e Sl T £ o gl MRV, (T
=3 linde saslz " OAT84 ° WY (mmewelis sun 198 1B amondl) (51) noiasm of (o)
N TR F el

sleflesiedy agvaass ok of sham of '—:»:'ma:ré.: e a8 Hedr aolistood ol T (B)
38 yag) 050§ fo/ soxu® molsoqa b smmun] sl 3o BT sgijces wsban sldeveyor 30
b= L .'(uﬂ 4 L] llllb}_ Xy ;lb{.

aobiudinail sk it seovmiut aldug wll o Gentesgxs of J¢ Jail bkt vBaued 5t )1 hoky

eanl fo aoHottlnD lanabtiien® o Yo snttlvong 20 teSimu vehs raibonn ovill Dluoe
2001 15h,




BUDGET—SECRET
( 61 )
13. Income tax (widow’s bereavement allowance)

That—

(1) In section 15A of the Income and Corporation Taxes Act 1970 (widow’s
bereavement allowance) for the words “for that year” there shall be substituted the
following paragraphs—

“ (a) for that year of assessment, and

(b) unless she marries again before the beginning of it, for the next following year
of assessment ™.

(2) In section 36(8)(b)(i) of the Finance Act 1976 (deductions which are not
transferable between husband and wife) for the words “ and 14 > there shall be substituted
the words “ 14 and 15A "

(3) Paragraph (1) above has effect in any case where the widow’s bereavement occurred
or occurs in the year 1982-83 or in any subsequent year of assessment and paragraph (2)
above has effect for the year 1983-84 and subsequent years of assessment.

(4) This Resolution shall not require any change to be made in the amounts
deductible or repayable under section 204 of the Income and Corporation Taxes Act 1970
(pay as you earn) before 11th May 1983.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.

BUDGET—SECRET



il

a5

R KA GRS st 1 /o

Al ety

881 kianee

sy emmeyee TR Y . = T
y o, 42 Letol 05 G N OB Rt
| i —— E-dryer . v * T
T Vi ) y T
SrekidbEie o Paste vy i L
e S et b ]
;:u[. v et I el ¥ TG 1 v
l.l-I “ K10 \re " W - - -
- L i, ~

ar iy & '} Rl
7 I [ ' 1] I LAY

P e BT ' . .
‘ ] ), I LT L] ‘.' r'l

‘3.‘. -

et

mfe Nisza nemmend gy
1 s

Wi Zatagpeal s

fal f'\: A= =LA




BUDGET—SECRET
( 63 )
14. Relief for interest (limit for 1983--84)
*“That the limit imposed by paragraph 5 of Schedule 1 to the Finance Act 1974 shall,

subject to any reduction to be made under that paragraph, be £30.000 for the year 1983-84.
1983-84. :

BUDGET—SECRET



TREYAL-TYOGUE

Er )

|
p (53 R e af= et w w5l
Jlasiy 1TR] o8 insat? b T Sintalts® b B ey '{d lypaamran spm|l
AS-88] e Sl WA 073 Wt owwritaract VERE AABet7 Shrtt 361 o) 15 11t v
"W
v

. ! TEE Py OTNGER



BUDGET—SECRET
( 65 )
15. Corporation tax (charge and rate for financial year 1982)

That corporation tax shall be charged for the financial year 1982 at the rate of
52 per cent.

BUDGET—SECRET



TEF T TADET IS

Waret ne

)
{S3%2 wpee lobnenfil 58w Bk st ek astisdomely 21

ORBt oy (Ban e i im PP R g ey =

otan et tm URR! gony Infagen® edy wxh hemisde o Hads xe)y aoses =i

,
LT




BUDGET—SECRET
( 67 )
16. Advance corporation tax (rate for financial year 1983)

That the rate of advance corporation tax for the financial year 1983 shall be three-
sevenths,

BUDGET—SECRET



L)

IERIRE—TIOUTE

£ Vo

(EER L eay lutortemdl 10 =vay} xaz nogosn

sl oF Hada EBRY mige IMsuams el 4nd

LA~

}

avikuir

T ok |
\*-Eia

vin gensvi A B

i sodgvbe o olar odp tadT
.Qlum|5a



BUDGET—SECRET
( 69 )
17. Corporation tax (small companies)

That—
(@) the small companies rate for the financial year 1982 shall be 38 per cent.; and

(b) the fraction by reference to which corporation tax charged on income is reduced
under section 95(2) of the Finance Act 1972 shall for that financial year be

seven two-hundredths.

BUDGET—SECRET



TRROTE-- TRV
I % ¥

I Ay

e B

w ,"H‘.y?( f e

=3 B el
R B .. .
7. molicadees 3 i
iy o
A . - |

TRER-FIPOUR



BUDGET—SECRET
( 71)
18. Assigned life policies and annuity contracts
That charges to income tax may be imposed by provisions about life policies and

annuity contracts the rights conferred by which are or have at any time been assigned for
money or money’s worth.

BUDGET—SECRET



I ! ! - !
{ Woathne 1‘I|I g L'.ﬂll'f:-jﬂdq atu pinguasd  oh
g
“ x a“ 5 !
| —:n_ o AL peide owiaresd 2 Il sl g G S oo ks mET
. “uiln LmexSupey el putv gl s 1 AP s Tpmimalmens piflagy il Wuhinerr Pilamm
T AMISEEE < ity
N
|
|
i
1
I
|




BUDGET—SECRET
( 713 )
19. Benefits in kind

That charges to income tax may be imposed by provisions relating to—
(@) the application of Chapter II of Part IIT of the Finance Act 1976 to scholarship
income;
(b) loans obtained by reason of a person’s employment; and

(¢) dwellings occupied by directors and certain other employees by reason of their
employment.

BUDGET—SECRET



O |
bl mi widioog Wl
<ok gitales wmoisires VI Bsasditit 14 ‘g taestd ol wpets T
qtifht!nﬂsn oj bij.',lz* ind éﬂt_;y_g:ﬂ o Ju BEE P o 11 atgedt ';r_ peilzsilgys M0 ;“_jl

M =] ||
[m M LT LTS TR ST S i ST VST, 'a.d' |= .'.'}.lli_ o Lé‘l

sialy 0 aogse o el 1 o flat e sratendle of Aafipesan walllewl: Va)
T T L



BUDGET—SECRET
C75)
20. Pay as you earn (non-deducted sums)

That charges to income tax may be imposed by provisions relating to tax required to
be ddeucted from a remuneration of directors and employees under section 204 of the
Income and Corporation Taxes Act 1970.

BUDGET—SECRET



—
I
I
I
I
I
I
I

I

1 (3
ﬁgﬁ@‘ 51m“;1||:[-uuu.‘| mun @y wr vt 0l

mm&‘;‘mmmwﬂm kel et o Sesenl sl owity i) gt A st dudT
.l sl Y WD gofiesz elny weo U E 'L-=Jd--rlﬁ;bﬁ-ﬂltn:‘-nmﬂ'm\m;|rduhud'
T poe exg T sabim—remn’l Lae semmen]

IR TRGAER



BUDGET—SECRET
(7))
21. Profit sharing schemes (increase of maximum share appropriation)

That in Chapter III of Part III of the Finance Act 1978 (approved profit sharing
schemes)—

(@) with respect to shares appropriated on or after 6th April 1983, subsections (1)
and (2) of section 58 (shares in excess of initial market value of £1,250) shall
have effect as if for “ £1,250 ' there were substituted  the relevant amount ”;

(b) with effect from 6th April 1983, paragraph 1(4) of Schedule 9 (maximum initial
market value of shares appropriated to one participant yearly) shall have effect as
if for “ £1,250 ” there were substituted  the relevant amount ™; and

(©) “the relevant amount ” referred to in paragraphs (a) and (b) above shall be, in
relation to a participant, an amount which is not less than £1,250 and not
more than £5,000 but which, subject to that, is 10 per cent. of his salary for
the year of assessment in question or the preceding year of assessment,
whichever is the greater; and, for this purpose, a participant’s salary for a year
of assessment shall mean such of the emoluments of the office or employment
by virtue of which he is entitled to participate in the scheme as are liable to be
paid in that year under deduction of tax pursuant to section 204 of the Income
and Corporation Taxes Act 1970 (pay as you earn) after deducting therefrom
amounts included by virtue of Chapter 11 of Part III of the Finance Act 1976
(benefits derived by directors and others from their employment).

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.

BUDGET—SECRET



RO L

Foivals 1fem; brwsel XV pen !l sl % 10 e W 1T i ui fall
1) sttty _FEM iy mhs-vﬂ..-sﬁm-r—r rads uimqmﬂlﬁi(é),
Haagd MR N:I:rlhvuifﬁ'l'n\ lilliz % stmaxs o i) 20 pebues 40 B

Uy ndeesler W1 kataiiindoe Sewe vt C VRS HE & it ¥ e hostlo v

Y v van] ! stermdp® e st ;l;;&mﬁ.um gy A9 mosd tsliy dow (&)

30 clls spad Phsils Agisad m}:ﬂm ity du
o _bms:” ymane Tmuysbes s : - B e
=  gF a0l soele TG Sah i o bk vwoma Jgersis sart f)
;:I’h_jal_-ﬂc':.l! nml ﬂmmmn:ﬂ!ﬁqnmmaﬁ
& ol rates A W Lo mnldum:nrm{ .;ﬁuummnam:wm
3 I TLRESRRYS vy gl WE to Anfewp ol Tm!ﬂ'm
g bl gfew 3 trumpiny i B i R ity st a0

"
- ol r&rﬂnbﬁlhnﬂmﬂiﬂm L‘;nmﬂ LT TPSAVESy )
o o holilll sesy mp smpmwlos i of = bllh\hlrm:ﬂm{ h..mrﬂn-xd
stmenl zabl 3o 502 iniilo of Iumwusg au mm&:mhrﬂ
I prbsdl geireilad o (e oy me '[Il]] ot oA Tim W TTTY
Mlll_:u' S ady 1= 1 omes Il'I":HIJ-bﬂ' % sarils n‘ftﬂﬁmlm afsfin iyl
dinsmrgetigns: shabe ) J-I.I_I.lI.I:lIu.Id.J=—“—'—y’J-| o Gevlasl diasiad)
frmtliem®t wlily 1l tarenagd iy 24y p l-lﬁllb-ﬂb B Jegmni=mh il Al of Bings,
AT e el S Ippleivarl wlt b oncieleom n_tl -L-h.m iy i w.gaem
WHORL 104,

.
PR .
2 T A

il



BUDGET—SECRET
7))
22. Profit sharing schemes and share option schemes (approval)

That provision may be made for varying the conditions for giving approval to, and
withdrawing approval from, schemes under Schedule 9 to the Finance Act 1978 (profit
sharing schemes) and Schedule 10 to the Finance Act 1980 (savings-related share option
schemes).

BUDGET—SECRET



(o 3

oo

amn o favosgae gabvin ot amoititeng o pitnsy 1 siem o8 e nelsivens 23T
HEne) 8026 toh, soasatl adi of ¢ ulihwle® phu scamsdar o layanms auiveusTgliie
noitqo snui2 batalstegnives) U300 A comanl a2 o UL winbadal ban /eirmde T

AU

RERIT-AROMIE



BUDGET—SECRET
( 81 )
23. Group relief

That charges to corporation tax may be imposed by amendments relating to group
relief.

BUDGET—SECRET



{ @)

Titlen QLo

quong o goltalys Aaemhoenn vl leseot o8 e i nolimontis of asgais ”%{e

WA sy gl



BUDGET—SECRET
( 8 )
24. Capital allowances for dwelling-houses let on assured tenancies

That charges to income tax, corporation tax and capital gains tax may be made
by provisions—

(@) restricting allowances to approved bodies which are companies, within the
meaning of the Corporation Tax Acts;

(b) varying the circumstances in which an election can be made under paragraph 4
of Schedule 7 to the Capital Allowances Act 1968, as applied for the purposes
of Schedule 12 to the Finance Act 1982; and

(c) amending the definition of “ capital allowance” in section 34(4) of the Capital
Gains Tax Act 1979 so as to include an allowance under the said Schedule 12.

BUDGET—SECRET



AonEnn hovows i 0o e b giilon ) Wl LTl eSS
maﬂmmmnn;bmwimuqu_d_mﬂ | “' !

A

=N ol e e d8itr olhest BSasipir 0 melimwedin lu.mim#u
% BAGE, ¥w -.hﬂrm—ll'-'.rnimmn '

~ thret rofer o o e e llll]illl-lu_u_mun_ml ,I.t'uflll_’
Eshacrnitg i 3ol Dekyas ds AW A, scmswoll s Moty Al e U efulathg
Mmtm_m.-nuummmm»

A lindoF b by whan :anmu&u 3 ru st o DTN 10l 2ET CibeFD o



BUDGET—SECRET
(8 )
25. Capital gains

That charges to capital gains tax and corporation tax may be imposed by provisions—

(@) repealing sections 6, 8 and 9 of the Capital Gains Tax Act 1979;

(b) relating to the case where a person becomes absolutely entitled to settled property
as against trustees who are neither resident nor ordinarily resident in the United
Kingdom;

(c) relating to the meanings of “ settlement”, “ settlor ” and “ settled property ” for
the purposes of sections 80 to 84 of the Finance Act 1981; and

(d) with respect to disposals after 31st March 1982, enabling elections to be made
that certain holdings of securities of the same class shall be treated as single
assets.

BUDGET—SECRET



:;r.,

——— i — —

bk - FERD g, st S e 11 R wvliom N aeming

II =
..-_.:T Mnmﬁﬂuﬁ-b“lﬂhﬁlm-'h!ﬂhu'nﬁn@ﬁ@_

T IR AT

el Rio) Y g G poemr ok o e T 7o g bifinas S5 asgends wlT
HRL ol T el Dol o ofln B ¥l § D munsonw et fa)

g EE W Bemnm Semylaly mmmmecn W s Peeied e Sl O M
mmﬂlml- et g e e dl-I;j_u_—mmlu.-l.:.i '“

ol g el By vl el i gl st o gy @)

sass




BUDGET—SECRET
( 87 )
26. Capital transfer tax (burden of tax and payment by instalments)

That charges to capital transfer tax may be imposed by provisions relating to—

(@) the burden of capital transfer tax on the value transferred by a chargeable
transfer made on death; and

(b) the payment of tax by instalments.

BUDGET—SECRET



e

' |‘ﬂ }.
(romioan 4r IRanevg s o0 5 ol e = iy Al

] m\hu'ﬁ mfﬁ'u-ru Ipmocpn) et raom way Coipzany |Im;elr, T ,_qﬁcm{-‘, gm

. E — . )
# v E { dr p= 281 sl Dolsies. Lo oebowsd isil |w)
ﬂﬁnﬂg‘ g?‘-;?" UL Armltayn il = o dtrmets ff‘ Sowry gy

Al Mgrlas, ...,‘-i Yol tew |;r:m¢‘=. sl [ér




BUDGET—SECRET
( 8 )

27. Oil taxation (receipts derived from, and expenditure in connection
with, certain assets)

That provision may be made for bringing into charge to petroleum revenue tax
certain sums received or receivable after 30th June 1982 in respect of assets used in
connection with oil fields and for altering the reliefs available for certain expenditure
incurred after that date in connection with such assets.

BUDGET—SECRET



£
'l L 8 )
sodisgece 6F sutgas e oo Lol o saus i O L
(oo s '
I SmEde iwimhovieg o oty ol gEopied Wl o ad wem senbin
18 Tt Woks Wo fodgeer ol VU1 st I M ilindais B e sk oo
VLRSS TR alidlsge wlsher wif anifie'd ol Dt Al s At wiiiosmms
Armeg ook e efioseann = oef] ) wle Somest
I
i

CBEED et TRR I TR



BUDGET—SECRET
( 91 )
28. Oil taxation (abortive exploration expenditure)

That provision may be made for the replacement, with respect to expenditure incurred
after 15th March 1983, of the allowance under section 5 of the Oil Taxation Act 1975
in respect of abortive exploration expenditure and for the recovery of excess allowances
given in respect of such expenditure.

BUDGET—SECRET



{ @y
fyeasilurans mabstahpen wieder anbimas 1O 8%
|| s '"i o k'-:mlm MMy oaymeslgey ol b abus of pam ! aadt
E“? :"-A %JUSFI L I ||.Iﬂ£.'|i vl scameeri B SiiE 1o E35 l!‘ﬂ.ll}ll £ =ity
2 HE: pewgila R.S'am fo t—"—-—-— =l o) D o] S PR B __.LJ-.__r;_s itiads lo f:ﬂﬂ’l it el

mrpnbongany itz Wy posirees m -q,yl,a.



BUDGET—SECRET
( 93 )
29. Relief from tax (incidental and consequential charges)

That it is expedient to authorise any incidental or consequential charges to any duty
or tax (including charges having retrospective effect) which may arise from provisions
designed in general to afford relief from tax.

BUDGET—SECRET )



o
24w

T &)
iﬁg’lﬁﬁ inpasypeass b IEIL[A‘V'I,;:‘!I"!‘I vyl rnnﬂh&fyﬁ s

'{ﬂa’fl a2 g - jeEmsE g o detmebindl wite slvalien . of 1asdteen oF & fug
anwisivas, wen) wim e dalilr vglls syling p=iog RClvall epehldl ﬂm_’ ST A

20w S Dy jEmieen ol haagieah

S : TEGIEETROEIE



BUDGET—SECRET
(95 )
PROCEDURE RESOLUTIONS

PrROCEDURE (INTEREST RATES FOR NATIONAL Loans Funp): That, notwithstanding
anything to the contrary in the practice of the House relating to matters which may be
included in a Finance Bill, any Finance Bill of the present Session may contain provisions
relating to the rates of interest applicable to loans made out of the National Loans Fund.

ProcepurRE (NEw TownN DEVELOPMENT LoaNS): That, notwithstanding anything to
the contrary in the practice of the House relating to matters which may be included in
Finance Bills, any Finance Bill of the present Session may contain provision relating to
the suspension of payments into the National Loans Fund, being payments by way of
repayment of or interest on sums advanced to development corporations for new towns
and the Development Board for Rural Wales.

PROCEDURE (FUTURE TAXATION): That, notwithstanding anything to the contrary in the
practice of the House relating to matters which may be included in Finance Bills, any
Finance Bill of the present Session may contain the following provisions taking effect
in a future year—

(a) provisions imposing charges to corporation tax on companies resident in the
United Kingdom which have interests in certain companies which are not so
resident;

(b) provisions relating to expenditure on the production and acquisition of films,
tapes and discs;

(c) provisions relating to expenditure on teletext receivers and adaptors;

(d) provisions relating to deferment of liability for development land tax by virtue
of section 19A of the Development Land Tax Act 1976;

(e) provisions relating to the surcharge imposed by the National Insurance Surcharge
Act 1976.

BUDGET—SECRET



LR

.

{ % }

R LALERE DI IDOSR

pbeumadeege AT gl s | psliva® A0 SRl ostmrrelh ewersod

oF guiiz Dabter —altug o i w1 of Be sy oS o s o gieifiies
i Mas=ey ol sramy otk B Bl i@ i Il-l-lﬁll.l.l'.d.l.l.l.‘_ﬂll
ol s b laccimed el o e e deet o4 il remveli] L cdrd st o7 gt

g it enn g lasndd @ el lll:l.l.l_t‘u.l-m...ln-'m l-ﬂ:.'l SR - |

& elilont = i dAde sty e il ool i In -hmnm:mq
ay pizaive MENTES) Gamst sk Jetwpe; ] NG "ll 'II-I
Wmumﬂl:—]dbiﬂ = T i ‘h
ot -mull.-nu'lr
.ul.r\?l:u.lﬂlm b ;ai
il ol et wle it ﬂ'it!ﬂn']ﬂb’l‘l-'hlrl‘mnq imfd § stoppase [ axpooly piarn st
e L e | Al = Tt A "I'"ﬂ!ﬂ o sl ﬂk,ﬁ:s:if"-rs"
Fusn Anlisd anobbomg yasepOud ol uikey geo Ty =l e WO smesnie.
~cuine van @ 3
st ni dblon, sinogmee w SEl iy o emads (R SUTIENTERT oY
QAR 5o ool aeiegemes, aletre 4 :l."i‘ﬂrli sl duis  mchgra I:-'m‘_L? e
Assbijiey
Al to peilesen e wolisterd = s il ¢ Rt ol
e et My s

»Retlefllyy o, WSt e o sl 4 o sl ssaleam ()

m.vﬂmhudmuqmibmlfuﬂuum;uzum ol gmusmley ennasscony D
DY 3ok s G} brermegaleen T af. K AR Pt o

oy sumve Gtz G ol Ss i aetoas w48 ) o menleous (<



BUDGET—SECRET
( 97 )
FINANCE [MONEY]: Queen’s Recommendation signified

That, for the purposes of any Act of the present Session relating to finance, it is expedient
to authorise—

(@) any increase in the sums to be issued out of the National Loans Fund with
recourse to the Consolidated Fund which is attributable to any provision of
that Act enabling the Treasury to pay supplements in respect of sums borrowed
on terms set out in the prospectus for Save As You Earn Savings Contracts
(Third Issue) or in the prospectus for Index-Linked National Savings Certificates
Retirement Issue;

(b) provision for suspending payments by way of repayment of or interest on sums—

(i) falling within section 60(a) of the New Towns Act 1981 or borrowed by
the Development Board for Rural Wales under section 9(2)a) of the
Development of Rural Wales Act 1976 for the purposes of the Board’s
function in respect of the development of new towns;

(ii) specified by the Treasury; and
(iii) not exceeding in aggregate £1,250 million;
and for suspending the accrual of interest in respect of such sums.

BUDGET—SECRET



- ey -

Ak, polrlliraeromec S AWawit) [ somanid

M o T BTt of pubisline pareml ey by = o ek T e w9 el 384T
—mmoaling v

2l H‘l’lflmﬂll‘l‘.l‘l‘ﬂ Witk I e Bewiel ok o0 e =0 m = IR TR

To imelens g8 ae AWM 4 (e Dol L e O uilh o

pwnzand aniis o lgﬂrl.ul wag an gy T o0 gulleisis s, )

A e e &

B —— — —

I

- st v Vi 5 o g o gl womreng @il 1 Ak 16)

. ; m : B - o i ; y
Y s S L LR ©
. : : AN - |
' bWy vemr 1o ww'm Paonpen i gua|
: Eng srumessrl == of SliBag G
) smillim (RL1L Mogese of iy 2oa (i
) i oie Fowg Eososend b et o Dz ulis gRibrageus w0l lne




LIRIDAS—LADANA

XXX—D(2)

9 March, 1983

JTEAS—LADANd



-

o
-

(5¥



BUDGET - SECRET

COPY NO

Ve,

BUDGET RESOLUTIONS {A ( '

I attach the semi-final print of the Budget Resolutions.

2. Any comments should reach Parliamentary Counsel (Mr Graham
273-5029) direct please by no later than noon on Monday 14 March.

The fingl print will go to the printers at 4.00 pm that day.

K F MURPHY
FP1
11 March 1983

BUDGET - SECRET






N? 05

BUDGET—SECRET

DRAFT
RESOLUTIONS TO BE MOVED BY
THE CHANCELLOR OF THE
EXCHEQUER

15th MARCH 1983

BUDGET—SECRET



Y8 GAVOM 18 OT 2VOTTIIOZTS |
AHT S0 90114 A2HDY JHT '
AAUOTHIAH 1

| EROL HORAN dizl |

|

i—.

:

Jl




N° 05

BUDGET—SECRET

DRAFT
RESOLUTIONS TO BE MOVED BY
THE CHANCELLOR OF THE
EXCHEQUER

15 MARCH 1983

BUDGET—SECRET



s TR ARG
- Yd dIVOM J9 OT 2MOoITUJOZTH

. SHT 40 SOJJIDVAHRD THT
| AAVOTHDFA

SH0L HINPAL A6

TR s




BUDGET—SECRET
(3)

Mr. Chancellor of the Exchequer
ProvisiONAL CoLLECTION OF TAXES: That pursuant to section 5 of the Provisional

Collection of Taxes Act 1968 provisional statutory effect shall be given to the following
Motions : —

(a) Spirits (Motion No. 2)

(b) Beer (Motion No. 3)

(c) Wine (Motion No. 4)

(d) Made-wine (Motion No. 5)

(e) Cider (Motion No. 6)

(f) Tobacco products (Motion No. 7)

(2) Hydrocarbon oil (Motion No. 10)

(h) Vehicles excise duty (Motion No. 11)

BUDGET—SECRET



o
-
&
-

— 2 e 2 .
88D -

mm&mmnmmmm

Itishatten, bo & moltow W puw B TN i . =7 K Rt VRS E )
!amm?ﬂﬁﬁmg o by c-mct;:-nﬁm R L T S ﬁﬁg

|

| IE 6 mlrohd) sthisd il
. 1. 2% pedsci) 13 (8]
| N & ol fnsostl vl
[ 1 bl gufve-ntnd dnj

S 3120 L
1% 2l v M) whaxhidng swasin F 4

(0 ob pedinl] fin medugyebatt y)
CHE bl sl lehs beiiss 8212400V 1Y)

SR EMER



NN NN S S T O e e R I e e
YRR RERBREBSxIa iSRS

NN
8 %

b A Gl ol i

BUDGET—SECRET

(s5)
ARRANGEMENT OF WAYS AND MEANS RESOLUTIONS

Amendment of the law.

Spirits.

Beer.

Wine.

Made-wine.

Cider.

Tobacco products.

Gaming machine licence duty.

Bingo duty.

Hydrocarbon oil.

Vehicles excise duty.

Income tax (charge and rates for 1983-84).

Income tax (personal reliefs).

Income tax (widows’ bereavement allowance).

Relief for interest (limit for 1983-84).

Corporation tax (charge and rate for financial year 1982).
Advance corporation tax (rate for financial year 1983).
Corporation tax (small companies).

Assigned life policies and annuity contracts.

Benefits in kind (scholarships).

Profit-sharing schemes (increase of maximum share appropriation).
Profit-sharing schemes and share option schemes (approval).
Group relief.

Capital allowances for dwelling-houses let on assured tenancies.
Capital gains.

Capital transfer tax (burden of tax and payment by instalments).

Oil taxation (receipts derived from, and expenditure in connection with, certain
assets).

Oil taxation (abortive exploration expenditure).
Relief from tax (incidental and consequential charges).

BUDGET—SECRET



EREDER - AETaGR
e X
ERA SHNAM GUa AW 10, Ty aiie

el o] dosesmipmand,
&higd 2

el £

iy

niid e i S _:i:

SR S ¥

S ——— U et
.'{mh =rniesal] sl !llilMJ

..—:.“* "_=!'i

W e Jhered

ouly amsyes LY

JAL-IROT o) ey Lebir snals® st 2evrooit]

fetzilon (o iyt pai prwont

AWIRUWLITS Tl Togetilse) S Sirwctil

AWE-L0 illﬂ":r e sl bj]nn, )

.(.HH.E !ﬁ.ﬂ\!:{ﬂ:lll (it ad i fug U.'.l-ll-f'ﬁ LU LTRSS S

Ii-—_-m' Wy ol ol ) Ral eessesr i,
Inlﬂ'l:q‘n'h-u Nl nat B ||||u|r‘r‘u.'_’|

gy il leme mSllegy mil Jremmgia

JendsietSnd ' bald ol wiilaneil

IMWW‘J! drmbeuin 1o EpEE esal ;u_ill dhpalheogs, .
s gy el g sowcly dink it god eelle- S

by Qi

Easiuhnmeel Saal w0l mu ||'I—‘_'||°|'|' ah 123 porananily fer=a2)

wing EHGES

- A“Wﬂ’-ﬁ: iéiéi‘l&n‘ll;ll[ Bt vk b mfouid) xul - uslarun |-_11ri||j
saiiss v apitonnoy g wonihngger bou eeg] Dawines sgis el slhoel
feiuess

Spmittusgrs sofpolyo slped solsnd 5O

eagaats Laituntipaniers It Wlmsbroof) oot sl HisaRy

p E-L00 PSRRI |



BUDGET—SECRET
(7))

1. Amendment of the law

That it is cxpedient to amend the law with respect to the National Debt and the
public revenue and to make further provision in connection with finance; but this
Resolution does not extend to the making of—

(a) any amendment with respect to value added tax so as to provide—
@) for zero-rating or exempting any supply;
[(ii) for refunding any amount of tax;]
(iii) for varying the rate of that tax otherwise than in relation to all supplies
and importations; or

(iv) for any relief other than relief applying to goods of whatever description
or services of whatever description; or

(b) any amendment relating to the surcharge imposed by the National Insurance
Surcharge Act 1976 and applying to some only of the persons by or in respect
of whom the surcharge is payable.

BUDGET—SECRET



8y

{F ¥
wal sdy N ot enA
il e’ selF Lansilloid R L o
elm:udmaﬁmiwm W"MH' muhl-l-l.l-ul"r::rt;::

_ —-'P:l Il'rr Ilﬂ! 1Ill &t Fiveben i0a =ats seriiuior)
olilvone 0 06 @ Fad et sl o rowpas dies ooy g @)

S byquie o guiaguen we gEEp W w10
I'.Pll = |W‘:"I_I'ﬂ'l‘ tl'llh'lTulllwﬂ‘m_li

r L

azlanua e o uabalss 2hs 2 seliiy - —
ol ' m‘rridn;-mmhm
FeAt Tl Mo sboag oy gdeinme dallor ool saiu Jailse ¥l
hﬂwh\muhasimw b
ez laschud® iy wi spradlivess =l ov wnlile: Vit
St o 78 ey 1 b ul ,,mu.uﬂngﬁnamﬂu{mau s )
o w gt Wb wele ig



BUDGET—SECRET

c9)
2. Spirits

That, as from 16th March 1983, the rate of duty specified in section 5 of the Alcoholic
Liquor Duties Act 1979 shall be increased from £14-47 per litre of alcohol in the spirits
to £15:19 per litre of alcohol in the spirits.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
ﬂlould have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
ct 1968.

BUDGET—SECRET



RARDRS--TEDNGE
Ce)

T A

citadasl, i w20 3 2 ae cing st Bactlasas sk %o sl ot X 'ES shoneTA ﬁ“‘)t :nraﬁ o ,ﬁ_.l..,
ghitins o3 oi i_ Za Il R AR Chobi £l & il baessesol of linds SO0 4y ¥ :
y ieleon st 17 lodlanis 3o 01"1 '!‘.‘b" ef-x1% of

soitiduanyy sidy vt fsswind oildue ofi af dguiliegrs oF 9 tad) Daydlooh viduesd af 95 A
snas’ o ﬁ‘)ﬁ%i:u'." tamithrnd edl % aguinlvasy et sabrir Juste wohten cf.fmf 1; il'qﬁg
‘\

- 1 :i-?!

s



BUDGET—SECRET

( 11)
3. Beer
That, as from 16th March, 1983, the rates of duty specified in section 36 of the
Alcoholic Liquor Duties Act 1979 shall be increased—
(@) from £20-40 for each hectolitre to £21-60 for each hectolitre; and
(b) from £0-68 for each additional degree of original gravity exceeding 1030 degrees
to £0-72 for each such additional degree.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.

BUDGET—SECRET



wh
f &% 1}
s saoll L
28 I O nolngs nl labizons wlud N mins ol JOT dacdl B st o ol
— e of s Tt oA st me '] dlatath
ioum epficned wlmess 9T 10 2 2y ot Boacn iU AEY dee 1w
ﬂ:ﬁhw g_tr'drm gy ianlein Yo el lamibihin e o3 Tn & m=1) 18]
' b il [ U TP SRR S [ R
Ehdinesst QHIM fecveend sl af tirabosxs wf 4 oodi el 25 st of 1 GRA
B . T Ay pdfcadl=ly losalsbceafs ; Sa=lis ‘ :
Tk
ARG ~T AU



BUDGET—SECRET
( 13 )
4. Wine

That, as from 16th March 1983, the rates of duty under section 54 of the Alcoholic
iLiquor Duties Act 1979 shall be as follows—

Description of wine Rates of duty
per hectolitre
£
Wine of a strength—
not exceeding 15 per cent 113.00
exceeding 15 but not exceeding 18 per cent ... 145.90
exceeding 18 but not exceeding 22 per cent ... 171.70
exceeding 22 per cent ... 171.70 plus

£15.19 for every 1 per cent or
part of 1 per cent in excess of
22 per cent;

each of the above rates of duty
being, in the case of sparkling
wine, increased by £24.80 per
hectolitre.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes

Act 1968.

BUDGET—SECRET



e

{8t )

.

oniW

§ Seratii gidl

-
SRR S e LT R

g;;_:‘.. =81 vik1 ¥
gl 1o fscll

TERDT--THIATE



BUDGET-—SECRET
(15 )

5. Made-wine

That, as from 16th March 1983, the rates of duty under section 55 of the Alcohelic

Liquor Duties Act 1979 shall be as follows—

Description of made-wine

Rates of duty
per hectolitre

£
Made-wine of a strength—
not exceeding 10 per cent 79.30
exceeding 10 but not exceeding 15 per cent 109.80
exceeding 15 but not exceeding 18 per cent 135.20
135.20 plus

exceeding 18 per cent

£15.19 for every 1 per cent or
part of 1 per cent in excess of
18 per cent;

each of the above rates of duty
being, in the case of sparkling
made-wine, increased by
£11.35 per hectolitre.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution

should have statutory effect under the provisions of the
Act 1968.

BUDGET—SECRET

Provisional Collection of Taxes



f i TR SR e TV

sllslenio «fF Do L3 mostues bl vl In bils) A°
| = LM
10 T
_”i_,_,____ - 2 - .
nt B . I i ]
L] h TR
woan IE, FLS
50, 0SS Wy 4 Trves sk CL.ALY
ig Tty I, :\_JJ -»\- L - -hol-_"]

TR Y0 N1

NIk Vo ansE svods oS! 15 s

sﬂﬂiucn ey s el gaisd
i ,. 3121452 s “'!‘F"vbiﬂ
astilotoed w2 123

moRion Sk s sadi sssmmn erfdi? ol o aaniinnQad of
saxa¥ fo goinslied lsasiiver™ =3 By paudSvery o0 ol Bl

-

T i ol Baraleh o g3l hpd

——(femymim= 11 11s milsv=afiey e

b do— - - ) Pl

G e N | AR Y
1L rreli il e

—— e ——

‘oAl e Miods
G oA



BUDGET—SECRET
(17 )
6. Cider

That, as from 16th March 1983, the rate of duty specified in section 62(1) of the
Alcoholic Liquor Duties Act 1979 shall be increased from £8:16 per hectolitre to £9-69
per hectolitre.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution

should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.

BUDGET—SECRET



. . : .
e — e — T

[P —

m,

T
*:-'yi_%“ h
ok B0 1003 oniben w8 boflibage vt I wtes ol BN0) fospld BE0 awed sa gedT
5y L ) e3ltoied ealy AW sioonY Reaestrand ol Rele O0 o neiadi FOI | albifplidy
Srllsdia] 159
el onca® siaf] Lal)  Ferwsied -||'1("1', = wl i:_ i 2 el Nemnibsl sived o] B Tinf

paen (! o memnuiiln ) frmabmvoss mply Ty i |l Al il wreetiy e i Tefitose
WITL paé



BUDGET—SECRET
¢ 19)
7. Tobacco products

That, as from 18th March 1983, for the Table in Schedule 1 to the Tobacco Products
Duty Act 1979 there shall be substituted the following Table—

“ TABLE
1. Cigarettes ... An amount equal to 21 per cent. of
the retail price plus £21:67 per
thousand cigarettes.
2. Cigars £40-85 per kilogram.
3. Hand-rolling tobacco £35-40 per kilogram.
4. Other smoking tobacco and
chewing tobacco ... £24-95 per kilogram.”

. And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
ﬁlouidgéave statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
ct 1968.

BUDGET—SECRET



FHRER- RS
t ®t ]

Panigey saesdnT §

-_ﬁﬁilﬁnﬂe,bmﬂﬁfr‘ fls ot T ﬂ[di:lf*? ek T bk wed F‘d" f mﬂg M—el or i =+ vd‘!

—ET srealel wlf Eadiris 4|l :d' iz st 255 | <A (JL['T’

T_ll‘.-. 1

H don 11!!1 i€ ov TinE Tmiubie A o - g 147 1 [

= DY sl = Dy wl
s fopsasb

S S T"_‘,[ 28 e st W i T I_ILEI'U
- D [I'I-BT'—_Tr.II o s ff_j — T ey i_ﬂg_; gmm walwiml |

nos m—m’:’.‘f suidame el
“ommngults, my B Alk e - . szaio: snrpin

= ey

padiedorssd ghift Yody Weaatul nildpg mey m,t&’:ﬁu&:"‘ 3l Hsady mametal nrtemeel ol 8 bed
sk 20 20M50ileD JanSleteen'd it By pmeiEAGL, ot Hshol RABy ALy swiln ity

VDY

VHAEFER-THDUDE



BUDGET—SECRET
(21)
8. Gaming machine licence duty

That new provision may be made with respect to gaming machine licence duty.

BUDGET—SECRET



TERUR - THOOUIE
¢ )
Wb sl anuian poice® &

AWiirG sondott selfens gitiaag uf bagash il sbam oSy R gunivesy W

TRRORE—-TROGTR

AT

EEREEN



BUDGET—SECRET
(23 )
9. Bingo duty

That new provision may be made with respect to bingo duty.

BUDGET—SECRET



=
.
|
1
|
L]
. |
he |
|
|
|
|
F
?':..',
A |
.
1
1
1
r.|-

&+

¢ By

pabogsnid W

AEUE DS Of Iosad ARSN ShEm ok v Ko

TR AT--T IO

wsit 384T



BUDGET—SECRET
( 25)
10. Hydrocarbon oil.

That, as from six o’clock in the evening of 15 March 1983, the rates of duty specified
in section 6(1) of the Hydrocarbon Oil Duties Act 1979 shall be increased—

(a) in the case of light oil, from £0-1554 a litre to £0-1630 a litre; and
(b) in the case of heavy oil, from £0-1325 a litre to £0-1382 a litre.
And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution

should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.

BUDGET—SECRET



(&
o dirmfresttghi D

* ' @il Ny <l=euiul Iz 1o e 4=l =i R T | Y
B R ikl 1 o el T T T R
Be eyt o DERT D0 wetl] 8 BT RN ey i 22t B0 sy 2l il £
Sefil & BRAL-00 o il = EER 0 28 emerh Juocorment o mesia oY 8@ Gel)
o v’@;ﬁﬂ.&:ﬂi tall bemaig A!iljﬂ'l'[ mit! Iﬂ-1l_l_Lll'l:l'-||l:- gr e d T brroikah ...*-.3"..-.- o B iagf,
#sneT 7o golionlled) lancitleesT ol 3 mesdiivion O] Aleed Leofly rrofinen "ﬂ’f'ﬂf




BUDGET—SECRET
(27 )

11. Vehicles excise duty.

That the Vehicles (Excise) Act 1971 and the Vehicles (Excise) Act (Northern Ireland)

1972 shall have effect with the amendments set out below.

But this Resolution shall not authorise the making of amendments which would result

in different provisions being in force in different parts of Great Britain.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes

Act 1968.

(1) In the said Acts of 1971 and 1972, for the provisions of Part II of Schedules 1 to §
(annual rates of duty) there shall be substituted the provisions set out below

PROVISIONS SUBSTITUTED FOR PART II OF SCHEDULE 1 TO AcCT OF 1971 AND AcT OF 1972

Description of vehicle

Rate of duty

1. Bicycles and tricycles of which the cylinder capacny of the engme
does not exceed 150 cubic centimetres . .

2. Bicycles of which the cylinder capacity of the engine exceeds 150 cubic
centimetres but does not exceed 250 cubic centimetres; tricycles (other
than those in the foregoing paragraph) and vehicles (other than mowing
machines) with more than three wheels, being tricycles and vehicles neither
constructed nor adapted for use nor used for the carriage of a driver or
passenger e .

3. Bicycles tricyles not in the foregoing paragraphs

£
8.50

17.00
34.00

PROVISIONS SUBSTITUTED FOR PART I OF SCHEDULE 2 TO ACT OF 1971 AND AcCT OF 1972

Description of vehicle Rate of duty

Hackney carriages ... 42.00

with an additional 85p for each
person above 20 (excluding
the driver) for which the
vehicle has seating capacity.

BUDGET—SECRET



TR OO
(2
| S Sl sty 1
(Braterl meutrmbAl o Toian 3 sedastu®® i) fus 1507 ok psliead) s s T
AT el e i brestn ol B Ssatle el Mate TR
| izt MoE dvis shasstantim W gt = shinduy s el aonfued b wi
il ] Lt S et S oSIR 1l e ) o i o el b

| g"m_rﬂ alilk bordr re=nsven sldim wlk o ek a1 el bhiaben eldemnd 2t n puA
. gEnsT Iy asheolloly frmelemy® il 1o idir i b i 1 o018 rrobendi sl Lﬁw
. LS

T % ol mtubald Vo XK e i el a0 S AT Tew 601 1k A, Biaz w21 (1)
vkedd fow b dnmielsoan s bbb sd@ e s yetabs W0ostey L)

ESRE %o Tk cora JTUE 0 2 0A & 1 5 frari il a1 o] O S TTTNT. SEGTRrOd

UYLV THRSTR R T T

- -

ungos wdlt Ba Waceqes wdaltes mir ke 12 bzt buy wpll
oo b= . . RERAseTitr, lhos O | Lot iy coels

Al | Al woelpes =4 ||I'I|'|, T ,'I'Ilrl'l"L? ok e el i '_._.f!:
BT et fFer TR [N s S A 1 P S ey
pitiennT ITE_III Wi Sty faa T||'||.||u| LR IR 1y mtt ST T T
Smeisiany pmbisling Sap LIV prree! 0oea i e el e e Dol
Yo uperiy » oy nguoamsr Wi ipd Dy soe =nnp ol Ezmugalis o Lt B

Lalbe | i - - . u t‘muq

oA P T LT 7 rrel QLT it wll,;z . agh mi_l(:ll_l_ ahwanifl _g

—

EVOF o ok ITe S50 A o S 3N s 1o U TANT S W ISR AR oRs

E e —

| . quhlo sl

| o, 50 ! L ammelies wemdeeH
. Ny lggm"'iiih i | snsisiey vendneH
! o dedw 10t p;wgﬂ‘.’ ﬁ” f
, : _ |

Lo —H——— - —— o ———




BUDGET—SECREF
(29 )

PROVISIONS SUBSTITUTED FOR PART II OF SCHEDULE 3 TO ACT OF 1971 AND AcT OF 1972

Weight unladen of vehicle Rate of duty

I 2. ' 3. 4. 5.
Additional
for each
ton or

Description of vehicle Exceeding Not Initial part of a

exceeding ton in

excess of the
weight in
column 2

£ £
1. Agricultural machines; digging — — 14.00 —
machines; mobile cranes; works
trucks; mowing machines; fisher-
men’s tractors

2. Haulage vehicles, being show- 7% tons 137.00

men’s vehicles 74 tons 8 tons 164.00 —
8 tons 10 tons 193.00 —
10 tons — 193.00 30.00

3. Haulage vehicles not being — 2 tons 163.00 —

showmen’s vehicles 2 tons 4 tons 293.00 —
4 tons 6 tons 424.00 —
6 tons 7% tons 553.00 —
7% tons 8 tons 676.00 —
8 tons 10 tons 676.00 115.00
10 tons — 906.00 130.00

BUDGET—SECRET



BODCEL-ECHEL

e e e i i A 0 - s B i — ——tm . A e
: o 00 F30100
- 1D phLT e T
oo gt 2z 02 R
[ = RSB A acza
¢ g it InEgh -
EPOMITLLY et 8 7 ey | g R -
¥ mearke At s el ~ T e 8500 =
- Pt e - e — B e .
ity e saon
] - LE3 L FEEIRE
BFa, At ey L] e g, tone 100 -
~.$‘ mmﬂr ASPIOES pRUE - 5 e 131000

-me:‘ sioie
;urc;cz‘ womuR WRPTNE et
metpee! wWopie EFNR) MoIp '
T wsucERSy mEELe r::.gq:.?;zﬂ:_: - - : 66

) £ v
a@}f&m
e REE m
SESEze Of 56
sxonegiul oo
frercsIlitions Of Aegc bqE HiEE Bewr oty

- —_—— e —,—

BECNFITHS RUTRIIALED ToE Joulik | & 2 G E 5 AT YO 05 TANT B0 F e 05 )Y



BUDGET—SECRET

( 31)

PROVISIONS SUBSTITUTED FOR PART II oF SCHEDULE 4 To AcCT OF 1971 AND AcT oF 1972

TABLE A

RATES OF DUTY ON RIGID GooDS VEHICLES EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED GROSS WEIGHT

GENERAL RATES

Plated gross weight of vehicle Rate of duty
1. 2. 3. 4, 5.
Exceeding Not Two axle Three axle Four éor more
exceeding vehicle vehicle axle vehicle
tonnes tonnes £ £ £

12 13 410 320 320
13 14 500 320 320
14 15 610 320 320
15 16 670 320 320
16 17 780 320 320
17 18 — 380 320
18 19 — 440 320
19 20 — 500 320
20 21 — 580 320
21 22 — 660 390
22 23 — 740 470
23 24 — 920 560
24 25 — 1,150 660
25 26 — — 770
26 27 — — 880
27 28 — — 1,010
28 29 — — 1,140
29 30 — — 1,500
30 30.49 — — 1,990

BUDGET—SECRET



sixp 2T
Aoy

TR TR
{ I )

sak S IV i & e e T A el T TSRS SndaTitve s
A4 e
R AT e 0N T ' ju [ i niy S | |
e — — e —

e i ¥ E‘"u..::.' Lz "ﬁ'hfﬁ

£ f

qivy oy saki | mmiouexd
e } Hathialxs

B o=seol | oo
i s | r
&1

. [ !: [ GK
££ 5
i | iy
M ! s
56 1%
1 ‘ &5
= ae
- FiiN %
= ¥ . BE
- I . 2
Uh.O I' QK

1




BUDGET—SECRET
( 33 )

TaBLE A(1)

RATES oF DuTy oN RI1GID GOODS VEHICLES EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED GROSS WEIGHT
RATES FOR FARMERS’ GOODS VEHICLES

Plated gross weight of vehicle Rate of duty
1. ! 2. 4, 4, 5,
Exceeding Not | Two axle Three axle Four or more
exceeding vehicle vehicle | axle vehicle
tonnes ' tonnes £ £ £

12 | 13 | 135 120 120
13 14 140 120 120
14 15 145 120. 120
15 16 165 125 120
16 17 180 130 120
17 18 = 135 120
18 19 — 140 120
19 20 — 145 125
20 21 — 150 130
21 22 —_— 155 135
22 23 — 160 140
23 24 — 180 145
24 25 — 210 150
25 26 — — 160
26 27 —_ — 180
27 28 —_ — 200
28 29 — — 215
29 30 — — 275
30 30.49 — — 340

BUDGET—SECRET



Al
[ - .
—_— ——

.:- !
|
-
'I

' -
i
e —— e ——

f % 2

ATEVTTS]

THEEVY QD) GRTALT At T U] svvenim o8 B st 205D afot® Ho S0 sy Bl
PR o) Yasiua | At sk )i

wilb 1n :p(nﬂ ondyy T Loy d100 Lrmiml=)
- ] _.I i I
i
meEne Tl o HeswEtd —xEEEE . == —= bR —
ulnut=e 2lgn sy oty ey

- ! L L3 sl AN
ezl , ou 8] i )
{24 151 L #1 4!
gt I ay EM a1 i
o | 2! al ]
(119 ) [ [ A
et 351 - il W
il Tl - ¢ Z1
391 ' il B uL ol
LA 1) -— 1€ 2
Ly (s - = 15
3 gt 5 3.8
s oo - i &
) s 28 M
Al ' — -— ns s
oy L = i
o, — - = g
FIS . o e g
& ' — - P2 | [0y
O - = as | &

3 L *




BUDGET—SECRET
( 35 )

TABLE A(2)

RATES oF Duty oN RIGID GooDs VEBICLES EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED GROSS WEIGHT
RATES FOR SHOWMEN’S GOODS VEHICLES

Plated gross weight of vehicle Rate of duty
L. . 2. 4. 4. 5
Exceeding Not Two axle | Three axle Four or more
[ exceeding vehicle vehicle axle vehicle
tonnes tonnes £ £ £

12 13 135 120 120
13 14 140 120 120
14 15 145 120 120
15 16 165 125 120
16 17 180 130 120
17 18 — 135 120
18 19 — 140 125
19 20 — 150 130
20 21 — 160 140
21 22 — 165 150
22 23 — 175 160
23 24 — 210 165
24 25 — 250 180
25 26 — — 200
26 27 — — 220
27 28 — —_ 245
28 29 — — 265
29 30 — — 340
30 30.49 — — 430

BUDGET—SECRET



.
& .
P, -y S e

.
i . .
v - T

i, ——p—

A4 -1

SHDEYE 20000 TN ASWIST S1 BT = 2 e W L0l GO0 O ik mm

= - = - S
ST Saoel Samrond 050 srvall

————————— . ] . j———— -

wwlts Tiy wipF) glmnes 5y wipmen ey et

. 1 v -" walyi=
0 | L 9 fi I &
1.8 al ) I L4
B o | S ! i
&L (441 gl i o |
w; g‘l:l ol I
®i (4 41 = i r
el il
ol 2L it
1 031 i
44 28 L
03i LS

FEBRRE
VL RESE
&

B

!
i




BUDGET—SECRET
( 37)

TABLE B

SUPPLEMENTARY RATES oF DuTY oN RiGID GooDs VEHICLES OVER 12 ToNNES USED FOR
DRAWING TRAILERS EXCEEDING 4 TONNES PLATED GROSS WEIGHT

GENERAL RATES

Gross weight of trailer

Duty supplement
Exceeding Not exceeding

tonnes tonnes £
4 8 70

8 10 90

10 12 ' 115

12 14 160

14 — 300

SUPPLEMENTARY RATES oF DUTY ON RIGID Goops VEHICLES OVER 12 TONNES USED FOR
DRAWING TRAILERS EXCEEDING 4 TONNES PLATED GROSS WEIGHT

RATES FOR FARMERS’ GoODS VEHICLES

Gross weight of trailer
Duty supplement
Exceeding Not exceeding

tonnes tonnes £
4 8 70
8 10 90
10 12 115
12 14 160
14 — 300

SUPPLEMENTARY RATES OF DUTY oON RIGID GooDs VEHICLES OVER 12 TONNES USED FOR
DRAWING TRAILERS EXCEEDING 4 TONNES PLATED GRrROSS WEIGHT

RATES FOR SHOWMEN'S GooDS VEHICLES

Gross weight of trailer

Duty supplement
Exceeding Not exceeding

BUDGET—SECRET



xm exzal) asuwmoT 0T rryld 2

PR palal et o B R T VEATHENE 1IN

TOEIE~TEICTH
LIS

L aeu T

Prant W sedieed mrd ] =thides T SIS S s i T SRR

Tinai ™ ik Tr
sl e € = S ———
TSN T Y s vl ]
= 7 Ll - Az
o ) 5
" &
gt LY nj
fed e &
O !
#017 owELt T s L8 Wrer's sl ST’y =l piii 5 el s ?EIL“-?&TMSM‘-
TEnmE renolD) neya i e F opqureme 1 gas oy e T orrrasc]
SN T R apdvey | =04 Bera s

shfierl a ifyEas 'am":.f

JenrEnis UL i e :
|rrT..ha'-.$ % aulh,ﬁ&f
k] 2Dy, I | ag.gfd}
43 2 P
an 1| 3
?:,fi at o
Nzl L1 il
|‘|‘._\:E, — i
ma—— e - ,J._ -

ST a=Rll arindst £ AsUE S awiIFY 2andS 1ol

Zanp? seaal anTs ] 22an T b omagdsest
Y BT B KW eRA Fod enyR i

Yongpiezn el

e e —— A ——— i S— —

i =0 270 A0 20 TAS TENTHEMEITIVE

2s2IAYT onIWARG

a2y 1 ..‘7{3'1' al’.Q!ﬂ)

mi‘rma:s

—— - ——— ———

ghitmsone fobs |

——— b R

TEAINE-T IO



BUDGET—SECRET

( 39)

TaBLE C

RATES OF DUTY ON TRACTOR UNITS EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED TRAIN WEIGHT
AND HAVING ONLY 2 AXLES

GENERAL RATES

Plated train weight of tractor unit Rate of duty
| 2. 3. 4. 5.
For a tractor For a tractor For a tractor

unit to be used | unit to be used | unit to be used

Exceeding Not exceeding | with semi-trailers | only with semi- | only with semi-

with any number | trailers with not | trailers with not

of axles less than two less than three
axles axles

tonnes tonnes £ £ £

12 13 420 420 420
13 14 470 420 420
14 15 510 420 420
15 16 560 420 420
16 17 610 420 420
17 18 660 420 420
18 19 710 420 420
19 20 770 420 420
20 21 830 470 420
21 22 890 520 420
22 23 950 590 420
23 24 1,020 660 420
24 25 1,090 740 420
25 26 1,090 830 500
26 27 1,090 940 590
27 28 1,090 1,040 680
28 29 1,150 1,150 780
29 30 1,390 1,390 890
30 31 1,600 1,600 1,000
31 32 1,820 1,820 1,110
32 32.52 2,290 2,290 1,600
32.52 33 2,290 2,290 1,840
33 34 2,290 2,290 2,140
34 35 2,450 2,450 2,450
35 36 2,610 2,610 2,610
36 37 2,730 2,730 2,730
37 38 2,940 2,940 2,940

BUDGET—SECRET



P

L :
) -y . 5
Y VY N ——

i
s

{ =0
o 2dey

W Y cvrdeamonl 3§ pepwand 2l gosaa R wl ST A0 ko af
s X yauCr weneadl omy

PR Iﬂ—?‘——\l-l-;

Tt & el llnn ssimest o tigees sled bl
o = ——t [—
£ i E . .
[TTE RS T By | =l 1 LEiEeE B B
DHawu ae! Wi Tl |'_ gt =t nf oo [ 1 AT P
e e it S e pliss  prRleielien U bt g 0L gt =yl
bty e ) LR T 1! jmadny T ur g i
il ek Sl x | SN N ol
T el \LLA,
4 Y e EE (YL ]
o ' iy il = Al -~k
{rs Lah Uik &1 12
A 074 18 g | 2F
g{" v EJ' y y L;.' I T'... a!L
T ’ ey , Ty &L 41
e F i h T y 2
e% ) uD L 13 <l
iy 3 fig iR l in | L
HEe i VAL i e } g
s | o . oy : = L i
O | ed 5 | g
EX 1 i LD, &L | i
003, i il ! ikl Ba ' 28
{hel ] by l 15,1 b3 t 9,@,‘
rEX L o UROVY § a8 i 38
o8t H i l L | 2% ! L
ues. i el ML Q8 i &
Wl -f;x._l i tn.'lﬁ} ! i g i r!jg
G T e 8231 3 ; g2
i"‘i""-j:i -1 l'_'.*zi: v 2.8 ! k.
ORE, L S ' SRS e 12,18
'Bﬁiiy [ \ff'.:ig ) 1“_¢|§";: ! ,H: E§|
RN X Wk, i -.'u?_é.l: i o2 '!“a
s | WL ! IEBE of &R
e weed. | mee | \e &t
GpR L I s ; e i £ )5
= - L - -

.
e —— T



BUDGET—SECRET

( 41 )

TaBLE C(1)

RATES or DuUTY ON TRACTOR UNITS EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED TRAIN WEIGHT
AND HAVING ONLY 2 AXLES

RATES FoR FARMERS’ GoODS VEHICLES

Plated train weight of tractor unit Rate of duty
1. 2. . 3. 4, 5.
For a tractor For a tractor For a tractor

unit to be used | unit to be used | unit to be used

Exceeding Not exceeding | with semi-trailers | only with semi- | only with semi-

with any number | trailers with not | trailers with not

of axles less than two less than three
axles axles

tonnes tonnes 5 £ £

12 13 135 135 135
13 14 140 135 135
14 15 145 135 135
15 16 150 135 135
16 17 155 135 135
17 18 160 135 135
18 19 160 135 135
19 20 165 135 135
20 21 170 135 135
21 22 175 140 135
22 23 180 145 135
23 24 190 150 135
24 25 200 155 135
25 26 200 160 135
26 27 200 170 145
27 28 200 180 155
28 29 200 195 160
29 30 235 235 170
30 31 265 265 190
31 32 300 300 210
32 32.52 370 370 295
32.52 33 370 370 340
33 34 395 395 395
34 35 455 455 455
35 36 485 485 485
36 37 505 505 505
37 38 545 545 545

BUDGET—SECRET



SRS HOE IR
=k

gap0 2ot

s s cmvaad anoal $1 meonaren’T ot noroanT we Tkl wr 2sTed

.Im-l‘_.w £ cooml) ptbeadl osd

ST serovhs fhdidnelt s 28

sl o osip huyw ks ho Jrigive man) _.,E_.-E

—— ISEE— C 4 s g 4

FOYRATT 5 yerl) todivane & 220l solnsta e

Pagyy el i iy Laww af o s e =4 g iy

=i At s | -low diet tlma ) | emhicseithw 8w | Antlisalis 169 galbesucd

o dAls eymlesy | TatedBW poslimly  voeleonst 4md o

Goats 1oy Moy oy il seed 22

T ek : esles i
- E - (=50 rafime

L 81 Ly L3 . 0
b i gl 0% e £
£ =h Zpd 21 3
il i UE o &
¥l £il e Tt i
ELE _ AN RU) i i1
an i £1 i &1 | s
A2 e e @ |
s | LE| L = ue
({4 ! th <1 A5 _ iz
25 Y Loyt I :r
2 | 1 (154 | |@=1 3 I =
(<2 ta | | i1 = L 28
R _ o 1 20 7 1o ‘ oA
ah | WL 208 | 13 i &
2 it | e I [ 14 _ =
15T b : 5.4 S 5
U5 (i1 2 I -3 _ &
G By &% : 1! &
e & ¥ AE | & ie
2 e [ Coa RE
g e 1 | Tm i shar
_ET | & LeE . b o
e o i B M
L8k il | 453 74 } il
LA e : [ T i L
0 . Tt | N2 | o L

18



BUDGET—SECRET

( 43 )

TABLE C(2)

RATES OF DuTY ON TRACTOR UNITS EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED TRAIN WEIGHT
AND HAVING ONLY 2 AXLES

RATES FOR SHOWMEN’S GOODS VEHICLES

Plated train weight of tractor unit Rate of duty
1. 2. 3. 4, s.
For a tractor For a tractor For a tractor

unit to be used | unit to be used | unit to be used

Exceeding Not exceeding | with semi-trailers | only with semi- | only with semi-

with any number | trailers with not | trailers with not

of axles less than two less than three
axles axles

tonnes tonnes £ £ (5

12 13 135 135 135
13 14 140 135 135
14 15 145 135 135
15 16 150 135 135
16 17 155 135 135
17 18 160 135 135
18 19 160 135 135
19 20 170 140 135
20 21 180 145 135
21 22 195 155 135
22 23 210 160 145
23 24 220 170 155
24 25 235 180 160
25 26 235 195 170
26 27 235 215 180
27 28 235 230 190
28 29 245 245 205
29 30 295 295 215
30 31 335 335 235
31 32 375 375 255
32 32.52 465 465 365
32.52 33 465 465 425
33 34 490 490 490
34 35 565 565 565
35 36 600 600 600
36 37 625 625 625
37 38 675 675 675

BUDGET-—SECRET



- B
0 zund
AT RIAHT a2 o] $1samsazeil a2l soraaT v wnG w s
a3 R AN DemanH ol
St ¥ aodions wariawid s At A
(jjlt iy wpu st g '!uuh..‘ﬂ ta ?_ilufﬂ'u'f' gt hodadE

= = 4 - = - - -+

stubamit m el torseil = wl SCres] & o

JEEAG el ) 2 | Bl ool Toogun | b w7 ue pag

VO T T el filia o | el eyt gpinkesass K Al dea

s st wsalbived | Jeud e vl | Vet zte, AP

wearatd e el omr el evel wlip i

wdin - |"W.‘iﬁ4 } .
1 5 e bl .34 24 - ""’L;' 1

3 250 i1 L B
E2 el [ b ] fre i3
e d L s £l &
LS| iy s [ (1 .
iy Fit 2 b !
o [ Al o .
Tl ot Qort LUE. él
(] Okl 1 U <
el A r e o 5
21 .- & 3 i | I5
M Ui ne &L -
b7 4 A I i P 2 | [ 59
il at i 2 5
L% 2ty o £ 20
1] 439 £z I3 E
Gt DEE gel 51 =
e BAE FAL ®
£ 2t | oS ! te : €
2ig 2 | FLL £ or
et &t 25t a i
5, &b o 740 &
2B 2% EE EE
bio s i L
L% L% & s

e
o=
g

' %E -1 w@si
]
=

3

wmmr*ram&jg:



BUDGET—SECRET

( 45 )

TaBLE D

RATES OF DUTY ON TRACTOR UNITS EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED TRAIN WEIGHT
AND HAVING 3 orR MORE AXLES

GENERAL RATES

Plated train weight of tractor unit Rate of duty
1. 2. 3. 4, 5.
For a tractor For a tractor For a tractor

unit to be used | unit to be used | unit to be used

Exceeding | Not exceeding | with semi-trailers | only with semi- | only with semi-

with any number | trailers with not | trailers with not

of axles less than two less than three
axles axles

tonnes tonnes £ £ £

12 20 420 420 420
20 21 470 420 420
21 22 520 420 420
22 23 590 420 420
23 24 660 420 420
24 25 740 420 420
25 26 830 420 420
26 27 940 420 420
27 28 1,040 420 420
28 29 1,150 490 420
29 30 1,390 550 420
30 31 1,600 610 420
31 32 1,820 680 420
32 32.52 2,290 920 420
32.52 33 2,290 1,080 420
33 34 2,290 1,350 520
34 35 2,290 1,630 670
35 36 2,290 1,930 790
36 37 2,290 2,240 980
37 38 2,590 2,590 1,180

BUDGET—SECRET



TASIND -THDOIA
-2
O wmpy
punu Nyl e N wmesn | {1 eennmnd okl syral] €D HE D a4TAS
skend, Ta0dt By E oemrhll AN
P D
thih 15 simit ey kg Ju Mpes g napld,
Z J -l I _E _]_ E . |
FTTTIE [ e e pay -
wd i | e o 1 e hul-u:u:y , .
b Tk clemom it iy | rdatime fre | gdlbowss 1M | o
e el o o i poilisyy Dsmaiee= v Ty
werdt il | et mmbe sdd | al i 100 ]
ol '_!‘_q o m_ . ! - . -
‘] . b ' ] vl st -
o , e W [ [ LE
Vb ret, e E ™
A L w2 £ ' 4
0kt | uth (b it 2
ﬁﬁ - 'n'f‘r’ t"E . 12
‘ L O H = ] s | !'I
(EFY i 271 pe 54 | i
! = e wat < | ﬁ
DL (s W | =
Olsr R wil i 1w, '8
| 7Y i nlu l ey y.- o
" nex | i} AT 13 ;]E
. i .ﬂﬂ | m .t!‘ n .
o ey U2 oy i 26
e b i) ; | w it
. . 'E@ . -'-E-EJ l [htg - ﬁ g
: i B S AR . S - S
Rt w2 2 [ wes I o

ASERZ—-TAXE



BUDGET—SECRET

( 47 )

TasLE D(1)

RATES oF DuTy oN TRACTOR UNITS EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED TRAIN WEIGHT
AND HAVING 3 OR MORE AXLES

RATES FOR FARMERS’ GOODS VEHICLES

I

. . o

Plated train weight of tractor unit !
|

Rate of duty

1z 2. ; 3. 4, 5.
For a tractor For a tractor For a tractor

unit to be used | unit to be used | unit to be used

Exceeding Not exceeding | with semi-trailers | only with semi- | only with semi-

with any number | trailers with not | trailers with not

of axles less than two less than three
axles axles

tonnes tonnes £ £ £

12 20 135 135 135
20 21 135 135 135
21 22 140 135 135
22 23 145 135 135
23 24 150 135 135
24 25 155 135 135
25 26 160 140 135
26 27 170 150 135
27 28 180 160 145
28 29 195 170 155
29 30 235 190 165
30 31 265 205 185
31 32 300 225 205
32 32.52 370 300 220
32.52 33 370 355 220
33 34 445 445 270
34 35 535 535 350
35 36 635 635 410
36 37 740 740 510
37 38 855 855 615

BUDGET—SECRET



0wy
wanch 3wl me 1 purandf e
Sal sV Rl EmUaL] hod HuIes

(il o ol st frarwreh e nilyfew nore Hedpld

] - -

X J ! i 1 i ' T
] 5 [

=

[—"_

WD s, waben #we 0 oeen sl
B o8 on dimne Dot w] on ol Dot w b e |
Syt £U05 () | e e gl enelounn e | e i gt

.uj_.’l. _|I ],u,u_l" m mTgy=s  wEam l_||I| ]
sarmili ors=tl el , el el sl b :
= , [ETERS :
2 ! h 3 | -un‘ﬁu U el
| : fiv &1 i il
" Jrl ll—' RN f 1
krg s pikg, , " =
Fﬂ A 4l I 34 2
Ej £ 1B s T
£ i - [ 8
E2] I b, | = 2
IEL Ui T Lo =
Eel 1 il i =1 s
| . Ol " . | 14
1 frol e | n . ™
RE1 i S : i1 (=
ge ne i IwiE p I (LS
i Tl [ iz o o
= AL : o . e LY
e S T Xnp Ak A
3 i LA [ H %
0L S | ia e : o3 =
E;'!* I!I m | '?é ﬂ& .
L E ; LA TAs L x

i
!
I
|
|
I
}
J
:




BUDGET—SECRET
( 49 )

TABLE D(2)

RATES oF DuTY oN TRACTOR UNITS EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED TRAIN WEIGHT
AND HAVING 3 OR MORE AXLES

RATES FOR SHOWMEN’S GOODS VEHICLES

Plated train weight of tractor unit Rate of duty
1. 2. 3. 4, 5.
For a tractor For a tractor For a tractor

unit to be used | unit to be used | unit to be used

Exceeding Not exceeding | with semi-trailers| only with semi- | only with semi-

with any number | trailers with not | trailers with not

of axles less than two less than three
axles axles

tonnes tonnes £ £ £

12 18 135 135 135
18 19 135 135 135
19 20 140 140 135
20 21 145 145 135
21 22 155 150 135
22 23 160 155 135
23 24 170 160 135
24 25 180 160 145
25 26 195 170 155
26 27 210 180 160
27 28 230 200 170
28 29 245 215 190
29 30 295 235 205
30 31 335 255 230
31 32 375 280 250
32 32.52 465 375 275
32.52 33 465 440 275
33 34 550 550 335
34 35 665 665 435
35 36 790 790 515
36 37 915 915 635
37 38 1,060 1,060 765

NOoTE: In their application to the Act of 1972, the preceding Tables shall be read as if references
to plated gross weights or plated train weights were references to relevant maximum weights
or relevant maximum train weights.

BUDGET—SECRET



|

" e I % !
Ol whra
i My AT arvaadd -:;mﬂl & aerind e el mufmmyﬁ mm&j
“JLI- Eadd o £ eyl ow.
I ’lU':LlJ umﬁ SIEE Ty o e
YRS Nie Sai Sig T 1 rdgiew ol bolais
I
-;: l -‘h. i '- -& A v !

& R N T T G :

bul.h ) o By (EERl A 5 irrul S ol 4 Tinm _ :
lgrse O wiug. | chEp L i ar=ligur - by emileears 1ol aniberd
on e melien | dadnes coslbeg | rodlioe: (T it

Sl ey peel | GVl St dadl PR RO
Sl diw
1 ! E 1 ' ey el
L4 aEi [ R 2l 2)
&y s ' 1% ar
it it bt | (¥, Qi
3t Zhi eed 15 | o
il 1 L s I
g 2£] (i | . e 1 £
ey e Lo [ S Ee
e O R & Ty
A I o7 | y| w (7§
it i ! oL ! 2 2%
9 (s 1 =9 { B 8
Rt '_ L. B o ®
S - S = 1 8
ek as :
0LL ont 44 _ i{% it
%2 £r TS SE
e ek i i EE .88
5 Q2| ® |
in 23 1 iy RE £
A EA 1 L5 : Ly : ot ] 2F
3 Ei _ Zih ‘ 2ia T 28
aar J fndd | 1501 g II; XE
- ; I i :
' mma‘t::‘ﬁmbmwhmﬁ ' -an‘i‘g.mwm antl S0 Yo dadk ol vd vaiads ol 2an0l
grlele nmrixant foavslar 0! et siew rilpiswr nimd bl T lmgbw Liatsig o
shlgtew qim nmuﬂm awdisn e
TEIDAE-TESGIE



BUDGET—SECRET
( 51)

PROVISIONS SUBSTITUTED FOR PART II OF SCHEDULE 5 TO ACT OF 1971 AND AcT OF 1972

Description of vehicle

Rate of duty

1. Vehicles not exceeding seven horse-power, if registered under the |
Roads Act 1920 for the first time before 1st January 1947 60.00

i £
|
|

2. Vehicles not included above ... ‘ 85.00

(2) In the said Acts of 1971 and 1972, in subsection (5) of section 16 (trade licences),
including that subsection as set out in paragraph 12 of Part I of Schedule 7, for “ £40”
and “ £8 ” there shall be substituted, respectively, < £42  and “ £8-50 .

(3) In Part I of Schedule 4 to the Acts of 1971 and 1972 (annual rates of duty on goods
vehicles)—
(a) in paragraph 1(1), for “ £170 ” there shall be substituted “ £150 ”;
(b) in paragraph 2, for “ £360  there shall be substituted * £320 ”*;

(¢) in paragraph 5(3)(d), for “ 32 tonnes ” and “ 32-52 tonnes ” there shall be substi-
tuted, respectively, “ 37 tonnes ” and ““ 38 tonnes ”;

(d) in paragraph 6—
(i) in sub-paragraph (1), for ““ £60 ** there shall be substituted ““ £63 *;
(i) in sub-paragraph (2)(a), for “ £100 ” there shall be substituted “ £90 ”;
(iii) in sub-paragraph 2(b), for “ £130 ” there shall be substituted “ £115” and
(iv) in sub-paragraph 4, for “ £100 > there shall be substituted “ £90 .
(e) in paragraph 7, for “ £80  there shall be substituted “ £85 ”; and
(f) after paragraph 14 there shall be inserted the paragraphs set out below.

PARAGRAPHS INSERTED AFTER PARAGRAPH 14 OF SCHEDULE 4 TO ACT OF 1971
AND ACT OF 1972

“ Tractor units having two axles used with semi-trailers having two axles when duty paid
by reference to use with semi-trailers having not less than three axles

14A.—(1) This paragraph applies in any case where—

(a) a vehicle licence has been taken out for a tractor unit having two axles which is
to be used only with semi-trailers with not less than three axles; and

(b) the rate of duty paid on taking out the licence is equal to or exceeds the rate of
duty applicable to a tractor unit having two axles—

(i) which has a plated train weight equal to the maximum laden weight at
whicli a tractor unit having two axles may lawfully be used in Great Britain
with a semi-trailer with two axles; and

(ii) which is to be used with semi-trailers with not less than two axles.

(2) If, in a case to which this paragraph applies, the tractor unit is used with a semi-
trailer with two axles and, when so used, the laden weight of the tractor unit and the
semi-trailer taken together does not exceed the maximum laden weight mentioned in sub-
paragraph (1)(b) (i) above, the tractor unit shall, when so used, be taken to be licensed in
accordance with the requirements of this Act.

BUDGET—SECRET



—

()
ET0] atr 0N ook 27T go wmndl of Tk H Fra Wlmum mm
i I — — -
% 1wl e ¥ ne, st
. el ebvmil Jerevdisien i r—_ Fecniofinl  finfroy g;.gh'y,'_ o =mbuyipsy 1]
o Ml gagiamad ) <o L Wit e el e U‘-l" A abeo
(28 - . _ =ctias bedenbiind fum ?E'f:l]'lh&v g
Enomill 24 -u AL mee o (81 diemgur @ SVUE Bion FORE A0 89K h.,;_ it u; 53
(3 * i slnfsui 1o | } tald e 5 o IIIIJ'_I P TI “m ;.‘.2:1- Ula!-"ﬁi
DE-FE= S B2 TI'-'L'\"!;.JI et Ej'&ﬂi‘f’ :ﬁ ]16“ f‘,-,zdj‘ bu]ﬂ«
S e 6h b s ot 1 twin P heatd muls gz b slgherBd In | ret o ()
-(twia :»p
ol = Tl P AL £ il sl OV TR A2 ,,'.J‘ fabigeeg m (o)
§ 15 tofiisiun o Jinde covely ** UER * 2e0y € S naravesres ui L4)
timSory Wi il ==y = pm i L Shal, M Aimmmey 2B = "‘fci: gt syaeg A €]
H 1LY ¥ Lo 117 T _,u,llg._'.' [ q-,_,n_r_..__w‘ Lﬁ_ﬁ,‘
- “'r'l' "L'].JJ thh
LUes ™ hoilimdne of thmd el g RRU IS il 2t 110
== 1 - -—I>1I!IJfa_i1 I -|_‘c b} T TN - '|.'. v ]I}I”' IL“&-“I”I S 51.1 |J”J
bn " AFIS T hehmitwlon o thiode sadt M GELEY 25 SSHE shpamper g 22 (U5}
| i ] vuansoynndl alp 2pedy ™ D01Y 7 g2l Edns 151.-‘-! i 1 1) N

e

lsmd .7 O " bt bt o Ulwahe sy ™ (G0 _; ,ﬁl v .%l.mgmw ol )
s o0 Zvw udneigneng and essesin 3 f-ll::!_it!-"h'!? #1 fqa-*gmsq s (B

AN I R W ralt JWJ:&"&»W Ul sersdoann [ BV GETHEZON] EEanpasay
LS00 35 T

A

t-'-‘!ﬁﬂ, s tatin i s pabnad e it rhas Bt Beksy wodieny LU g a'ﬁi\ At 'ﬂ“ﬂ?&““ e
TN BT Y LIS T SR AT R Aaes S st uY thaenstea sl

i e T 8 mHURL NTESeg AN (- A

2T doade) ped zod gunesl Wiy o (7)
?m i T‘r*s&.-:--;..- o 2B i Seze ad or

>

- A
£ 00 s RY Gadras gl stane
ittt el Menils r__'! il

B gtz aft ebdanis oy ot T & eoepeltil 35 Sig l;r;,;fl 5D _J;;--l ~zinh iu;a:ﬁ orth (ﬁ\'

— =tk e gitived N ST 2 oY sidzotizon yub
i }J_I\.;;':,'n‘ Y aEl mumizgesr ol o L[ ‘I_I-—\'!—-'-' 1a=er ‘_“r;.'— q an é,‘mw 1';1.
mligthast peeriie ottt ol e lari T ded § nnr—'..r. TRy 'wJ..d.ﬂ & i
itA fedin o g —'!\Tl."'?-.}.fsr—‘ﬂ dile
cmbiex st il E sl ton Ko d w15 ghaie Plomun w20 v 29 2 fw 1

ofilng i Wi B ot e mses wiy asllgny dlaensing wbs dibde e saex = gl 02 0D
=nb bsen e wdosit e Ty Hl‘allw ol =t |“|.:n' e Ele UG A W) B 'vv--tujj'
e 23 Lo lieess Yy SEE PAYRTS wf] [oeens o e i) csAse tolimtdmed
gt Bskamad o ol anket od f il -j L.ﬁfw ?uu[u v wizgd wly syndi () ’.'- i: 1y g
32X U810 dnmm.'f.ap--'r it il i Suazirangi

NREZFR--TRoNi=2

.

anl
wur iy




BUDGET—SECRET
(53)

Tractor units having three or more axles used with semi-trailers having only one axle
when duty paid by reference to use with semi-trailers having more than one axle

14B.—(1) This paragraph applies in any case where—
(a) a vehicle licence has been taken out for a tractor unit having three or more axles
which is to be used only with semi-trailers with not less than two axles; and

(b) the rate of duty paid on taking out the licence is equal to or exceeds the rate of
duty applicable to a tractor unit having three or more axles—

(i) which has a plated train weight equal to the maximum laden weight at

which a tractor unit having three or more axles may lawfully be used in
Great Britain with a semi-trailer with a single axle; and

(i) which is to be used with semi-trailers with any number of axles.

(2) If, in a case to which this paragraph applies, the tractor unit is used with a semi-
trailer with a single axle and, when so used, the laden weight of the tractor unit and
semi-trailer taken together does not exceed the maximum laden weight mentioned in sub-
paragraph (1)(b)(i) above, the tractor unit shall, when so used, be taken to be licensed in
accordance with the requirements of this Act.”

(4) In sections 2(1)(c) of the Act of 1971 and 2(1)(d) of the Act of 1972 (seven day
licences for certain vehicles), for sub-paragraphs (i) and (ii), there shall be substituted—

“ (1) in respect of which duty is chargeable by reference to an annual rate
applicable to haulage vehicles in accordance with the second and third
categories in Part II of Schedule 3 to this Act or applicable to goods
vehicles in accordance with Schedule 4 to this Act; and

(ii) the unladen weight of which exceeds 11,176-5 kilograms.”.
(5) Paragraphs (1) to (4) above apply in relation to licences taken out after 15th March
983.

BUDGET—SECRET



(B’

ﬂlmmn':ﬂ&ghuﬂl\»%hﬂuﬂhﬂ !mﬁlﬁ,mmﬂrﬂj

e e sy Grem pebooe peslisgin A e Mrwﬁw &am t‘lhhaﬁw-

—sealler Sees wiie 7 st sy bl (i el
gelae rrmn o okl dgsbiresl dhvme wsfdlert o A0 TR dielst ot cadl sun gﬂ:,,!.{é.&?n (ol
0 TN ST R i Jg R e et AT L w119 2 Sl
I s ol bboooss o o o sl silk oy l;ngrbh-‘rn!-mbm.;dnﬁj
i ] 1 pfi v i 8 o SRl ek
S riigiew dodill amdeixon odE ol loopn ltfq;llu- Sttt fninir; % ol abidw )
Bl bt S0 Jifhwal AT SO ot A vkl oo N el 2w

heling o pmelimy ) s R 'HH"‘BH-—E l!:!i?'.-ra ’1‘1 "fu: i!:lt{@ g}
el Al B o H'IH-*-—I Eri sellpeiic Mepmaeeros Gl4M flohise e s wnl N0
D poy wues b o obgher wobel ol Bos 1 coulsy ..u;@luﬂgﬂa,:wiw-u.m
ater’ ol Sesrodremere Tobplose o Sl frereeen St Bawossy e e 0E o gl i en-las-

i ool o o inddet of e 4 malen Jiadhh Vets i ol 5 (8 Jrsqnm
T .u.'-,li.u.‘lmlumumfu.um iKJﬂ

ll:f‘ﬂlﬂm—thlu-llhmhﬂﬁlmth} io A e
= trritimben s Varks ‘I'I_'r.lll,l e ot ‘ﬂ'[l‘l‘liiTl'I:Hfln’ﬁ ,(mlrwma rr'll:Iu:giﬂ

stwa beomomm a0 gl ;i eldamiars u Wi LL.I!W '.'Illl.'l"{l_l ulm
e e s o 7 it o B o el
o 0 Jugly pn gin el L
B 2ty s ot I'-—ulnhaﬂr et ezl 2w nlmdg:

= pmyenflat 401 04 E pheeien dande e 1ifijiear peibelamy wll 15

b gerd made s asoler wecvrdl o Taats ol g seode 1R e 01 iR [gw

B
3



BUDGET—SECRET
( 5 )
12. Income tax (charge and rates for 1983-84)

That—
(1) Income tax for the year 1983-84 shall be charged at the basic rate of [30] per
cent; and—

(@) in respect of so much of an individual’s total income as exceeds £ at such
higher rates as are specified in the Table below; and

(b) in respect of so much of the investment income included in an individual’s total

income as exceeds £ at the additional rate of 15 per cent.
TABLE

Part of excess

over £ Higher rate
The first £ 40 per cent.
The next £ 45 per cent.
The next £ 50 per cent.
The next £ 55 per cent.
The remainder 60 per cent.

[(2) Section 24(4) of the Finance Act 1980 (increase of basic rate limit, higher rate
bands and investment income threshold) shall not apply for the year 1983-84.]

(3) This Resolution shall not require any change to be made in the amounts deductible
or repayable under section 204 of the Income and Corporation Taxes Act 1970 (pay as
you earn) before 4th May 1983.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes

Act 1968.

BUDGET—SECRET



- B
L

“

oREoy

R e S RO,

— 11"

e [09) 3o 30m clesd o). 12 bopivla ol Uik SO rese ot il s sl {f)

o ]

iz 3o 4 e w sl Intes el el me Yo e o e baedqest o e

bax

poelined W 0 =7 Tty vom s wadds soigldl

Lt TRt o bty s el e i B nr e b Vet £1 00
Anen wen B sty temwdlilin oD 0 D eemms e i)

oy,
A v b
it 3=y El-
e g 2
== e 22

e =]

.

=

.
(]

rade

Al
s Yo
e
e W 2 suil 7T

= o - .5 3 =t =]
- 1 1 = = =

. y Y trm =T
wwrl i wia rﬂfﬂlilm lﬂt

abrr owfinl imll e sbusd da e I wd ey e B s
[3-E891 vy ol v !“'c.;lhm 1itmn mlﬁt'ﬁliﬂhmﬂ:ﬂlunj tuth [S"‘l-i

Sidticubal tmeesie wir ol stomeet o

o e Sop el sl ® il (T

augngy 0L o el B Uil ! B 3o S moltems i sidireanrr m

B0 gy afph ol (v Ao

poiiuton® sidl mlmi.udu:uat Ui gt o 4 Joil mglosdy bsend of 57 WA

st Yo nibos

wrsaioi] wlf pisy Relly vutiiae wgﬂm



BUDGET—SECRET
( 57 )
13. Income tax (personal reliefs)

That—

[(1) Section 24(5) of the Finance Act 1980 (increase of personal reliefs) shall not apply
for the year 1983-84.]
(2) In section 8 of the Income and Corporation Taxes Act 1970 (personal reliefs)—
(a) in subsection (1)(a) (married) for “ £2,445 > there shall be substituted “ £ tied
(b) in subsection (1) (b) (single) and (2) (wife’s earned income relief) for “ £1,565 >
there shall be substituted “ £
(¢) in subsection (1A) (age allowance) for “£3,295” and “£2,070” there shall be
substituted “ £ ”and “£ ” respectively;
(d) in subsection (1B) (mcome limit for age allowance) for “ £6,700 ” there shall be
substituted “ £

(3) This Resolution shall not require any change to be made in the amounts deductible
or repayable under section 204 of the Income and Corporation Taxes Act 1970 (pay as
you earn) before 4th May 1983.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.

BUDGET—SECRET



TEE V5 rIOaUR
O )
ialallo Lmansg) wos ameons 0
e

| R ey iy 0}
—<raifur Dompuy) 0721 sud syt modiunnmpets b aomocnnd ol o B wedioow g} (£
P A% DeprDislom W e, renlp M RRRIT T o0d (ledresads GaFL T smlseetien nl fa)
ESENG " wi} Chaiay sioend femo = pifivel £5) hurw dulgin) $4) () el ul 143
- = B e S Rt B e e R ] T e ]

of Hade oxsdy YO0 D0 lave AR N aa] | ' ' | amaredar g 1%,
o R S e 9 4l 7
wi Hale auniy < 00880 * 3 fumsmily gzn ) edl yronoal) (501} et ol ()

o 3 bt
sttt avroae sl of shees of Wl el van m,nﬂlﬂ_umd.—.ﬂ.u'ﬁ (&
‘mw PN 28 2T BelbisegrdD i stronl wlt T witan Tebinn SWavepa T

' LART warh i eos) (e o

= Taloan sl Jealt Bisvatl :!F-I-; TR g o | B | I P huA
2T o polizallnD bapsldrn® o) e uu@:‘i-xhh wluusﬁ! Ve _mrq:m




BUDGET—SECRET
( 59 )
14. Income tax (widow’s bereavement allowance)

That—

(1) In section 15A of the Income and Corporation Taxes Act 1970 (widow’s
bereavement allowance) for the words “for that year” there shall be substituted the
following paragraphs—

“(a) for that year of assessment, and

(b) unless she marries again before the beginning of it, for the next following year
of assessment ”.

(2) In section 36(8)(b)(i) of the Finance Act 1976 (deductions which are not
transferable between husband and wife) for the words “ and 14 ” shall be substituted the
words “ 14 and 15A ™,

(3) Paragraph (1) above has the effect in any case where the widow’s bereavement
occurred or occurs in the year 1982-83 or in any subsequent year of assessment and
paragraph (2) above has effect for the year 1983-84 and subsequent years of assessment.

(4) This Resolution shall not require any change to be made in the amounts
deductible or repayable under section 204 of the Income and Corporation Taxes Act 1970
(pay as you earn) before [4th May 1983].

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.

BUDGET—SECRET



I M - = -

——

eswadis sy g weslaw) 233 okl Al

=) “' . . - I
S R e gt m-"“"
-llulrl-mﬁn-fh

By Smeswcnnd D teey 4t ool T

“Mhﬂl"ﬂ.ﬂ‘mﬂlmlu-nl“u‘hihl il
_h

tor m SslEe mlbsulesl! TR B4 l'-'il. witt T HEANBE s ||:I (i3]
el peumSme w¥ Tl " a0 pey * mnuﬂrm*rm
-ll'ﬂlﬂ

popmoumeel y'wemmy sy ptay s pus ul oy '-Im[uﬂq. T
(s e s dmrpescdee wlﬁlﬂﬂmﬂrﬂhﬂ sl £ Hpeheg
atmmomm edt nb dbem od o egnads s ol . Hmle ‘snifeliesl w0l O0Y
LY o fwea] sl 1 T Sewinr} dal] Jo 100 meifi=ow oW r 8 siaTroei=st
M|l|-|||p. LORLISS Lmp Ao et

uﬁubﬂdﬁuﬂwqﬂﬂ_ﬂ-n:ﬂqqugﬂ;m#ﬂ -lﬂl-r'

T 0wkt [ b sty 2ofls smmaly sy



BUDGET—SECRET
( 61 )
15. Relief for interest (limit for 1983-84)

That the limit imposed by paragraph 5 of Schedule 1 to the Finance Act 1974 shall,
subject to any reduction to be made under that paragraph, be [£25,000] for the year
1983-84.

BUDGET—SECRET






BUDGET—SECRET
( 63 )
16. Corporation tax (charge and rate for financial year 1982)

That corporation tax shall be charged for the financial year 1982 at the rate of
52 per cent.

BUDGET—SECRET



TEROH~THOUUER

£ 9

(§271 =sy fot

So gter wit dg L8] masy [odn

s o g - -
AT SR el

By sid 1o 2

"35-: e sy Turk ey f,l. A '-':'r."“':‘-.':“



BUDGET—SECRET
( 65 )
17. Advance corporation tax (rate for financial year 1983)

That the rate of advance corporation tax for the financial year 1983 shall be three-
sevenths.

BUDGET—SECRET



el ad de

Ni

TERS-- T
Tl

(ENRT sy fastineal ok Jiyl Tall i

EERE Teag MEREES 3 nl ot T

TERDEE--THIaE

g ot LN

=

AMiavras



BUDGET—SECRET
( 67 )
18. Corporation tax (small companies)

That—
(@) the small companies rate for the financial year 1982 shall be 38 per cent.; and

(b) the fraction by reference to which corporation tax charged on income is reduced
under section 95(2) of the Finance Act 1972 shall for that financial year be

seven two-hundredths.

BUDGET—SECRET



TEETE-ZIRGUE
£ 2 )
Tzsdnagueos dmn ver sies PR3 Bi
—

e Liowy e KE od lade $4

bagwhar o ssoant oo Begsads s o
o oy leitnaed mdl 3o O

S

ul’

)

S ESsAeR ot 1) At Selimegmoo Hatos o) (o)

T v SN0 81 donsialm vd aniet ol ()

e
5 C500 A aueamT oy Yo (D020 geleaus zabiiny

sdfbanbaudi ot novse

TREDRE--TED UGS

ady



BUDGET—SECRET
( 69 )
19. Assigned life policies and annuity contracts

That charges to income tax may be imposed by provisions about life policies and
annuity contracts, the rights conferred by which are or have at any time been assigned for
money or money’s worth.

BUDGET—SECRET



rﬁg't

s=astiiun plittms L #ivis St heilgind

Lk alciog —F-mmmﬂwrvdw-ﬁ W opnim A Yo o vt ST
a0 Bymuiios Eved song YR i :w LJER d;g w h}uw'p: u-n- x myly JOERTIIR vinng
frvaw o 1:|'I||'I'I;‘I|l'f!m




BUDGET—SECRET
(71 )
20. Benefits in kind (scholarships)

That provision may be made in relation to the application of Chapter II of Part III of
the Finance Act 1976 to scholarship income.

BUDGET—SECRET



i 1

(et tama 80 #lisl LS

3o Fo1 ool do M) b aeilicsllongn 5ol oo st ok s o it oweeive sy a8y
rrscind gifEnind=— e Jad :umnlﬂl

TR TEOUIR



BUDGET—SECRET
( 713)
21. Profit sharing schemes (increase of maximum share appropriation)

That in Chapter IIT of Part IIT of the Finance Act 1978 (approved profit sharing
schemes)—

(a) with respect to shares appropriated on or after 6th April 1983, subsections (1)
and (2) of section 58 (shares in excess of initial market value of £1,250) shall
have effect as if for “ £1,250 ” there were substituted “ the relevant amount ”;

(b) with effect from 6th April 1983, paragraph 1(4) of Schedule 9 (maximum initial
market value of shares appropriated to one participant yearly) shall have effect as
if for ““ £1,250 * there were substituted “ the relevant amount ”’; and

(c) “the relevant amount ” referred to in paragraphs (a) and (b) above shall be, in
relation to a participant, an amount which is not less that £1,250 and not
more than £5,000 but which, subject to that, is 10 per cent. of his salary for
the year of assessment in question or the preceding year of assessment,
whichever is the greater, and, for this purpose, a participant’s salary for a year
of assessment shall mean such of the emoluments of the office or employment
by virtue of which he is entitled to participate in the scheme as are liable to be
paid in that year under deduction of tax pursuant to section 204 of the Income
and Corporation Taxes Act 1970 (pay as you earn) after deducting therefrom
amounts included by virtue of Chapter II of Part III of the Finance Act 1976
(benefits derived by directors and others from their employment).

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes

Act 1968.

BUDGET—SECRET



RACIERE PR BEAS f
LS
Tomokidmunpipe wiwfs sonmesm fo sompeail semiios gorudds pipie 11

;ﬁo‘;'_lll"l [ty Do) BOR TR TR il k¥ it
_ _ + g
1) bolpeadpy B0 [ S vl 10 o el wpgn ermdy of et Al )

Jivds (000,10 o srtes pnwumn Dalioy M asgcns g e B0 meliiew, e |03 Ting

STyttt mrvolon adt B hanmibeiieg o gradl ™ ‘l_?‘._]j “aod 1 ez rusily wis

Isttin rarerisml @ fubsddl To N dipeymey N BmA 0 s el AW (2
g8 Aosls At ﬂqﬁz ‘Ehh'i"' LT AT | :I;I O) Datirmyn Ql]'; wowly Ao gty ||,|,j__-.;;f:'r )

——— == Bap e mwm"mn-wm*m"

it 58 as svous (&1 duk () elqerumuny ol ul bt © v e 2@ Y (e

bisil bas WJE 35‘41 ‘Biwl fodr o R SRems b Sy & a1 wdinhys

i yraln a3 o Meenang OF 2 b o salun abele g DOOEE ani o

:&Eﬂlicﬂﬂfs 29 xoat gibeoryy Sy W eulleay o Soammens: Yoo zemy miln
1m0y & ol alee Siigiines i et i W o, B

oy o aafBo o) o Wraawlins L L o ges s Skt T

“ﬁa-& aldsit 204 i .\ﬁ‘ﬂ-lllli. offl i A ittes af mu“[i; s¢ an (!_[!i;'a = apnin el
giteal ot Jo WIS gulcaw f dnmterem ;.*:;;

_ » SetlaTadv solids 1es] Yokt 2: biaty
mﬂ]ﬂ Lo L CIES | U;I.Bl_ vy 15 wpay T s ;yn:ﬁ_'l" J_g_.‘|m;:;.— b
BVEE 354 sotant]l 8 Yo U1 5% W 1 oaqafs o -simiz @ bobaiwol vicuons

Ltpereniems st ooy sualie bith szieanth yd Ievhsh misiasd)

goltivasdl ey veilt gpwaps g o 23 desibarre & AL kb yduEa o Bk
s2xaT' Ju soitustioD temminmod® mlr B piopeuseg sl i 2elie wediets Svel’ Q m




BUDGET—SECRET
«75)
22. Profit sharing schemes and share option schemes (approval)

That provision may be made for varying the conditions for giving approval to and
withdrawing approval from schemes under Schedule 9 to the Finance Act 1978 (profit
sharing schemes) and Schedule 10 to the Finance Act 1980 (savings-related share option
schemes).

BUDGET—SECRET



TRAANTR: - TEOG I
¢ 27 )
FBrputnga) isusndos shdrgn wradn lidn senpdon gavieds (i £€

Eup o IRroainn QEIITT‘ Rl sl gifonee o2 shant =8 v &Dilfﬂl‘n{ e

shoz) ET81 pd commtl ] aill oy U stuhesd whny sl el favorgan gelvast v

ﬂﬁ‘.‘.’a“{? :.'{26{-5 -ﬁ&!lgﬁl-_ﬁﬂ o) W Eady sotan | 2y o (M afalionds? (hee (anouaine wineilz
i T fesinsda

THER RIS



BUDGET—SECRET
(77 )
23. Group relief

That charges to corporation tax may be imposed by amendments relating to group
relief.

BUDGET—SECRET



f =W )

Tl ey F‘_'

quora of 'guivles meesboome ¢ tocenen ol Uto 29 Imierion &8 Eesy fedT
=i




BUDGET—SECRET
(7))
24. Capital allowances for dwelling-houses let on assured tenancies

That charges to income tax, corporation tax and capital gains tax may be made
by provisions—

(a) varying the circumstances in which an election can be made under paragraph 4
of Schedule 7 to the Capital Allowances Act 1968, as applied for the purposes
of Schedule 12 to the Finance Act 1982; and

(b) amending the definition of * capital allowance ” in section 34(4) of the Capital
Gains Tax Act 1979 so as to include an allowance under the said Schedule 12.

BUDGET—SECRET



"3
M lﬂ'lw UL lf!h qh)ﬂ-’l“:- wle anik o i'l_rl'l"l"; I'!IIQI:La N;

shonm =4 oen wed sy e bes S8 ol T"IamwrrlTU—"——-ﬂ'-lBﬁ‘

'ﬁlﬂﬂmMﬂmHMwth—ﬂhﬁ"ﬂ S—p
ey wdhlituuq!i'rlmwwmﬂmhmf 5% Jo
e SR i ‘:vrr:-rrIH =ik at 21 Alnadie Yo

tl slihagts? bika mw@nmwﬂimm shrirkazi o we os QUQI sy n.l_-_;ﬂ—'l-ln?:f%! i




BUDGET—SECRET
( 81 )
25. Capital gains

That charges to capital gains tax and corporation tax may be imposed by provisions—

(a) repealing sections 6, 8 and 9 of the Capital Gains Tax Act 1979;

(b) relating to the case where a person becomes absolutely entitled to settled property
as against trustees who are neither resident nor ordinarily resident in the United
Kingdom;

(¢) relating to the meanings of “ settlement ”, “ settlor ” and “ settled property ” for
the purposes of sections 80 to 84 of the Finance Act 1981; and

(d) with respect to disposals after 31st March 1983, enabling elections to be made
that certain holdings of securities of the same class shall be treated as single
assets.

BUDGET—SECRET



A |
asieg g
—m.lhiimq of hnmigpn) pef yauw wp ) peis eminpaae uny e gielig byes a1 asgeia qal T
]yl aeT gty Teusge) ol da b s € 0 semitoee silewery )

wlmmulﬂmﬂ o sermrosd e o eved v Swmr el oo pebiome G
ol b skl faEpbe MR St sl wow ﬂkb#k'ﬂ-rus

il %, 2t T B s e e

7

L L

' gﬂhﬂmmﬂ A2 nmwhqm&lmalmm

e



BUDGET—SECRET
( 8 )
26. Capital transfer tax (burden of tax and payment by instalments)

That charges to capital transfer tax may be imposed by provisions relating to—

(@) the burden of capital transfer tax on the value transferred by a chargeable
transfer made on death; and

(b) the payment of tax by instalments.

BUDGET—SECRET



.

( 28 )
frrnatlaa v nilseeg Loa sl 5o debond san solianen !dﬁq,? AL

= i) it Bpwilatovin U Ladegitt] = sl a5 cslansl tEtEyies o ogiidi-igh?

sldpsguity & o Beeledun A ml s cft ched Debigee B afland A
Goee cflaemly ooy sham erned

ittt A Agh b ngege(sg il (%)

e TADEIE



BUDGET—SECRET
( 8 )

27. Qil taxation (receipts derived from, and expenditure in connnection
with, certain assets)

That provision may be made for bringing into charge to petroleum revenue tax
(including advance petroleum tax) certain receipts from assets used in connection with
oil fields and for altering the reliefs available for expenditure incurred in connection with
such assets.

BUDGET—SECRET



=

. 2 -
w
anivusinny of ﬂlmhnm‘ﬁm mw ibses wlucw (I 10
L o R T
Wﬂlﬂ‘ ﬁ'ﬂ"' otrl atgated Tl e od g woilieom e
mpoanars Gl v =t piRey AN sty wi0dy
‘ihl tistrosmmra i Lo, mlmmll-nlﬂ‘nﬂmu l{:ltﬂll il wﬂu nd l:lllm'm!‘ﬁ
I e
|
|
ImEELTAnau g

LI



BUDGET—SECRET
( 87 )
28, Oil taxation (abortive exploration expenditure)

That provision may be made for the replacement, with respect to expenditure incurred
after 15th March 1983, of the allowance under section § of the Oil Taxation Act 1975
in respect of abortive exploration expenditure and for the recovery of excess allowances
given in respect of such expenditure.

BUDGET—SECRET



TR B TR
{ 18 )

r 80 88

weisyeds}

P P ey g
g e P R S T (e



BUDGET—SECRET
¢ 8 )
29. Relief from tax (incidental and consequential charges)

That it is expedient to authorise any incidental or consequential charges to any duty
or tax (including charges having retrospective effect) which may arise from provisions
designed in general to afford relief from tax.

BUDGET—SECRET



PRS- TESTUE

(nagrsdy isdmempsanns Spa lstn

shiont) st mosh fsiis® R
wob vne of texvao was.!gseaﬁoa 4o $emobiont 703 ...mrﬁs:.‘ ‘07 smalbynze ¢
ercislvorn mot oehe qast ddidw Aosdle adliveow

grivad esyraido aail
!.-u ,4--.‘.23 h. ey "3":\..3

¢ inignia ot han

THASHE~ T ED00H



BUDGET—SECRET
( 91 )
PROCEDURE RESOLUTIONS

PrROCEDURE (INTEREST RATES FOR NATIONAL Loans Funp): That, notwithstanding
anything to the contrary in the practice of the House relating to matters which may be
included in a Finance Bill, any Finance Bill of the present Session may contain provisions
relating to the rates of interest applicable to loans made out of the National Loans Fund.

PrOCEDURE (NEwW TowN DEVELOPMENT LoaNS): That, notwithstanding anything to
the contrary in the practice of the House relating to matters which may be included in
Finance Bills, any Finance Bill of the present Session may contain provision relating to
the suspension of payments into the National Loans Fund, being payments by way of
repayment of or interest on sums advanced to development corporations for new towns
and the Development Board for Rural Wales.

PrOCEDURE (FUTURE TAXATION): That, notwithstanding anything to the contrary in the

ractice of the House relating to matters which may be included in Finance Bills, any

inance Bill of the present Session may contain the following provisions taking effect
in a future year—

(a) provisions imposing charges to corporation tax on companies resident in the
United Kingdom which have interests in certain companies which are not so
resident;

(b) provisions relating to expenditure on the production and acquisition of films,
tapes and discs;

(c) provisions relating to expenditure on teletext receivers and adaptors;

(d) provisions relating to deferment of liability for development land tax by virtue
of section 19A of the Development Land Tax Atc 1976;

(e pX)visions relating to the surcharge imposed by the National Insurance Surcharge
ct 1976.

BUDGET—SECRET



TEANE—TEOGUE

DEOGIT GO HMEFETEMINE

gm- grsinwien ol 1 £y
i wuas o "H oy U} BEitesy uagnid miT
e PR 13 - o : Fi wplp ey
f P oot retgmonnyaly ponat
1) i Of apesaits, et i age "-\ -},-M-'fw-‘
o 2 WY semanrs v ..-.-4".’“"“&1!'3
E e ' P Ui ..xgm 1 concaady o)
e Lyan ,_.‘.fa Cn FeluzdEt s T ﬁ&aﬂ‘-{&]ﬂ?

3ol bsaol fwewpoolaestl o) bng

mebad il Ot anT At} amrasiond
S mperems oF goitsier eslol¥ aug iﬁ BY0ET
Arva ubm moisre? tusasvy mir Yo D acaaail
Y R T )
atus ol sagmeds gnisogn %}?f‘.&&! ory o}
Tulas sead b nsaia Del ss_U
bmadt

ZEls a;zosa:we-*:g &)

228 QT3 BEYA?

= It srsviesun Snialn] B Sniieee oligeiielss ca.mwv“-q‘. e

5 II “ "‘;fr i.""”
ulempsd ool ErG S48
v witeaiiol ot nes

Ciwetapliony Wi B YSIHIDANGIS OF gaE

Sl WO 52 el SREEQ At oz Y
[ b ] . . -
. e ¥ ol IS FA S S . dawt ¥
T A L e S, Y ey ok N e ey A -
SpnselT SAREINTIL QDINIA AT <00 QRE Rl DRTRANILS EAT 03 Bk
Py e A

el e’ | gy 1l 338
=y et e



BUDGET-—SECRET
( 93 )
FINANCE [MONEY]: Queen’s Recommendation signified

That, for the purposes of any Act of the present Session relating to finance, it is expedient
to authorise—

(a) any increase in the sums to be issued out of the National Loans Fund with
recourse to the Consolidated Fund which is attributable to any provision of
that Act enabling the Treasury to pay supplements in respect of sums borrowed
on terms set out in the prospectus for Save As You Earn Savings Contracts
(Third Issue) or in the prospectus for Index-Linked National Savings Certificates
Retirement Issue;

(b) provision for suspending payments by way of repayment of or interest on sums—

(i) falling within section 60(a) of the New Towns Act 1981 or borrowed by
the Development Board for Rural Wales under section 9(2)(a) of the
Development of Rural Wales Act 1976 for the purposes of the Board’s
function in respect of the development of new towns;

(ii) specified by the Treasury; and

(iii) not exceeding in aggregate £1,250 million; and for suspending the accrual
of interest in respect of such sums.

BUDGET—SECRET



_—

BIMMES—FEL FRE

3 bl phestd way e T o . -
’é&:;;r !-E 2.’."\ f;[.) o < £ ,'-: e TR r_"aﬁ ' ""“"i""’" .':.‘- L1 ‘ll'-|

i) :Boevss ok o picuReiN! wy

LURROE I 1SRDACE O 146 (AASICISUGTL N VR Rl
DA -.3*.1:,;:: Of iy JAMIET Wi Juib [OU ipe Nntboeed of 1ps puay
& pesereloesmy ?if&!’" D MR AT HPRSL SCCHUE a(sAB) o s
ISE MNEE ecf’:r-'m gareY oF I TS LA el R Ol POLn#GQ DA

TSRS R U OF e ATIPET ] OF pL gt O R~

ol HGE-T g Smioni araidr S5y '.TI-"’;
:-": POL. PlEaG gw panr pein "H.rl -« =20t
Mg, & :'m_-J AVLE 10 i Lo o _-I o J OF Wi !.'a"‘:. (V' hid]
G Iagemg G Sspep W STRIpRSIT B &)

oEtlF, CF G RRAGOY DR €5 IR MR peas

TREIUE 8 1A

O .“ 2 U =N 7 s, rg_ _(:J.' :‘,' VeV sl L | 2 gt Ul |,;i‘,-.‘.::!r:nz

§
“rvew -

LEWHGE (IRUERYT Tt ,z Sy

SR P
{ wd

SRS —EEUNEL



BUDGET—SECRET

£861 ‘YMOPW ¥

Ma—xxx

BUDGET—SECRET



-
v
4

—u,f"'_.‘,

| TEHOHS- TR

M

R
Ay
1| 3



Pps

BUDGF "-SFCRET

COPY NO <

s

BUDGET RESOLUTIONS I

I attach the first Frdﬂ?of the Budget Resolutions.

2.

(direct,please)
Any comments should reach Parliamentary Counsel/ (Mr Graham,

273-5029) by 11.00 am on Tuesday 8 March.

3.

The second print will be available on Wednesday 9 March.

K Mg |
,/”’/f/ \

X F MURPHY
FP1
March 1983

BUDGE -SECRET






RESOLUTIONS TO BE MOVED BY
THE CHANCELLOR OF THE
EXCHEQUER

15th MARCH 1983



C2)

Mr. Chancellor of the Exchequer
ProvisIONAL CoLLECTION OoF TAxEs: That pursuant to section 5 of the Provisional

Collection of Taxes Act 1968 provisional statutory effect shall be given to the following
Motions : —

(a) Spirits (Motion No. 2)

(b) Beer (Motion No. 3)

() Wine (Motion No. 4)

(d) Made-wine (Motion No. 5)

(e) Cider (Motion No. 6)

{f) Tobacco products (Motion No. 7)

(g) Hydrocarbon oil (Motion No. 9)

(h) Vehicles excise duty (Motion No. 10)



(SN SN S T S I G R R N R N R S T N R i N N e
RN AP OWHOANAN R LN EO

w W
= O

LN R L=

(3)
ARRANGEMENT OF WAYS AND MEANS RESOLUTIONS

Amendment of the law.

Spirits.

Beer.

Wine.

Made-wine.

Cider.

Tobacco products.

Bingo duty.

Hydrocarbon oil.

Vehicles excise duty.

Value added tax (discretionary registration).

Income tax (charge and rates for 1983-84).

Income tax (personal reliefs).

Income tax (widow’s bereavement allowance).

Relief for interest (limit for 1983-84).

Corporation tax (charge and rate for financial year 1982).
Advance corporation tax (rate for financial year 1983).
Corporation tax (small companies).

Assigned life policies and annuity contracts.

Benefits in kind.

Pay as you earn (non-deducted sums).

Profit-sharing schemes (increase of maximum share appropriation).
Profit-sharing schemes and share option schemes (approval).
Relief for investment in corporate trades.

Group relief.

Capital allowances for dwelling-houses let on assured tenancies.
Capital gains.

Capital transfer tax (burden of tax and payment by instalments).

Oil taxation (receipts derived from, and expenditure in connection with, certain

assets).
Oil taxation (abortive exploration expenditure).
Relief from tax (incidental and consequential charges).

145666



b 1 ! .
E

Rl

¥
- iy n
3 -
o
Wy .




5 )
1. Amendment of the law

That it is expedient to amend the law with respect to the National Debt and the
public revenue and to make further provision in connection with finance; but this
Resolution does not extend to the making of—

(a) any amendment with respect to value added tax so as to provide—
(i) for zero-rating or exempting any supply: ’
(ii) for refunding any amount of tax, otherwise than by a provision relating

to supplies to, and importation by, a government department, within the
meaning of section 19 of the Finance Act 1972;

(iii) for varying the rate of that tax otherwise than in relation to all supplies
and importations; or

(iv) for any relief other than relief applying to goods of whatever description
or services of whatever description; or

(b) any amendment relating to the surcharge imposed by the National Insurance
Surcharge Act 1976 and applying to some only of the persons by or in respect
of whom the surcharge is payable, other than—

(i) an amendment providing for a different rate of surcharge to be paid by
the bodies specified in section 143(4) of the Finance Act 1982; and

(ii) an amendment relating to the Commission to be established under the
Act resulting from the National Heritage Bill [Lords].

2. Spirits

That, as from 16th March 1983, the rate of duty specified in section 5 of the Alcoholic
Liquor Duties Act 1979 shall be increased from £14-47 per litre of alcohol in the spirits
to £15-19 per litre of alcohol in the spirits.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.

3. Beer

That, as from 16th March, 1983, the rates of duty specified in section 36 of the
Alcoholic Liquor Duties Act 1979 shall be increased—
(@) from £20-40 for each hectolitre to £21-60 for each hectolitre; and

(b) from £0-68 for each additional degree of original gravity exceeding 1030 degrees
-to £0-72 for each such additional degree.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.



(6)
4. Wine

That, as from 16th March 1983, the rates of duty under section 54 of the Alcoholic
Liquor Duties Act 1979 shall be as follows—

Description of wine Rates of duty
per hectolitre
£
Wine of a strength—
not exceeding 15 per cent 113.00
exceeding 15 but not exceeding 18 per cent ... 145.90
exceeding 18 but not exceeding 22 per cent ... 171.70
exceeding 22 per cent ... 171.70 plus

£15.19 for every 1 per cent or
part of 1 per cent in excess of
22 per cent;

each of the above rates of duty
being, in the case of sparkling
wine, increased by £24.80 per
hectolitre.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.

5. Made-wine

That, as from 16th March 1983, the rates of duty under section 55 of the Alcoholic
Liquor Duties Act 1979 shall be as follows—

Description of made-wine ! Rates of duty
: per hectolitre
£
Made-wine of a strength—
not exceeding 10 per cent ey 79.30
exceeding 10 but not exceecing 15 per cent ... 109.80
exceeding 15 but not exceeding 18 per cent ... 135.20
exceeding 18 per cent ... 135.20 plus

£15.19 for every 1 per cent or
part of 1 per cent in excess of
18 per cent;

each of the above rates of duty
being, in the case of sparkling
made-wine, increased by

| £11.35 per hectolitre.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.



(7))
6. Cider

That, as from 16th March 1983, the rate of duty specified in section 62(1) of the
Alcoholic Liquor Duties Act 1979 shall be increased from £8-16 per hectolitre to £9-69
per hectolitre.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.

7. Tobacco products

That, as from 18th March 1983, for the Table in Schedule 1 to the Tobacco Products
Duty Act 1979 there shall be substituted the following Table—

“ TABLE

1. Cigarettes ... An amount equal to 21 per cent. of
the retail price plus £21-67 per
thousand cigarettes.

2. Cigars £40-85 per kilogram.
3. Hand-rolling tobacco £35-40 per kilogram.
4. Other smoking tobacco and

chewing tobacco ... £24-95 per kilogram.”

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.

8. Bingo duty.

That new provision may be made with respect to bingo duty,

9. Hydrocarbon oil.

_ That, as from six o’clock in the evening of 15th March 1983, the rates of duty specified
in section 6(1) of the Hydrocarbon Qil Duties Act 1979 shall be increased—

(a) in the case of light oil, from £0-1554 a litre to £0-1630 a litre; and
(b) in the case of heavy oil, from £0-1325 a litre to £0-1382 a litre.
And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution

Isinouicégéave statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
ct o



( 8)
10. Vehicles excise duty
That the Vehicles (Excise) Act 1971 and the Vehicles (Excise) Act (Northern Ireland)

1972 shall have effect with the amendments set out below.

But this Resolution shall not authorise the making of amendments which would result
in different provisions being in force in different parts of Great Britain.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.

(1) In the said Acts of 1971 and 1972, for the provisions of Part IT of Schedules 1 to 5
(annual rates of duty) there shall be substituted the provisions set out below

PROVISIONS SUBSTITUTED FOR PART II OF SCHEDULE 1 TO ACT OF 1971 AND ACT OF 1972

Description of vehicle Rate of duty
£

1. Bicycles and tricycles of which the cylinder capacity of the engine
does not exceed 150 cubic centimetres | 8.50

2. Bicycles of which the cylinder capacity of the engine exceeds 150 cubic
centimetres but does not exceed 250 cubic centimetres; tricycles (other
than those in the foregoing paragraph) and vehicles (other than mowing
machines) with more than three wheels, being tricycles and vehicles neither
constructed nor adapted for use nor used for the carriage of a driver or
passenger 17.00

3. Bicycles and tricycles not in the foregoing paragraphs... 34.00

PROVISIONS SUBSTITUTED FOR PART II OF SCHEDULE 2 TO ACT OF 1971 AND ACT OF 1972

Description of vehicle Rate of duty

! £

Hackney carriages ... 42.00

with an additional 85p for each
person above 20 (excluding
the driver) for which the
vehicle has seating capacity.




N

(9)

ProvisioNs SUBSTITUTED FOR PART II or ScHEDULE 3 To AcT OF 1971

Weight unladen of vehicle Rate of duty
1l 2. f 3. 4. 5.
Additional
for each
ton or
Description of vehicle Exceeding Not Initial part of a
exceeding ton in
excess of the
weight in
column 2
£ £
1. Agricultural machines; digging — — 14.00 —
machines; mobile cranes; works
trucks; mowing machines; fisher-
men’s tractors
2. Haulage vehicles, being show- — 7% tons 137.00 —
men’s vehicles 7% tons 8 tons 164.00 —
8 tons 10 tons 193.00 —
10 tons — 193.00 30.00
3. Haulage vehicles, not being — 2 tons 163.00 —
showmen’s vehicles 2 tons 4 tons 293.00 —
4 tons 6 tons 424.00 —
6 tons 7% tons 553.00 —
7% tons 8 tons 676.00 —
8 tons 10 tons 676.00 115.00
10 tons — 906.00 130.00

145666 B*



( 10 )

PROVISIONS SUBSTITUTED FOR PART II OF SCHEDULE' 3 TO ACT OF 1972

Weight unladen of vehicle

Rate of duty

1. 2. 3. 4, 5.
Additional
for each
ton or
Description of vehicle Exceeding Not Initial partof a
| exceeding ton in
excess of the
weight in
column 2
£ £
1. Agricultural machines; digging - — 14-00 —
machines; mobile cranes; works
trucks; mowing machines; fisher-
men’s tractors
2. Haulage vehicles, being show- — | 7% tons 137-00 =
men’s vehicles 7% tons | 8 tons 164-00 —
8 tons 10 tons 193-00 —
10 tons | —- 193-00 30-00
3. Haulage vehicles, not being — 2 tons 147-00 £
showmen’s vehicles 2 tons | 4 tons 262-00 —
4 tons | 6 tons 374-00 —
6 tons 7% tons 489-00 —
7% tons 8 tons 603-00 —
8 tons — 603-00 130-00




( 1)

PROVISIONS SUBSTITUTED FOR PART II OF SCHEDULE 4 To AcCT OF 1971 AND AcCT OF 1972

RATES oF Duty oN RiIGID GooDs VEHICLES EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED GROSS WEIGHT

TABLE A

GENERAL RATES

Plated gross weight of vehicle

Rate of duty

1. 2. 3. 4. 5.
Exceeding Not Two axle Three axle Four or more
exceeding vehicle vehicle axle vehicle
tonnes tonnes %5 £ £
12 13 410 320 320
13 14 500 320 320
14 15 610 320 320
15 16 670 320 320
16 17 780 320 320
17 18 — 380 320
18 19 — 440 320
19 20 — 500 320
20 21 — 580 320
21 22 — 660 390
22 23 — 740 470
23 24 — 920 560
24 25 — 1,150 660
25 26 — — 770
26 27 — — 880
27 28 — — 1,010
28 29 — — 1,140
29 30 — — 1,500
30 30.49 | — — 1,990
|
145666 B*2



( 12)

TaBLE A(1)

RATES oF DutyY ON RIGID G0oODS VEHICLES EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED GROSS WEIGHT
RATES FOR FARMERS’ GooDS VEHICLES

Plated gross weight of vehicle Rate of duty
1. 2. 3. 4. 5.
Exceeding Not Two axle Three axle Four or more
exceeding vehicle vehicle axle vehicle
tonnes tonnes £ £ £

12 13 135 120 120
13 14 140 120 120
14 15 145 120 120
15 16 165 125 120
16 17 180 130 120
17 18 — 135 120
18 19 — 140 120
19 20 — 145 125
20 21 — 150 130
21 22 — 155 135
22 23 — 160 140
23 24 — 180 145
24 25 — 210 150
25 26 — — 160
26 27 — — 180
27 28 — — f 200
28 29 — — | 215
29 30 — — [ 275
30 30.49 - L ; 340




( 13 )
TABLE A(2)

RATES oF Duty oX RiIGID Goops VEHICLES EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED GROSS WEIGHT
RATES FOR SHOWMEN’S GooDS VEHICLES

Plated gross weight-of vehicle Rate of duty
1. 2. 3. 4. 5.
Exceeding Not Two axle Three axle Four or more
exceeding vehicle vehicle axle vehicle
tonnes tonnes £ £ £

12 13 135 120 120
13 14 140 120 120
14 15 145 120 120
15 16 165 125 120
16 17 180 130 120
17 18 — 135 120
18 19 — 140 125
19 20 — 150 130
20 21 — 160 140
21 22 — 165 150
22 23 — 175 160
23 24 — 210 165
24 25 — 250 180
25 26 — — 200
26 27 — — 220
27 28 — — 245
28 29 — — 265
29 30 — — 340
30 30.49 — — 430




( 134 )

TABLE ‘B

SUPPLEMENTARY RATES OF DUTY ON RIGID Goops VEHICLES OVER 12 ToNNES USED FOR
DRAWING TRAILERS EXCEEDING 4 TONNES PLATED GROSS WEIGHT

GENERAL RATES

Gross weight of trailer

{ Duty supplement

Exceeding Not exceeding |
tonnes tonnes £
4 8 70
8 10 90
10 12 | 115
12 14 | 160
14 — | 300

I

TABLE B(1)

SUPPLEMENTARY RATES OF DUTY ON RIGID GooDs VEHICLES OVER 12 ToNNES USED FOR
DRAWING TRAILERS EXCEEDING 4 TONNES PLATED GROSS WEIGHT

RATES FOR FARMERS® GOODS VEHICLES

Gross weight of trailer
i Duty supplement
Exceeding Not exceeding
tonnes tonnes £
4 8 70
8 10 90
10 12 115
12 14 160
14 — , 300
|
TABLE B(2)

SUPPLEMENTARY RATES OF DUTY ON RIGID GooDs VEHICLES OVER 12 ToNNES USED FOR
DRAWING TRAILERS EXCEEDING 4 TONNES PLATED GROSS WEIGHT

RATES FOR SHOWMEN'S GOODS VEHICLES

Gross weight of trailer

Exceeding Not exceeding

|
: Duty supplement
|
|

== | 70

|
|
i £




( 15)

TaBLE C

RATES OF DUTY ON TRACTOR UNITS EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED TRAIN WEIGHT
AND HAVING ONLY 2 AXLES

GENERAL RATES

Plated train weight of tractor unit

Rate of duty

1.

3.

For a tractor
unit to be used

4.

For a tractor
unit to be used

5.

For a tractor
unit to be used

Exceeding | Not exceeding | with semi-trailers | only with semi- | only with semi-
' with any number | trailers with not | trailers with not
of axles less than two less than three
l axles axles
tonnes tonnes £ £ £

12 13 420 420 420
13 14 470 420 420
14 15 - 510 420 420
15 16 560 420 420
16 17 610 420 420
17 18 660 420 420
18 19 710 420 420
19 20 770 420 420
20 21 830 470 420
21 22 890 520 420
22 23 950 590 420
23 24 1,020 660 420
24 25 1,090 740 420
25 26 1,090 830 500
26 27 1,090 940 590
27 28 1,090 1,040 680
28 29 1,150 1,150 780
29 30 1,390 1,390 890
30 31 1,600 1,600 1,000
31 32 1,820 1,820 1,110
32 32.52 2,290 2,290 1,600
32.52 33 2,290 2,290 1,840
33 34 2,290 2,290 2,140
34 35 2,450 2,450 2,450
35 36 2,610 2,610 2,610
36 37 2,730 2,730 2,730
37 38 2,940 2,940 2,940




( 16 )
TaBLE C(1)

RATES oF DuTY ON TRACTOR UNITS EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED TRAIN WEIGHT
AND HAVING ONLY 2 AXLES

RATES FOR FARMERS® GOODS VEHICLES

Plated train weight of tractor unit

Rate of duty

3. l

For a tractor
unit to be used

4.

For a tractor |
unit to be used |

5.

For a tractor
unit to be used

Exceeding Not exceeding |with semi-trailers | only with semi- | only with semi-
with any number | trailers with not | trailers with not
of axles less than two less than three
axles axles
tonnes tonnes £ £ £

12 13 135 135 135
13 14 140 135 135
14 15 145 135 135
15 16 150 135 135
16 17 155 135 135
17 18 160 135 135
18 19 160 135 135
19 20 165 135 135
20 21 170 135 135
21 22 175 140 135
22 23 180 145 135
23 24 190 150 135
24 25 200 155 [ 140
25 26 200 160 145
26 27 200 170 150
27 28 200 180 165
28 29 200 195 175
29 30. 235 235 195
30 31 265 265 210
31 32 300 300 230
32 32.52 370 370 305
32.52 33 610 610 610
33 34 710 710 710
34 35 810 810 810
35 36 860 860 860
36 37 900 900 900
37 38 970 970 970




( 17)
TABLE C(2)

RATES oF DUuTY ON TRACTOR UNITS EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED TRAIN WEIGHT
AND HAVING ONLY 2 AXLES

RATES FOR SHOWMEN’S GOODS VEHICLES

Plated train weight of tractor unit

Rate of duty

[ 3.

For a tractor
unit to be used

4.

For a tractor
unit to be used

5.

For a tractor
unit to be used

Exceeding Not exceeding | with semi-trailers | only with semi- | only with semi-
| with any number | trailers with not | trailers with not
: | of axles less than two less than three
I ‘ axles axles
tonnes : tonnes | £ £ £

12 13 135 135 135
13 14 140 135 135
14 15 145 135 135
15 16 150 135 135
16 17 155 135 135
17 18 160 135 135
18 19 160 135 135
19 20 | 170 145 145
20 21 180 150 150
21 | 22 ‘ 195 155 155
22 | 23 | 210 160 160
23 ‘ 24 220 170 165
24 ' 25 235 180 165
25 26 235 195 175
26 27 235 215 185
27 28 I 235 230 205
28 29 | 245 245 220
29 30 | 295 295 240
30 31 335 335 260
31 32 375 375 285
32 32.52 465 465 385
32.52 33 750 750 750
33 34 880 880 880
34 35 1,000 1,000 1,000
35 36 1,070 1,070 1,070
36 37 1,120 1,120 1,120
37 38 1,200 1,200 1,200




( 18 )

. ' TABLE: D

‘RATES OF DUTY ON TRACTOR. UNITS EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED “TRAIN WEIGHT
AND HAVING 3 orR MORE AXLES

GENERAL RATES

Plated train weight of tractor umit

Rate of duty

1. ' 2. 3. | 4. 5.
For a tractor For a tractor For a tractor
unit to be used | unit to be used | unit to be used
Exceeding Not exceeding | with semi-trailers | only with semi- | only with semi-
| with any number | trailers with not | trailers with not
of axles less than two less than three
| axles axles
tonnes tonnes ' £ " £ £
12 20 420 [ 420 420
20 - 21 | 470 | 420 [ 420
21 [ 22 | 520 420 [ 420
=22 [ 23 590 | 420 420
23 i 24 660 l 420 420
24 25 740 420 420
25 | 26 830 420 420
'26 | 27 940 420 420
27 ' 28 1,040 420 420
28 29 1,150 490 420
29 30 1,390 550 420
30 31 1,600 610 420
“31 ‘ 32 1,820 680 420
“32 32.52 2,290 920 | 420
32.52 | 33 2,290 | 1,080 420
33 | 34 2,290 ‘ 1,350 520
34 [ 35 2,290 1,630 670
35 36 2,290 1,930 ' 790
136 37 ' 2,290 2,240 | 980
37 38 ' 2,590 2,590

‘ 1,180




( 19)

TasLE D(1)

RATES OF DutYy ON TRACTOR UNITS EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED TRAIN WEIGHT
AND HAVING 3 OR MORE AXLES

RATES FOR FARMERS’ GOODS VEHICLES

Plated train weight of tractor unit | Rate of duty
i .
1. ' 2. 3% 4. 5.
For a tractor For a tractor For a tractor

unit to be used | unit to be used | unit to be used

|
|
Exceeding ll Not exceeding | with semi-trailers | only with semi- | only with semi-
with any number | trailers with not | trailers with not
| of axles | less than two | less than three
| | | axles | axles
tonnes ' tonnes 3 | £ £

12 20 | 135 135 | 13

20 21 135 135 135

21 | 22 140 135 135

22 [ 23 145 | 135 135

23 | 24 150 | 135 ' 135

24 25 155 - 135 : 135

25 26 160 140 135

26 27 170 150 135

27 28 180 160 145

28 29 ' 195 170 155

29 - 30 235 190 165

30 f 31 265 205 185

31 32 300 225 205

32 i 32.52 l 370 | 300 220

32.52 | 33 370 | 355 220

33 | 34 : 445 ' 445 270

34 | 35 535 ‘ 535 350

35 36 635 635 | 410

36 | 37 740 740 510

37 | 38 855 ‘

855 615




(2 )

TasLE D(2)

RATES oF DuTYy ON TRACTOR UNITS EXCEEDING 12 TONNES PLATED TRAIN WEIGHT
AND HAVING 3 OR MORE AXLES

RATES FOR SHOWMEN’S GooDS VEHICLES

Plated train weight of tractor unit

Rate of duty

3. | 4.

For a tractor
unit to be used

For a tractor
unit to be used

5.

For a tractor
unit to be used

|
Exceeding ‘ Not exceeding | with semi-trailers| only with semi- | only with semi-
| with any number | trailers with not | trailers with not
| of axles | less than two less than three
| : axles axles
tonnes ! tonnes £ | £ £

12 | 18 135 | 135 135

18 \ 19 135 135 135

19 | 20 140 140 135

20 ' 21 145 145 135

21 | 22 155 | 150 135

22 | 23 160 155 135

23 i 24 170 160 135

24 | 25 180 | 160 145

25 ; 26 195 | 170 155

26 | 27 210 I 180 160

27 28 230 200 170

28 ! 29 245 215 190

29 30 295 235 205

30 - 31 335 ' 255 230

31 32 375 { 280 250

32 32.52 465 I_ 375 275

32.52 33 465 i 440 275

33 ' 34 550 i 550 335

34 35 665 665 435

35 36 790 790 515

36 [ 37 915 915 635

37 { 38 1,060 1,060 765




( 21)

PROVISIONS SUBSTITUTED FOR PART II OF SCHEDULE 5 TO ACT OF 1971

Description of vehicle | Rate of duty
‘ £
1. Vehicles not exceeding seven horse-power, if registered under the |
Roads Act 1920 for the first time before 1st January 1947 ol 60.00
2. Vehicles not included above ... ... .. . . .| 85.00

PROVISIONS SUBSTITUTED FOR PART II OF SCHEDULE 5 TO ACT OF 1972

Description of vehicle | Rate of duty

. £
1. Vehicles first registered under the Roads Act 1920 before 1st January |
1947, or which, if its first registration for taxation purposes had been
effected in Northern Ireland would have been so first registered as afore-
said under the Act as in force in Northern Ireland:

(i) not exceeding 6 horse-power . 51-00

(i) exceeding 6 horse-power but not exceedmg 9 horse-power—for
each unit or part of a unit of horse-power 8-50
2. Other vehicles ... 85-00

(2) In sections 2(1)(c) of the Act of 1971 and 2(1)(d) of the Act of 1972 (seven day
licences for certain vehicles), for sub-paragraphs (i) and (ii), there shall be substituted—

“ (@) in respect of which duty is chargeable by reference to an annual rate
applicable to haulage vehicles in accordance with the second and third
categories in Part IT of Schedule 3 to this Act or applicable to goods
vehicles in accordance with Schedule 4 to this Act; and

(ii) the unladen weight of which exceeds 11,176-5 kilograms;”

(3) In subsection (5) of section 16 of the Act of 1971 (rates of duty for trade licences),
including that subsection as set out in paragraph 12 of Part I of Schedule 7 to that Act,
for “ £40 > and * £8 ” there shall be susbstituted, respectively, ““ £42 > and “ £8-50 .

(4) In subsection (6) of section 16 of the Act of 1972 (rates of duty for trade licences),
including that subsection as set out in paragraph 12 of Part I of Schedule 9 to that
Act, for “ £40 ” and “ £8 > there shall be substituted, respectively, “ £42 > and “ £8-50 ™.

(5) In Part I of Schedule 4 to the Acts of 1971 and 1972 (annual rates of duty on goods
vehicles)—
(a) in paragraph 1(1), for *“ £170 > there shall be substituted “ £150 *;
(b) in paragraph 2, for ““ £360  there shall be substituted * £320 ”*;
(¢) in paragraph 5, in sub-paragraph (3)(b), for “ 32 tonnes ” and “ 32-52 tonnes ”
there shall be substituted, respectively, ““ 37 tonnes  and “ 38 tonnes ”;
(d) in paragraph 6—
(i) in sub-paragraph (1), for “ £60 ** there shall be substituted “ £63 *;
(ii) in sub-paragraph (2)(a), for ““ £100 * there shall be substituted “ £90 *’;
(iii) in sub-paragraph (2)(b), for “ £130” there shall be substituted “ £115*;
and
(iv) in sub-paragraph (4) for “ £100 ” there shall be substituted ““ £90 *;
(e) in paragraph 7, for “ £80 > there shall be substituted “ £85 ’; and
(f) after paragraph 14 there shall be inserted the paragraphs set out below.



( 22)

PARAGRAPHS INSERTED AFTER PARAGRAPH 14 OF SCHEDULE 4 TO ACT OF 1971
AND AcT OF 1972

*“ Tractor units having two axles used with semi-trailers having two axles when duty paid
by reference to use with semi-trailers having not less than three axles

14A.—(1) This paragraph applies in any case where—

(@) a vehicle licence has been taken out for a tractor unit having two axles which
is to be used only with semi-trailers with not less than three axles; and

(b) the rate of duty paid on taking out the licence is equal to or exceeds the rate
of duty applicable to a tractor unit having two axles—

(i) which has a plated train weight equal to the maximum laden weight
at which a tractor unit having two axles may lawfully be used in
Great Britain with a semi-trailer with two axles; and

(ii) which is to be used with semi-trailers with not less than two axles.

(2) If, in a case to which this paragraph applies, the tractor unit is used with a
semi-trailer with two axles and, when so used, the laden weight of the tractor unit
and the semi-trailer taken together does not exceed the maximum Iaden weight
mentioned in sub-paragraph (1)(b)(i) above, the tractor unit shall, when so used, be
taken to be licensed in accordance with the requirements of this Act.

Tractor units having three or more axles used with semi-trailers having only one axle
when duty paid by reference to use with semi-trailers having more than one axle

14B.—(1) This paragraph applies in any case where—

(a) a vehicle licence has been taken out for a tractor unit having three or more
axles which is to be used only with semi-trailers with not less than two
axles; and

(b) the rate of duty paid on taking out the licence is equal to or exceeds the
rate of duty applicable to a tractor unit having three or more axles—

(i) which has a plated train weight equal to the maximum laden weight
at which a tractor unit having three or more axles may lawfully be
used in Great Britain with a semi-trailer with a single axle; and

(ii) which is to be used with semi-trailers with any number of axles.

(2) If, in a case to which this paragraph applies, the tractor unit is used with a
semi-trailer with a single axle and, when so used, the laden weight of the tractor unit
and semi-trailer taken together does not exceed the maximum laden weight mentioned
in sub-paragraph (1)(b)(i) above, the tractor unit shall, when so used, be taken to be
licensed in accordance with the requirements of this Act.”

(6) In paragraph 5(1) of Part I of Schedule 4 to the Act of 1971 (special types of
vehicles) for the words from “ vehicle— > to “(c)” there shall be substituted *vehicle
(other than, in the case of a vehicle falling within paragraph (a) below, one of a prescribed
class) which has an unladen weight exceeding 1,525 kilograms; and

(@) which has, for the purposes of this Schedule, a plated gross weight or plated
train weight by virtue only of paragraph 9(2A)(c) below; or

®”.



23 )

(7) for paragraph 5(1) of Patrt I of Schedule 4 to the Act.of 1972 (special types of
vehicles) there shall be substituted the following paragraph—
“ (1) This paragraph applies to a goods vehicle—
* (@) which has an unladen weight exceeding 1,525 kilograms; and

(b) which is for the time being authorised for use on roads by virtue of an
. order under Article 29(3) of the Road Traffic (Northem Ireland) Order: 1981
(authorr>at10n of special vehlcles) a

(8) In paragraph 9 of Part I of Schedule 4 to the Act of 1971 (plated and unladen
weights)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (1)(a), for the words from *plated weight” to *“ Act 1972~
there shall be substltuted the word “ weight™ and at the end there shall be
inserted the words “ as indicated on the appropriate plate *;

(b) in sub-paragraph (1)), for the words “ a plated gross weight > there shall be
substititted the words “ such a plate ”’; and

(c) in sub-paragraph (2), for the words from “ plated weight” to “Part II” there
shall be substltuted the word “ weight ” and at the end there shall be inserted
the words “ as indicated on the appropriate plate ™.

(9) In the said paragraph 9 there shall be inserted, after sub- paragraph (2), the
foll_owmg sub-paragraph—
" '“(2A) In_this paragraph ¢ approprlate plate ; 1n relatlon to a. vehrcle or traﬂer ‘]
‘means—

" (@) where a Ministry plate (within the meaning of regulations’ made under
section 40 or 45 of the Road Traffic Act 1972) has been issued, or has effect’
as if issued, for the vehicle or trailer following the issue or amendment
of a plating certificate (within the. meaning of Part II of  that Act) that
plate;

(b) where paragraph (a) does not apply, but such a certlﬁcate is in force for the
vehicle or trailer, that certificate; and

(¢) where neither paragraph (g) nor paragraph (b) above applies but the vehicle
or trailer is equipped with a plate in accordance with regulations made under
section 40 of the Act of 1972, that plate.”

(10) The provisions set out in this resolution as being substituted for provisions of
Schedule 4 to the Act of 1972 shall have effect in that Act with the substitution for any
reference to a plated gross weight of a reference to a relevant maximum weight and for
any reference to a plated train weight of a reference to a relevant maximum train weight.

(11) Paragraphs (1) to (10) above apply in relation to licences taken out after
15th March 1983.
11. Value added tax (discretionary registration)

That provision may be made as to discretionary registration under Part I of the
Finance Act 1972.



( 24 )
12. Income tax (charge and rates for 1983-84)

That—
(1) Income tax for the year 1983-84 shall be charged at the basic rate of 30 per
cent; and—

(a) in respect of so much of an individual’s total income as exceeds £14,600 at such
higher rates as are specified in the Table below; and

(b) in respect of so much of the investment income included in an individual’s total
income as exceeds £7,100 at the additional rate of 15 per cent.

TABLE

Part of excess

over £14,600 Higher rate
The first £2,600 40 per cent.
The next £4,600 45 per cent.
The next £7,100 50 per cent.
The next £7,100 55 per cent.
The remainder 60 per cent.

(2) Section 24(4) of the Finance Act 1980 (increase of basic rate limit, higher rate
bands and investment income threshold) shall not apply for the year 1983-84.

(3) This Resolution shall not require any change to be made in the amounts deductible
or repayable under section 204 of the Income and Corporation Taxes Act 1970 (pay as
you earn) before 11th May 1983.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.



( 25 )
13. Income tax (personal reliefs)

That—

(1) Section 24(5) of the Finance Act 1980 (increase of personal reliefs) shall not apply
for the year 1983-84.

(2) In section 8 of the Income and Corporation Taxes Act 1970 (personal reliefs)—
(a) in subsection (1Xa) (married) for “ £2,445 > there shall be substituted « £2,795 ;
(b) in subsection (1)(b) (single) and (2) (wife’s earned income relief) for “£1,565
there shall be substituted “ £1,785 *;

(¢) in subsection (1A) (age allowance) for “ £3,295” and “ £2,070> there shall be
substituted “ £3,755” and ““ £2,360 > respectively;

(d) in subsection (1B) (income limit for age allowance) for “ £6,700 > there shall be
substituted “ £7,600 .

(3) This Resolution shall not require any change to be made in the amounts deductible
or repayable under section 204 of the Income and Corporation Taxes Act 1970 (pay as
you earn) before 11th May 1983.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968. :

14. Income tax (widow’s bereavement allowance)

That—

(1) In section 15A of the Income and Corporation Taxes Act 1970 (widow’s
bereavement allowance) for the words “for that year ” there shall be substituted the
following paragraphs—

“(a) for that year of assessment, and

(b) unless she marries again before the beginning of it, for the next following year
of assessment ”.

(2) In section 36(8)(b)(i) of the Finance Act 1976 (deductions which are nat
transferable between husband and wife) for the words “ and 14 > there shall be substituted
the words “ 14 and 15A .

(3) Paragraph (1) above has effect in any case where the widow’s bereavement occurred
or occurs in the year 1982-83 or in any subsequent year of assessment and paragraph (2)
above has effect for the year 1983-84 and subsequent years of assessment.

(4) This Resolution shall not require any change to be made in the amounts
deductible or repayable under section 204 of the Income and Corporation Taxes Act 1970
(pay as you earn) before 11th May 1983.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution

should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.



( 26 )
15. Relief for interest (limit for 1983-84)

That, for the year 1983-84—

(1) The limit imposed by paragraph 5 of Schedule 1 to the Finance Act 1974 shall,
subject to any reduction to be made under that paragraph, be £30,000 and, accordingly,
for any reference in sub-paragraph (1) of that paragraph to £25,000 there shall be
substituted a reference to £30,000.

(2) For any reference in paragraph 24(3) of that Schedule to £25,000 there shall be
substituted a reference to £30,000.

(3) This Resolution shall not require any change to be made in the amounts deductible
or repayable under section 204 of the Income and Corporation Taxes Act 1970 (pay
as you earn) before 11th May 1983.

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.

16. Corporation tax (charge and rate for financial year 1982)

That corporation tax shall be charged for the financial year 1982 at the rate of
52 per cent.

17. Advance corporation tax (rate for financial year 1983)

That the rate of advance corporation tax for the financial year 1983 shall be three-
sevenths,

18. Corporation tax (small companies)

That—
(a) the small companies rate for the financial year 1982 shall be 38 per cent.; and

(b) the fraction by reference to which corporation tax charged on income is reduced
under section 95(2) of the Finance Act 1972 shall for that financial year be
seven two-hundredths.

19. Assigned life policies and annuity contracts

That charges to income tax may be imposed by provisions about life policies and
annuity contracts, the rights conferred by which are or have at any time been assigned for
money or money’s worth.



( 27 )
20. Benefits in kind

That charges to income tax may be imposed by provisions relating to—

(a) the application of Chapter II of Part III of the Finance Act 1976 to scholarship
income; and

(b) loans obtained by reason of a person’s employment.

21. Pay as you earn (non-deducted sums)

That charges to income tax may be imposed by provisions relating to tax required to
be deducted under section 204 of the Income and Corporation Taxes Act 1970.

22. Profit sharing schemes (increase of maximum share appropriation)

That in Chapter IIT of Part III of the Finance Act 1978 (approved profit sharing
schemes)—

(a) with respect to shares appropriated on or after 6th April 1983, subsections (1)
and (2) of section 58 (shares in excess of initial market value of £1,250) shall
have effect as if for ““ £1,250 ” there were substituted * the relevant amount ”;

(b) with effect from 6th April 1983, paragraph 1(4) of Schedule 9 (maximum initial
market value of shares appropriated to one participant yearly) shall have effect as
if for “ £1,250 ” there were substituted “ the relevant amount ; and

(c) “ the relevant amount > referred to in paragraphs (@) and (b) above shall be, in
relation to a participant, an amount which is not less than £1,250 and not
more than £5,000 but which, subject to that, is 10 per cent. of his salary for
the year of assessment in question or the preceding year of assessment,
whichever is the greater; and, for this purpose, a participant’s salary for a year
of assessment shall mean such of the emoluments of the office or employment
by virtue of which he is entitled to participate in the scheme as are liable to be
paid in that year under deduction of tax pursuant to section 204 of the Income
and Corporation Taxes Act 1970 (pay as you earn) after deducting therefrom
amounts included by virtue of Chapter II of Part III of the Finance Act 1976
(benefits derived by directors and others from their employment).

And it is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution
should have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes
Act 1968.



( 28 )
23. Profit sharing schemes and share option schemes (approval)

That provision may be made for varying the conditions for giving approval to, and
withdrawing approval from, schemes under Schedule 9 to the Finance Act 1978 (profit
sharing schemes) and Schedule 10 to the Finance Act 1980 (savings-related share option
schemes).

24. Relief for investment in corporate trades

That provision may be made with respect to relief from income tax under Chapter IT
of Part IV of the Finance Act 1981.

25. Group relief

That charges to corporation tax may be imposed by amendments relating to group
relief.

26. Capital allowances for dwelling-houses let on assured tenancies

That charges to income tax, corporation tax and capital gains tax may be made
by provisions relating to allowances under Schedule 12 to the Finance Act 1982.



[

(29)
27. Capital gains

That charges to capital gains tax and corporation tax may be imposed by provisions—

(a) repealing sections 6, 8 and 9 of the Capital Gains Tax Act 1979;

(b) relating to the case where a person becomes absolutely entitled to settled property
as against trustees who are neither resident nor ordinarily resident in the United
Kingdom;

(c) relating to the meanings of “settlement ”, “ settlor ” and “ settled property > for
the purposes of sections 80 to 84 of the Finance Act 1981; and

(d) with respect to disposals after 31st March 1982, enabling elections to be made
that certain holdings of securities of the same class shall be treated as single
assets.

28. Capital transfer tax (burden of tax and payment by instalments)

That charges to capital transfer tax may be imposed by provisions relating to—

() the burden of capital transfer tax on the value transferred by a chargeable
transfer made on death; and

(b) the payment of tax by instalments.

29. Oil taxation (receipts derived from, and expenditure in connection
with, certain assets)

That provision may be made for bringing into charge to petroleum revenue tax
certain sums received or receivable after 30th June 1982 in respect of assets used in
connection with oil fields and for altering the reliefs available for certain expenditure
incurred in connection with such assets.



( 30 )
30. Oil taxation-(abortive exploration expenditure)

That provision may be made for the replacement, with respect to expenditure incurred
after 15th March 1983, of the allowance under section 5 of the Oil Taxation Act 1975
in respect of abortive exploration expenditure and for the recovery of excess allowances
given in respect of such expenditure. - - ¥ : ¥

31. Relief from tax (incidental and consequential charges)

That it is expedient to authorise any incidental or consequential charges to any duty
or tax (including charges having retrospective effect) which may arise from provisions
designed in general to afford relief from tax.



( 31)
PROCEDURE RESOLUTIONS

PROCEDURE (INTEREST RATES FOR NATIONAL LoANs Funp): That, notwithstanding
anything to the contrary in the practice of the House relating to matters which may be
included in a Finance Bill, any Finance Bill of the present Session may contain provisions
relating to the rates of interest applicable to loans made out of the National Loans Fund.

ProCEDURE (NEw TowN DEVELOPMENT LoaNs): That, notwithstanding anything to
the contrary in the practice of the House relating to matters which may be included in
Finance Bills, any Finance Bill of the present Session may contain provision relating to
the suspension of payments into the National Loans Fund, being payments by way of
repayment of or interest on sums advanced to development corporations for new towns
and the Development Board for Rural Wales.

PrOCEDURE (FUTURE TAXATION): That, notwithstanding anything to the contrary in the
practice of the House relating to matters which may be included in Finance Bills, any
Finance Bill of the present Session may contain the following provisions taking effect
in a future year—

(a) provisions relating to dwellings occupied by directors and employees by reason
of their employment;

(b) provisions imposing charges to corporation tax on companies resident in the
United Kingdom which have interests in certain companies which are not so
resident;

(¢) provisions relating to advance corperation tax;

(d) provisions relating to expenditure on the production and acquisition of films,
tapes and discs;

{e) provisions relating to expenditure on teletext receivers and adaptors;

(f) provisions relating to deferment of liability for development land tax by virtue
of section 19A of the Development Land Tax Act 1976;

(g) provisions relating to the surcharge imposed by the National Insurance Surcharge
Act 1976.

FINANCE [MONEY]: Queer’s Recommendation signified

That, for the purposes of any Act of the present Session relating to finance, it is expedient
to authorise—

(a) any increase in the sums to be issued out of the National Loans Fund with
recourse to the Consolidated Fund which is attributable to any provision of
that Act enabling the Treasury to pay supplements in respect of sums borrowed
on terms set out in the prospectus for Save As You Earn Savings Contracts
(Third Issue) or in the prospectus for Index-Linked National Savings Certificates
Retirement Issue;

(b) provision for suspending payments by way of repayment of or interest on sums—

(i) falling within section 60(a) of the New Towns Act 1981 or borrowed by
the Development Board for Rural Wales under section 9(2)(a) of the
Development of Rural Wales Act 1976 for the purposes of the Board’s
function in respect of the development of new towns;

(ii) specified by the Treasury; and
(iii) not exceeding in aggregate £1,250 million;
and for suspending the accrual of interest in respect of such sums.



= - s, . Ld -4 . -
- . - . - 1 - N -
[
R
1l
1
! i A
! &
- -
Y] -
& -
|
. . { 7|
1 I'I =
v
|, K ]
oy - = I -
.
o - N O
N " Al Ly
e
[ - - -
i
L
h e
. i 1
b ~ L -

=1 R . J

N —

b -

! 1 - u
Ll -]




